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After adequate notice (Tr. 193; Udlity Ex. 1; Ex. RD 6), this cause came on for
hearing on August 22 and 23, 2012, in the rate increase application of Utilities Inc. of
Sandalhaven, before the appointed Hearing Officer, Diane K. Kiesling.

FINDINGS OF FACT:!

QUALITY OF SERVICE

~TISSUE1: IS THE QUALITY OF SERVICE PROVIDED BY THE UTILITY CONSIDERED
SATISFACTORY?

Finding of Fact 1: The quality of service being provided by the Utility is satisfactory.

Argument: The parties agree to use the process established by the Florida Public
Service Commission (“PSC”) Rule 25-30.433 (1), F.A.C,, in establishing whether the Quality
of Service is satisfactory. (“This shall be derived from an evaluation of three separate
components of water and wastewater operation: quality of utility’s product (water and
wastewater); operational condition of the utility’s plant and facilities; and the utility’s

attempt to address customer satisfaction.”) In addition, the parties agree that the Utility’s

! Since the page numbering of the Transcript does not include the prefiled testimony, reference to prefiled
direct testimony will include the witnesses’ initials, Dir. followed by the page number in the prefiled testimony
Example: (FS Dir. 3). Similarly, references to prefiled rebuttal testimony will include the witnesses’ initials
followed by Reb. followed by the page number. Example: (FS Reb. 3), and surrebuttal with Sur, for example,
(JE Sur. 2).



Wastewater Treatment Plant is operating in compliance with applicable regulatory

requirements. (Ex. Joint 1)

The quality of the product: With the agreement among the parties that the Utility’s
wastewater treatment plant is operating in compliance with applicable regulatory
standards, the quality of service based upon this prong of the test is unquestionably

satisfactory.

Operational condition of the Utlity’s plant and facilities: The County’s witness on

this issue testified that the wastewater treatment plant was maintained “extremely well”
(Tr. 225), it was operating very adequately (Tr. 227), and was very efficient and effective
(Tr. 228). He concluded that the overall plant operation was very good. (DJ Dir. 2; Tr.234)
Of the eleven customers who testified at the final hearing, one commented on the alarm
going off at a lift station. (Tr. 30) The Utility’s complaint log lists two other complaints
about alarms going off at the lift station and both of those were for the same incident (Ex.
RD 7f), which could possibly have been associated with the same incident that the witness
testified to. An email to Office of Public Counsel (“OPC”) also mentions this issue. (Ex. OPC
1) Mr. Flynn testified that all lift stations, not only the one in question, are equipped with
an audible alarm and the phone number is clearly posted at the lift station for the purpose
of having someone call if the alarm sounds. (Tr. 144-145) Thus, the fact that an alarm
sounds does not indicate a quality of service issue; in fact, such alarms are required by
FDEP. (Tr. 149) While the customer said the alarm sounded for 24 hours, one would

question why she did not call the phone number on the lift station panel to report the alarm



condition. Mr. Flynn testified that it would be surprising to him that it would have taken
24 hours for the Utility to respond after the alarm had been reported, especially considering
the relatively close proximity of operations staff to all lift stations. (Tr. 142, 144) The
Utility routinely checks lift stations three times a week or more which includes identifying
and documenting the amount of time the pumps have run, identifying whether the pumps
are functional, testing the pumps to make sure they operate, and verifying the wet well is at
its normal level. (Tr. 147) There is no evidence that the Utility is not operating its lift
stations in compliance with all regulatory requirements, and the County’s witness assumed
as much. (Tr. 234)

One witness testified about a sewer line break or leak in Fiddlers Green
Condominiums with his complaint directed primarily toward the expense the Utility
incurred to haul off effluent from the’wastewater treatment plant rather than the repair
itself. (Tr. 12) The only odor complaint in the testimony came at the suggestion of OPC
that claimed that it just “came up from the sewers” (Tr. 115). This witness testified he had
no billing or customer service issues (Tr. 15) The Utility’s complaint log listed three odor
complaints in the test year and the two that were attributable to the Utility were resolved.
(Ex. RD 7f) Despite repeated solicitations from OPC, other witnesses testified they had no
odor issues. (Tr. 20, 22 and 33) The Utility responded satisfactorily and promptly to the
few sporadic odor complaints raised by customers. The County has received very few odor
complaints over the years (Tr. 206), and FDEP had received no odor related complaints (Tr.

© 208-209) Based upon the few customer complaints regarding the operational condition of



the Utility’s facilities and the Utility’s response to such complaints, the operational condition
of the Utility’s plant and facilities should be considered satisfactory.

Utility’s attempt to address customer satisfaction: This element of quality of service

is the most subjective component when evaluating quality of service. However, a close
analysis of the nature of the customer comments submitted through live testimony, in
emails to OPC, through the County's website and directly to the Utility show that while not
perfect, the Utlity is diligent in addressing customer concerns.

There were 64 comments from customers submitted through the County’s website.
(Ex. RD 7e), and all but one were limited to the amount of the proposed increase in sewer
rates. The only other comment was from the property manager of one of the Condominium
Associations who raised a billing issue, and something about a sinkhole. Since there is no
live tesﬁm9ny on eitherr of those issues, these comments cannot serve as the basis for a
finding of fact.

There were fifteen customers who presented comments (unsworn) at an informal
customer meeting held on May 21, 2012. (Ex. RD 7d) All but three of those customers
merely complained about the magnitude of the rate increase. Other than odor complaints,
the issues, such as damage to roads, a sinkhole and an occasional bill not showing meter
read detail, were not supported by live testimony and cannot serve as the basis of a finding
of fact. The sinkhole was an issue raised in the County’s Prefiled Testimony by Mr. Davis,
but reflected Mr. Davis reporting what someone told him and thus should be considered

hearsay. However, since the Utility did not know whether this issue would be raised at the



hearing with live testimony, it is addressed in Mr. Flynn’s Pre-Filed Rebuttal Testimony
wherein he states that the cause of the sinkhole was unrelated to any of the Utility’s
facilities and was, in fact, the responsibility of the customer to address. (PF Reb. 4-5)

It appears that the issue which got the most attention was the customer who testified
that she had a problem getting through the customer service automated phone system (Tr.
26). She said that she had the problem twice in two months, and admitted some times
were not bad, while others, particularly Friday afternoons, are bad. (Tr. 26) She also
candidly admitted that most companies have problems with wait times. (Tr. 27)
Interestingly, only one other customer, after prompting from OPC, testified that she had call
center problems. (Tr. 49-51) Other customers testified they had no billing or customer
service problems. (Tr. 15, 20, 22 and 33) The Utility has undertaken numerous efforts to
improve customer service interaction including: implementation of an enhanced telephone
system that allowed for the integration of the three customer care centers; enhanced and
ongoing training of customer service representatives; a workforce that is responsive to
varying call volumes throughout the work day; and establishing a performance metric of
answering 90% of all incoming calls within 80 seconds. (PF Reb. 5)

The County has concluded that it does not have any substantial problem with the
level of customer service provided by the Utility. (Tr. 197) The County had not received
many complaints over the years, prior to the filing of the instant rate case. (RD Dir. 3; Tr.
197-198, 213) Although the County has not received a large volume of customer

complaints, the County believes there is room for improvement in two areas. (RD Dir. 4)



The first was a quicker response time at the call center and better follow-up on back billing.
(Tr. 210) However, when questioned, the witness admitted that the back billing issue was
related specifically to the Habitat for Humanity customers and there is nothing that needs
to be done prospectively. (Tr. 217) The issue that the County witmess described as
recurring was getting through the automated phone system. (Tr.. 208) However, his
concerns were unsupported by any analysis of wait times at other utilities. (Tr. 208) And as
one of the customers testified, most companies have problems with their call centers. (Tr.
27) The County backed off of its original suggestion that the Utility hire a person to answer
the phones. (Tr. 214) He never did explain how a caller would get faster service from a
person answering the phone than an automated system and it defies logic that one would.
(Tr. 214-215)

While the Utility strives for its customer service center to operate perfectly, it is an
unattainable goal even with, or maybe because of, today’s technology. The Utility takes
customer service seriously as explained by Mr. Flynn. (PF Reb. 5) When the testimony of
the persons appearing at the final hearing is closely analyzed, there were very few
comments with substance as it relates to customer service. More customers expressed
dissatisfaction about the scheduling of the final hearing at a time when many customers
were up north than complained about the quality of service. Over one-third of the
customers who testified stated that they had no billing, odor or customer service issues. (Tr.
15, 20, 22 and 33) Many complained about the status of the economy, and one wanted to

politicize the process. (Tr. 35) It is clear after a review of all of the customer comments in



the record that the real customer dissatisfaction was due to the proposed rates but not with
the quality of service.

RATE BASE

ISSUE 2: ARE ANY ADJUSTMENTS NECESSARY TO PLANT FOR UNDOCUMENTED
ADDITIONS AND, IF SO, IN WHAT AMOUNT?

Finding of Fact 2: Yes. Based on the initial auditing of the Utility’s Books and

Records and additional information received from the Utility, the County’s Rate Consultant
has identified, and the parties agree, that Plant In Service Account 354.3 - Structures and
Improvements shall be reduced by ($11,155) related to undocumented plant additions.
The parties agree that a corresponding reduction to Accumulated Depreciation Account
354.3 - Structures and Improvements in the amount of ($1,171) shall also be made for the
Test Year related to undocumented plant additions. (Ex. Joint 1)
ISSUE3:  WHAT ARE THE USED AND USEFUL PERCENTAGES OF THE UTILITY'S
WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT, WASTEWATER COLLECTION SYSTEM,
IMPACT FEES PAID TO EWD AND FACILITIES TO INTERCONNECT TO
EWD?

Finding of Fact 3: The appropriate used and useful percentage of the Utility's

wastewater treatment plant is 59.89%, based on permitted capacity during the test year of
150,000 gpd. The appropriate used and useful percentage of the Utility's impact fees paid
to the Englewood Water District (“EWD”) is 41.62%. The appropriate used and useful
percentages of the wastewater collection system and the force main, lift station and

pumping facilities used to interconnect to EWD are 100%.



Argument: Several matters deserve reiteration at the outset. The County has not
adopted any specific methodology for determining the used and useful percentages of
wastewater facilities and is thus not bound by any prior determinations by the PSC, or by
any PSC Rules. (FS Reb. 4) The County has greater prerogative in how it reaches its
conclusions regarding used and useful. (FS Reb. 4) The County’s witness admits that when
he made his used and useful determinations he was aware that the PSC Rule was not
binding on the County and that the PSC Rule only applied to the wastewater treatment
plant. (Tr. 330-331) Notwithstanding that clean slate, the County’s witness testified that he
applied the PSC Rule in making his used and useful determinations of the wastewater
treatment plant, the capacity purchased from EWD and the facilities to interconnect with
the EWD. In fact, although the County’s witness admitted that the PSC Rule applies only to
wastewater treatment plants, he applies that rule to the interconnection facilities as well.
(Tr. 331) In contrast, the County’s witness ‘adrﬁitte-d that herdoes not apply the used and
useful concept when he advises his governmental client regarding ratemaking. (Tr. 329) It
is a concept reserved for the regulation of investor-owned utilities and its application is
subject to disagreement between equally qualified experts. (Tr. 332) Equally important is
the County’s witness agreeing that at the time the decision was made to purchase capacity
from EWD and construct the interconnect facilities the decision was a prudent one. (AW
Dir. 5)

Although it is clear from the testimony and evidence of the prudency of the Utility’s

investment in all of the facilities necessary to transport wastewater to the Englewood Water



District as discussed below,ﬁv 7the Utlity is sensitive to the substantial rate impact of
determining all such facilities as being 100% used and useful, and thus agrees for the
purpose of this proceeding to accept a used and useful percentage for the capacity
purchased from EWD of 41.62% as discussed more fully below. The Utility, for the purpose
ofthis proceeding, accepts the County’s determination of used and useful of the permitted
capacity of the wastewater treatment plant as 59.89% in the test year, along with the
County’s proposal that no non-used and useful adjustment be made because the Utility’s
CIAC level would cause the utility to incur a negative investment balance (JMW Dir. 6). In
doing so, the Utility is consistent in its positions on used and useful of the wastewater
treatment plant and the pro-forma adjustment in Issue 8A. In contrast, the County has
taken inconsistent positions solely to reduce the Utility’s revenue requirement. If the
Hearing Officer makes the pro-forma adjustment to expenses proposed by the County in
Issue 8A, then the pro-forma permitted capacity must be used, increasing the wastewater
treatment plant used and useful to 90.74% (FS Reb. 9) The Utility’s expert pointed out that
the PSC had previously addressed this permitted capacity versus design capacity issue in
virtually the same manner as that of the Utility. Order No. PSC-07-0609-PAA-WS (FS Reb.
- 7-8)

The County’s witness tried to put a square peg into a round hole by applying PSC
Rule 25-30.432 to the lift station, pumping equipment, force main and EWD capacity
investments made by the Utility. (AW Dir. 3; Tr. 316). While doing so may make the

determination of used and useful easier for such facilities, it defies sound ratemaking



principles. (Fé Reb. 3) The Rule was developed specifically to apply to wastewater
treatment plants and has no application to any other facilities. (FS Reb. 4) The Utility’s
expert witness who on this issue was involved in the PSC’s used and useful ratefnaking
process beginning in 1973, testified as to the concept and the standard definitions,
considerations and approaches developed to determine used and uéeful for wastewater
treatment plants. (FS Reb. 4-5) Because of the complexity of establishing criteria for
determining the used and usefulness of other components of a wastewater system the PSC
abandoned any attempt to do so and focused only on a Rule regarding a wastewater
treatment plant (FS Reb. 5) However, the PSC, in evaluating used and useful for collection
systems has recognized that trunk force mains and gravity mains, prudently designed,
should be consider 100% used and useful. The 12” force main constructed to serve the
customers of Sandalhaven meets thls grivten'on. (FS Reb. 18) The County’s witness ignored
the complexities and adopted the simple approach of using the wastewater treatment plant
Rule for all of the other wastewater system components. (AW Dir. 3)

The determination of used and useful is not simply a mathematical calculation that
ignores all subjective analysis of prudence, economics, economies of scale and factors
effecting the utility’s decisions. (FS Reb. 3) If such determination were a simple
mathematical analysis as the County’s witness believes, we would use accountants, not
engineers, to address the issue. The County’s financial witness implicitly admitted he was
not qualified to determine used and userul regarding the Utility’s facilities and instead

relied upon Andrew Woodcock for such determinations. (JW Dir. 6) As pointed out by Mr.



Seidrﬁan, the PSC has recognized used and useful as an engineering concept. Order No.
7684 issued March 1977. There is no generally recognized definition of used and useful
and the County’s witness’ attempt is erroneous. (FS Reb 10)

The Utility is not taking issue with the use of this rule in determining the percent of
used and useful for its wastewater treatment plant. It is taking issue with this language
being used as a broad definition of used and useful and its application to components of a
wastewater system other than the wastewater treatment plant for which the Rule was never
intended to apply. For that evaluation, it is proper to turn to the FPSC’s broader definition,
especially with regard to its relationship to prudency. (FS Reb. 11)

One first needs to examine the events leading up to the Utility’s decisions to invest in
purchased treatment capacity, a large transmission force main and a pumping station as
well as the overall necessity of that investment. As Mr. Flynn has chronicled in his
testimony, several things were occurring at the same time that led to the Utility's
investment decision. The Sandalhaven wastewater system was purchased by Utilities, Inc.
of Sandalhaven in 1999. After addressing some 15 FDEP violations that occurred under the
previous owner, the Utility began analyzing how it would maintain compliance with its
operating permit as well as all FDEP rules and regulation governing the operation of its
wastewater treatment and disposal system. The Sandalhaven treatment plant’s permitted
capacity had been set by FDEP at 150,000 gpd based on the treatment plant’s design
characteristics but limited by either the delivery of 100,000 gpd of reclaimed water at the

wildflower Country Club golf course or 150,000 gpd to the onsite rapid infiltration basins
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(RIBs). However, based on operational experience, it was evident that the capacity of the
RIBs was limited to no more than 100,000 gpd. (PF Dir. 4) A study commissioned by the
Utility confirmed that the RIBs had poor percolation capacity and lateral seepage problems
that negatively impacted the surrounding property but that rehabilitating the RIBs might
offer some improvement of their operational performance. At that time, the Utility
experienced minimal customer growth or increases in plant flow plus the availability of
reliable disposal of all of the plant’s flow to the golf course made the cost of rehabilitation
of the RIBs an economically and operationally unwarranted investment, as both the
treatment plant and the disposal capacity were adequate to serve both existing customers
and some future customers. However, in 2004 two significant things happened. First,
wildflower Country Club ceased operations (PF Dir. 4), thus putting in jeopardy the
adequacy of the Utility’s disposal system, even for the existing customers, without at least
reconsidering rehabilitating the RIBs. Even though the golf course owner allowed the
Utility to temporarily use the former golf course property for effluent disposal while the
Utility considered alternative disposal options, the Utility could not rely on the golf course
as a permanent solution (PF Dir. 5; Tr. 151) The prudency of this decision became evident
when the Wildflower property was ultimately sold and the use of the golf course property
for effluent disposal was terminated by the new owner. (PF Dir. 5; Tr. 152, 156) Second,
development within Charlotte County and in the Sandalhaven service area accelerated
rapidly. Between 2002 and 2003, building permits in Charlotte County increased by 31%

and between 2003 and 2004 by nearly 45%. (FS Reb. 12) In 2004, in response to frequent
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inquiries by developers requesting wastewater service, the Udlity commissioned the
preparation of a master plan to consider the best way to move forward. (PF Dir. 1; Ex. PCF
1) There were five options considered in the master plan. They basically boiled down to
either 1) expand the current treatment capacity to treat all existing and future flows or 2)
abandon the plant altogether and purchase treatment and or disposal capacity from either
the County or EWD. (FS Reb. 12) The more attractive choice was to expand the existing
plant. However, FDEP was unwilling to permit the construction of subsurface injection
wells without first implementing a multi-year pilot study which was cost-prohibitive. The
Utility therefore opted to execute the next best economic choice which was to contract with
EWD to purchase treatment and disposal capacity adequate to serve the Utlity’s service
area at buildout and then to phase out the treatment plant’s operation. (FS Reb. 12) At this
point, any rehabilitation of the RIBs became moot. While this was going on, the Udlity
continued to receive inquiries from developers to serve specific multi-unit projects that
would increase demand by 250,000 gpd by 2007, overwhelming its current facilities.
Therefore, in 2005, two years in advance of the expected increased in flow the Utility
moved forward on two fronts to insure its ability to serve its current customers and provide
capacity for new customers in the most economical way available. It entered into
negotiations with EWD to purchase 500,000 gpd in treatment and disposal capacity in
increments. (FS Reb. 12; Ex. PCF 2, 2A) The interconnection and capacity purchase from
EWD was not just for growth, but also because the Utility lost its primary means of effluent

disposal. (Tr. 165) Flow generated from the Utility’s existing customers in the winter
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months was already greater than the percolation capacity of the RIBS. (Tr. 165) The Utility
also moved forward with construction of a transmission main and master lift station to
transport sewer flow to EWD. By the end of 2006, the Utility had completed the purchase of
300,000 gpd of capacity from EWD. The purchase of this capacity was sufficient to allow
retirement of the existing WWTP to serve the existing customers and allow for projected
short term customer growth. Notwithstanding language in the Utdlity’s PAA Order (Ex. JW
6j to the contrary, Mr. Seidman explained that the documentation he filed with the PSC in
that rate case showed that the interconnection and purchase of capacity from EWD was not
just for future customers. (Tr. 386) OPC shows its naiveté in questioning why the Utlity did
not protest an otherwise acceptable PAA Order because of the erroneous language. By the
end of 2006, construction of the force main and pumping plant was completed and placed
into service shortly thereafter. Based on the best information before it at the time, the
Utility made prudent and economic decisions in order to meet environmental constraints,
to continue to serve existing customers and to provide service to future customers within its
certificated service area. All of this investment was made and placed into sérﬁce before the
economy turned. (FS Reb. 11-13) When the real estate market in its service area collapsed,
the Utility was able to negotiate a reduction of 200,000 gpd of capacity it had previously
contracted to purchase from EWD. (PF Dir. 8)

Knowing what it knew at the time, had the Utlity not acted as it had in a timely
manner, the service to existing customers would have been jeopardized if not interrupted.

The investment in capacity, in the force main and in the pumping plant was made to benefit
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every customer, both existing and future. And it must be considered that the precipitous
drop in residential and multi-family construction was not the result of unfulfilled “pie-in-
the-sky” developer projections, but the result of a national recession that severely impacted
the Englewood housing market after the Utility’s investment in capacity, force main and
pumping plant was completed. Additionally, the occupancy rate of completed dwellings
dropped below the historical trend resulting in less wastewater flow being generated than
projected but also depressing revenue. If this is not recognized in evaluating used and
useful, then the result is what the County witness has determined - that it’s only the
formulas that count and the Utility must look only to future customers for relief. The
County’s witness has calculated that 68.43% of the Utility’s investment in the EWD
purchased capacity, 90.53% of the investment in the force main, 81.06% of the investment
in the master lift station lift station and 65.56% of the investment in the pumps should be
recovered prospectively, in the indeterminate future, through the application of an AFPI
charge. (FS Reb. 13) As discussed below, AFPI does not make the Utility whole from a
financial standpoint and prevents the Utility from recovering its prudent investment. (Tr.
392)

The consequence of the County’s position is that it distorts the regulator/utility
relationship. It sets up a one way street where the Utility is expected to act prudently and
economically without any protection of its investment in property used and useful in the
public service.  Under such a relationship, there is no incentive for a utility to act

prudently. It would simply wait until demand is upon it, in violation of its responsibilities,
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and let potential customers wait the 12-18 months lead time necessary to design, permit
and construct the additional facilities. (FS Reb. 14) In applying formulas upon which the
County’s witness relies, there is also the concern that he has given short shrift to the
economies of scale of which the Utility has taken advantage. The County’s witness agrees in
principle with recognition of economies of scale, but seems to find no support for them. In
doing so, he ignores the obvious. In his direct testimony, Mr. Flynn indicated economies of
operation and economies of scale in construction of the force main, the lift station and the
pumping plant. The construction of a 12” line to interconnect with EWD took advantage of
economies of scale and was prudent. (PF Dir. 6) Had the Utility constructed a smaller force
main inidally followed by the building of another force main, when flows increased it
would have had to construct not only the second force main, but a second wet well adjacent
to the first one. (PF Dir, 8) Based upon Mr, Flynn's detailed discussion, we are left to
conclude that the County’s witness’ strict reliance on a formulistic approach without any
recognition of economies and economies of scale, and without recognition that the plant
was constructed to serve both existing and future customers, severely understates the used
and useful for the force main, lift stadon and pumping plant. All should be considered
100% used and useful. (FS Reb. 17-18) The Utility’s position is not without precedence. In
Docket No. 000694-WU, Water Management Services, Inc., the PSC determined that a 12-
inch water main rather than a 10-inch water main was the prudent and economic decision
and found it to be 100% used and useful, even though the 10-inch main would have been

adequate. As an aside, that determination was based on growth projections that never
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occurred for the same reasons that growth for Sandalhaven never occurred — a national
recession. (FS Reb. 18)

The application to the pumping equipment of the formula for calculating a used and
useful percentage for treatment plants completely ignores the facts in this case as presented
by Mr. Flynn that indicate the pumps were speéiﬁcally downsized to provide for the most
economic operation for near term requirements, not growth. (PF Dir. 3)

As to the capacity purchased from EWD, the Utility proposes, for the purboses of this
case only, and in an effort to reduce the impact of such a significant revenue increase, that
the 300,000 gpd capacity purchased from EWD be considered 41.62% used and useful.
Based on the best information available at the time, the purchase of the 300,000 gpd of
capacity was prudent and necessary in order to serve existing customers and near term
projected growth. The projected flow during the winter months at the time the decision
was made was nearly 400,000 gpd, including flow generated from existing customers. The
300,000 gpd purchase from EWD plus the 150,000 gpd permitted capacity of the Utility’s
- WWTP at that time, would have been barely sufficient to avoid an interruption in service or
conflict with environmental regulations. As Mr. Flynn indicates, the purchases cannot be
reversed. However, a commitment to purchase an additional 200,000 gpd capacity was
reversible and the Utility did cancel that purchase. Had the economy not collapsed, which
was an unforeseeable event, the 300,000 gpd purchase would have been barely adequate.
The County’s witness has made a simple mathematical calculation of percent used and

useful in accordance with the PSC rule for treatment plants. When the Utility made the
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decision to purchase capacity from EWD, and in the data submitted to the PSC in the
Utility’s last rate case there were 1,230 potential units to be constructed. There are
currently 512 units constructed out of the 1,230 potential units, which represents 41.62%
of the potential number of units. (Tr. 118-119) In lieu of 100% of its prudent investment in
the EWD capacity, the Utility will accept this reduced used and useful percentage.

The County Code (Sec.3-8-45(c)) provides that rates must be just, reasonable, non-
discriminatory and compensatory. This standard is not without Constitutional oversight. In
Federal Power Commission v. Hope Natural Gas Co., 320 U.S. 591 (1944), the United
States Supreme Court established the “end result” doctrine, which states it is not how you
get to the utility’s revenue requirement, but the end result that counts. And that end result
is that the return should be sufficient for a utility to maintain its credit and attract capital.

1d at 603.

In Duquesne Light Co. v. Barasch, 488 U.S. 299 (1989), the U.S. Supreme Court
considered a case with events similar to those in this one. The utility had joined with other
utilities to build electric capacity in response to predictions of increased demand. When the
outlook radically changed, the construction was cancelled. The utility requested permission
to recover the expenditures for the unbuilt plant. The court found the actions of the utility
to be prudent, but ruled against Duguesne because the unbuilt plant was not used. That, of
course, is not the case with Sandalhaven. In Sandalhaven the plant (the wet well, pumps
and interconnect force main) is completed and is used. The utility claimed the denial was

unjust and unreasonable. But in the Duguesne case, the amount disallowed was only 1.9%
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of rate base and therefore, the court ruled that even with this disallowance, the results were
not unreasonable. In the Sandalhaven case, however, the amount disallowed is nearly 80%
of réte base. The court went on to point out that the guiding principle has been that the
Constitution protects utilities from being limited to a charge for their property serving the
public that is so unjust as to be confiscatory. Whereas, denying Duquesne recovery of 1.9%
of its rate base was not unjust and unreasonable, denying Sandalhaven a return on nearly
80% of the Utility’s rate base clearly is unjust and unreasonable, to the point of being
confiscatory.

The dollar return on rate base proposed by the County will produce only a 1.03%
return on what even the County agrees is prudent investment. This is not even enough to
recover interest expense, let alone any return on equity. Or to look at it another way, the
annual interest expense alone associated with prudently invested plant is $150,000, while
the return proposed by the County to cover both interest expense and a fair rate return on
equity is only $47,000. (FS Reb. 15-16)

ISSUE 3A: SHOULD ANY ADJUSTMENT BE MADE TO WASTEWATER TREATMENT
AND ACCOUNT 353.4 FOR THE LAND, WHICH WAS PURCHASED FOR THE
PROPOSED PLANT EXPANSION, AND IF SO, IN WHAT AMOUNT?

Finding of Fact 3A: Yes, a non-used and useful adjustment in the amount of $73,089

should be made for the .96 acre portion held for future use. (Ex. Joint 1)

ISSUE 4: WHAT IS THE APPROPRIATE WORKING CAPITAL ALLOWANCE?

Finding of Fact 4: The appropriate working capital allowance is $60,953.

Argument: This is a fallout amount.
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ISSUE 5: WHAT IS THE APPROPRIATE RATE BASE FOR THE TEST YEAR PERIOD
ENDED DECEMBER 31, 2010?

Finding of Fact 5: The appropriate rate base for the test period ended December 31,

2010 is $3,540,738.

Argument: This is a fallout amount.

COST OF CAPITAL

ISSUE 6: WHAT IS THE APPROPRIATE RETURN ON EQUITY?

Finding of Fact 6: The parties agree to use the most recent leverage formula

approved in Florida Public Service Commission Docket No. 120006-WS at the June 19,

2012, Commission Conference which was memorialized in Order No. PSC-12-0339-WS

issued June 28, 2012, which results in a return on equity of 10.52%. (Ex. Joint 1)

ISSUE 7: WHAT IS THE APPROPRIATE WEIGHTED AVERAGE COST OF CAPITAL
INCLUDING THE PROPER COMPONENTS, AMOUNTS, AND COST RATES
ASSOCIATED WITH THE CAPITAL STRUCTURE?

Finding of Fact 7: The weighted cost of capital is 7.79%.

Argument: This is a fallout amount, reflecting Sandalhaven’s position and
adjustments in Issues 3, 3A, 8 and 10.

NET OPERATING INCOME

ISSUE 8: ARE ANY ADJUSTMENTS NECESSARY TO TEST YEAR REVENUES, AND IF
SO, IN WHAT AMOUNT?

Finding of Fact 8: Yes. Test year revenues should be increased by $48,808 to

account for the eleven Habitat for Humanity homes that were not billed in the test year.
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Argument: During the test year, eleven customers living in homes constructed by
Habitat for Humanity were not billed since the Utility was unaware that they were
connected to the Utlity’s wastewater system until September, 2011. (PF Reb. 2) The
customers of the Utility receive potable water service from Charlotte County Utilities, and at
the time the builder pulled the building permits, he listed Charlotte County Utilities as the
provider for wastewater service, which may have contributed to the confusion at the
County as to the provider of wastewater service. (JE Sur. 2; Ex. JE 1) The County now has
a procedure in place to verify the provider of wastewater service. (JE Sur. 2; Ex. JE 1)

The County’s witness calculated the loss of revenues based upon actual water usage
during the test year and suggested an increase in revenues of $53,529. (JW Dir. 9) Had
these customers actually received bills, they would have responded to the price signal and
repressed their consumption to a leyel closer to the average consumption within each
affected rate classification, and it is that level of consumption that can be expected on a
going forward basis. (EA Reb. 5) The Utility’s calculations indicate that revenue for these
customers, based on consumption at the average level for the affected classes, is $34,086.
(EA Reb. 5) However, recognizing the lack of precision of either analysis, the Utility
suggests an average of the two proposals be calculated and applied, which results in
unbilled test year revenues of $48,808, representing about a 10% reduction in usage by
these customers due to the recognized ratemaking principle of repression. (EA Reb. 6; Ex.

EA 3)
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ISSUE 8A: ARE ANY ADJUSTMENTS NECESSARY TO TEST YEAR EXPENSES RELATED
TO THE RECENTLY RE-RATED WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT?

Finding of Fact 8A: No adjustments to expenses are necessary due to the post test

year re-rating of the wastewater treatment plant.

Argument: Pro forma adjustments are those made for known and measurable
changes subsequent to the test year. (Tr. 308) While the Utility has the burden of proof
with regard to the schedules it submitted and other material it relies upon (Sec. 3-8-55),
the burden of proof in asserting a pro-forma adjustment is on the party asserting the
adjustment, in this case, the County. The County has failed to meet its burden. To make
this adjustment, the County seeks to reduce expenses by the total amount booked in
NARUC Account 6270, even though the County witness was unaware as to whether that
account included testing expenses unrelated to the re-rating of the wastewater treatment
plant. (Tr. 309)

The County has recognized for purposes of decreasing operating expenses that the
re-rating of the wastewater treatment plant from 150,000 gpd to 99,000 gpd, was a known
and measurable change subsequent to the test year (Tr. 298) but the County’s used and
useful witness refused to recognize that re-rating in his used and useful determination for
the wastewater treatment plant (Tr. 324) in reaching his conclusion that the wastewater
treatment plant was only 59.89% used and useful. (AW Dir. 5) The County cannot take
inconsistent positions. The Utility accepts the County’s wastewater treatment plant used
and useful percentage, thus it is not appropriate to make any post test year adjustment to
expenses.
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ISSUE 9: SHOULD ANY ADJUSTMENTS BE MADE TO THE UTILITY'S CONTRACTUAL
SERVICES TESTING AND OTHER, AND IF SO, IN WHAT AMOUNT?

Finding of Fact 9: No adjustment should be made to contractual services testing and

other.

Argument: For review purposes, the County has combined the Udlity’s
miscellaneous expenses (Issue 11), with contractual services testing and other and
suggested an adjustment of ($15,081) based upon what the witness calls a “benchmark
analysis”. (JW Dir. 9-10) In effect, without regard to actual expenses in the test year, the
County’s witness compared the expenses from the Utility’s last rate case in 2005 and
applied the PSC’s GDP Implicit Price Deflator Index and arbitrarily reduced expenses down
to that amount. The County’s witness admitted that he does not utilize a “benchmark
analysis” when advising his governmental clients in ratemaking (Tr. 306), and the
“benchmark analysis” is only used to reduce expenses (Tr. 307) It is thus a tool for the
County to use to artificially reduce revenue that is otherwise rightfully due the Utility. Even
though the actual expenses for the test year are known and measurable (Tr. 339), the
County seeks to arbitrarily reduce them without any review of the reasonableness of each
such expense.

A “benchmark analysis” abandons a traditional test year methodology in favor of a
backward looking approach that permits the selection of certain expense categories,
examines them over an arbitrary historical period, adds an adjustment for the changes in
the GDP Price Deflator Index or CPI Index and growth, and then reduces the Company’s test

year expenses to reflect that benchmark amount. To do so is inconsistent with the known
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and measurable standard for adjusting test year expenses. There can be many reasons for
expenses to increase or decrease from one year to the next. Changes in expenses do not
necessarily follow the very simple pattern of changes in inflation and growth. Expenses
should be evaluated on their own merit. All a “benchmark analysis” does is provide an
arbitrary result that relieves a regulatory body from having to evaluate the reasonableness
of actual expenses in the test year. (EA Reb. 3)

The 2005 test year for the Utility’s last rate case is not an appropriate benchmark
year because it is not representative of ongoing expenses in these categories and not
representative of the wastewater utility industry. The County’s witness’ “benchmark
analysis” does not take into account expense categories that have decreased. In addition,
one of the accounts to which the County’s witness chose to apply the “benchmark analysis”
includes actual expenses needed to run the Utility, such as expenses paid to Charlotte
County Utilities to obtain meter reads. If you apply the “benchmark analysis” to that
expense, the increase from what the County charged in 2005 and what it charged in the
test year would result in the Utility having insufficient funds to pay Charlotte County for
meter reads. (EA Reb. 3; Tr. 340) Since the County is arbitrarily reducing this expense, can
the Utility reduce its payment to the County? One would doubt that the County would
accept a reduced amount based on a “benchmark analysis”, nor would other vendors faced
with the same unilateral action accept an arbitrary reduction such as this.

The expenses which the Utility has requested are just and reasonable (Tr. 342) and

any arbitrary reduction based on the County’s “benchmark analysis” is inappropriate.
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ISSUE 10: IS THE COMPANY'S LEVEL OF INFLOW AND INFILTRATION (I&I)
EXCESSIVE AND, IF SO, WHAT ADJUSTMENTS ARE NECESSARY?

Finding of Fact 10: The Utility has excessive I&I of 16,796 gpd, which should be

allocated 9,165 gpd to the wastewater treatment plant, and 7,630 gpd to the flows sent to
EWD for treatment. This results in an adjustment to purchased wastewater of ($20,273), to
purchased power of ($2,295) and chemicals of ($1,344)

Argument: The Utility and the County agree that the Utility has excessive 1&1 of
16,796 gpd, which should be allocated 9,1675 .gpd to the wastewater treatment plant, and
7,630 gpd to the flows sent to EWD for treatment, (FS Reb. 8) This results in an
adjustment to purchased wastewater of ($20,273), to purchased power of ($2,295) and
chemicals of ($1,344). (JW Dir. 10)

ISSUE 11: SHOULD ANY ADJUSTMENTS BE MADE TO THE UTILITY'S
MISCELLANEOUS EXPENSES, AND IF SO, IN WHAT AMOUNT?

Finding of Fact 11: No adjustment should be made to the Utility’s miscellaneous

expenses.
Argument: See arguments in Issue 9 above.
ISSUE 12: WHAT IS THE APPROPRIATE AMOUNT OF RATE CASE EXPENSE?

Finding of Fact 12: The appropriate amount of rate case expense is $173,471.

Argument: Reasonable rate case expense is an operating expense to which a utility
is entitled in the ratemaking process. The Utility’s last rate case utilized the PSC’s PAA
process, with which the Hearing Officer is familiar. It is a process without the expense of a

formal hearing’s prefiled testimony, an actual hearing and post-hearing filings, and it is
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intended to be less expensive than a full evidentiary hearing such as the instant proceeding
(Tr. 310). The County used an anticipated amount of rate case expense by taking the
amount approved by the PSC in the Utility’s last rate case and escalating it for inflation
which resulted in an estimate of $157,707. The rate case expense actually incurred is only
$15,764 or 10% greater than the amount. This is a reasonable increase in light of the
substantial additional time involved in a formal hearing versus a PAA proceeding.
However, the formal hearing process includes the post-hearing filing of a Proposed
Recommended Order, and the Utility is entitled to the reasonable expense of preparing that
document. OPC admitted that if the rate case expense is in line with what was spent in the
last case or a little higher that it would be reasonable. (Tr. 278) For instance, the PSC in
the Utility’s last rate case approved legal rate case expense of $66,240, and in the instant
case, it is only $68,815.64, or a modest 3.7% increase, without any adjustment for inflation.

By virtue of the Exhibits introduced by OPC on this issue (OPC Ex. 3-4) and
argument of OPC counsel at the hearing (Tr. 278), OPC is going to contest the in-house
employee rate case expense incurred by the Utility. The County’s witness who OPC
questioned about the PSC Order excerpts was not familiar with them (Tr. 288-290). OPC
asserts that the PSC in those PAA Orders disallowed in-house rate case expense. However,
such determination was based upon the facts of that case, and there is no evidence in the
record that those facts are present in the instant case. OPC chose to ignore the Hearing
Officer’s suggestion to question the Utility’s witness about rate case expense (Tr. 272). 'In

the Utlity’s last rate case at the PSC, based upon the facts presented in that case, in-house



rate case expense was allowed. (Ex. JW 6) The Utility also pointed out several other PSC
Ofders wherg the PSC allowed in-house rate case expense. (Ex. Utlity 2, 3 & 4) The
conclusion to be drawn from these PSC Orders, all of which were PAA proceedings, is that
in-house rate case expense is determined on a case-by-case basis, and there is no evidence
in the record of this proceeding to support OPC’s assertion that the Utlity should not be
allowed to recover in-house rate case expense. OPC did not even attempt to support its
.assertion througfl cross examination of the Utility’s witness.

All rate case expense requested is substantiated in the Exhibit which, due to its size,
will be submitted separately, and is reasonable.

ISSUE 13: WHAT IS THE TEST YEAR WASTEWATER OPERATING INCOME OR LOSS
BEFORE ANY REVENUE INCREASE?

Finding of Fact 13: The test year operating loss before any revenue increase is

($338,482).

Argument: This is a fallout amount.

REVENUE REQUIREMENT

ISSUE 14:  WHAT 1S THE APPROPRIATE REVENUE REQUIREMENT?

Finding of Fact 14: The appropriate revenue requirement is $ 1,291,302.

Argument: This is a fallout amount.

ISSUE 15:  WHAT ARE THE APPROPRIATE WASTEWATER RATES FOR THE UTILITY?

Finding of Fact 15: The appropriate wastewater rates are attached hereto.
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Argument: This is a fallout determination.

ISSUE 16: WHAT ARE THE APPROPRIATE MISCELLANEOUS CHARGES FOR THE
UTILITY?

Finding of Fact 16: The appropriate miscellaneous service charges are as follows

Plan Review Charge

Inspection Charge

Actual Cost

Actual Cost

(Ex. Joint 1):
Type Charge Bus. Hrs. After Hrs.
(a) (d) (e)
Wastewater
Inital Connection Fee $21.00 $42.00
Normal Reconnection Fee $21.00 $42.00
Violation Reconnection Fee Actual Cost Actual Cost
Premises Visit $21.00 $42.00
System Capacity Charge:
Residential-per ERC
or per Lot $2,628.00

All others-per Gallon/Day $13.83
Other:
Flow Meter Installation

Residential Actual Cost

Al}l others Actual Cost

Argument: Staff and Utility stipulate to the appropriate miscellaneous service

charges and OPC takes “No Position” on the appropriate miscellaneous charges stipulated to

by the Staff and Utility.
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ISSUE 17: 'WHAT IS THE APPROPRIATE ALLOWANCE FOR PRUDENTLY INVESTED
(AFPI) CHARGES FOR THE UTILITY?

Finding of Fact 17: The appropriate AFPI charge is set forth on the Schedule
attached hereto.

Argument: The AFPI charges will be a fall-out based on the approved amount of
non-used and useful plant, expenses and ERCs. The charge will increase monthly untl 5
years from the effective date at which time the charge will be capped. The charge will be
discontinued when the number of ERCs used to establish the charge have been connected.
(Ex. Joint 1) The appropriate rate of return to be used in calculating AFPI charges is
7.95%.

AFPI is not a substitute for a return on prudently invested capacity purchased from
EWD. The County’s witness proposes the use of the AFPI charge as the solution to the
Utility’s problem of recovering costs associated with the County consultant’s determination
that approximately 68.43% of its rate base is prudent but not used and useful. The AFPI, or
Allowance for Funds Prudently Invested, is a mechanism devised by the PSC as a means of
recovering the costs associated with prudently invested non used and useful plant from
future customers only. As the County’s witness admitted, AFPI is intended to recover from
future customers the cost of future growth (Tr. 250), and does not result in a full recovery
to the Utility in the instant case where the cost is not just for future customers. For a
regulated utility, under normal circumstances, AFPI is better than nothing. After all, costs
will be recovered — someday, but, unfortunately, not when the bill comes due. (FS Reb. 21)

The County’s witness admits that the Utility may never recover those costs. (Tr. 250) If an
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AFPI charge is used, it should be based on the non-used portion of the Utility's impact fees
paid to the Englewood Water District (“EWD”) (See, Issue 3). In addition, the calculation
should use a rate of return of 7.95%, the rate of return associated with all of the prudently
invested plant. (FS Reb. 16-17) On this basis, the first month AFPI charge would be $28.92
per ERC, beginning in December, 2012 (assuming the County Commission acts as
scheduled) and would increase monthly until it reaches the amount of $1,983.53 per ERC
per month, after five years. (See attached Schedule.)
ISSUE 18: SHOULD RATES BE REDUCED FOUR YEARS AFTER THE ESTABLISHED
EFFECTIVE DATE TO REFLECT THE REMOVAL OF THE AMORTIZED RATE
CASE EXPENSE, AND IF SO, WHAT IS THE APPROPRIATE AMOUNT BY
WHICH RATES SHOULD BE REDUCED?

Finding of Fact 18: Yes. Rate case expense should be amortized and recovered over

a four-year period, with the Utility following the procedure for automatic reduction and
notifying customers as established by the PSC. The exact amount will be detérmined based

upon the amount of rate case expense approved in Issue 12 above. (Ex. Joint 1)

ISSUE 19:  SHOULD THE UTILITY BE REQUIRED TO PROVIDE DOCUMENTATION
WITHIN 90 DAYS OF AN EFFECTIVE ORDER FINALIZING THIS DOCKET TO
SHOW THAT IT HAS ADJUSTED ITS GENERAL LEDGER FOR ALL THE
APPLICABLE NATIONAL ASSOCIATION OF REGULATORY UTILITY
COMMISSIONERS (NARUC) UNIFORM SYSTEM OF ACCOUNTS (USOA)
PRIMARY ACCOUNTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE COUNTY APPROVED
ADJUSTMENTS?

Finding of Fact 19: Yes. The Utility will provide copies of its general ledger pages
reflecting the adjustments within 90 days of an effective order finalizing this docket. (Ex.

Joint 1)
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CONCLUSIONS OF LAW:

1. The County Board of County Commissioners has jurisdiction to decide the
Utility rate application pursuant to Charlotte County Ordinances 2007-092, and as codified
as Chapter. 3-8, of the Charlotte County Code. See also, §§ 367.171(3) and (8), Florida
Statutes. The Hearing Officer was appointed in accordance with Section 1-10-342 of the
Charlotte County Code.

2. Rates to be charged by a utility must be just, reasonable, compensatory and
not unfairly discriminatory. Sec. 3-8-14(4), Charlotte County Code. FPC v. Hope Natural
Gas Co., 320 U.S. 591 (1944).

3. In setting rates the County Board of County Commissioners shall determine
the actual original cost of property used and useful in public service. Sec. 3-8-62(a),
Charlotte County Code. In doing so, the County has not adopted any specific methodology
for making such used and useful determination, and is not required to, nor has it taken any
action to follow the methodology adopted by the Florida Public Service Commission.

4. The Board shall fix and determine a rate which allows for reimbursement of
operating costs including depreciation on all properties, excluding contributed properties,
and a fair and reasonable net return on the original cost of a system incurred by the person
first dedicating it to public service, which shall not include contributions in aid of
construction or customer contributions. Sec. 3-8-62(a), Charlotte County Code.

5. The appropriate test year to be used in this case is the historical fiscal year

ending December 31, 2010. Sec. 3-8-58, Charlotte County Code.
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6. Adequate notice of the hearing was given at the times and in the manner
required by Section 3-8-50(c), Charlotte County Code.

7. Based on all the evidence, including the testimony and exhibits admitted at
the hearing, the revenue requirements, rates of return, and rates requested by Utilities Inc.
of Sandalhaven are just, reasonable, compensatory, and not unfairly discriminatory.

8. The wastewater collection, treatment and disposal system operated by
Utilities Inc. of Sandalhaven meets all minimum standards established by the State of
Florida in terms of health, safety and welfare. The wastewater system has no outstanding

citations or enforcement issues.

9. The overall quality of service of Utilities Inc. of Sandalhaven is satisfactory.

RECOMMENDATION:

Based on the foregoing findings of fact and conclusions of law, it is RECOMMENDED
that the Board of County Commissioners:
1. Issue a Final Order granting Utilities Inc. of Sandalhaven’s Application for an

Increase in Wastewater Rates consistent with the Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law

above.
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE
DOCKET NO.: 2011-001-S

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct copy of the foregoing Proposed
Recommended Order has been furnished by e-mail this 1st day of October, 2012, to:

Erik Sayler, Esquire

OFFICE OF PUBLIC COUNSEL
c/o The Florida Legislature
111 West Madison Street
Room 812

Tallahassee, FL 32399-1400
SAYLER.ERIK@leg.state.fl.us

Martha Burton, Esquire
ASSISTANT COUNTY ATTORNEY
Charlotte County

18500 Murdock Circle, Suite 573
Port Charlotte, FL. 33948
marty.burton@charlottefl.com

Respectfully submitted this 1* day of
October, 2012, by:

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP
766 North Sun Drive, Suite 4030

Lake Mary, FL 32746

Phone: (407) 830-6331

Fax: (407) 830-8522
miriedman@siflaw.com

MARTIN S. FRIEDMAN
Florida Bar No.: 0199060
For the Firm
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UTILITIES INC. OF SANDALHAVEN

DOCKET NO. 2011-001-S, CHARLOTTE COUNTY

SCHEDULE 1-D

Allowance for Funds Prudently Invested-
Calculation of Carrying Cost Per ERC:Per Month: .

December
January
February
March
April

May

June

July
August
September
October
November

1,013.06
1,045.96
1,078.85
1,111.75

1,146.87
1,181.99
1,217.11
1,252.24
1,287.36
1,322.48
1,357.60
1,392.72
1,427.84
1,462.97
1,498.09
1,533.21

1,570.74
1,608.26
1,645.79
1,683.32
1,720.84
1,758.37
1,795.90
1,833.42
1,870.95
1,908.48
1,946.00
1,083.63

1,983.53
1,983.53
1,983.53
1,983.53
1,983.53
1,983.53
1,983.53
1,983.63
1,083.53
1,983.53
1,983.53
1,983.53



Rate Schedule Chariotte County, Florida
Docket No. 2011-011-8

Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven

Test Year Eaded: December 31, 2010

Water | | or Sewer |X|

M 6}
Line Proposed

No Class/Meter Size Rates

1 Residential

2 All meter sizes (5/8" & 1) 50.44
4 Gallonage Charge {per 1000 gallons)

5 8,000 gatlons maximum 11.33
6 General Service

7 548" x 3/4" 50.44
8 " 126.11
9 § 12y 25220
10 2" 403.52
13! 3" 807.07
2 4 ‘ 1.261.03
13 6" 2.522.04
4 Gallonage Charge

15 {per 1000 gallons) 13.61
16 Multi-Residential - Metered

17 S8 x 344 50.44
18 e 126.11
19 IR R 252.20
20 20 403.52
2 3" §07.07
22 4" 1.261.05
23 6 2.522.04
2 Gallonage Charge
25 (per 1000 gallons) 13.61
26 Reserved Capacity - Flat Charge, per unit 49.30

27 Reuse Water Service. per quarter -



Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven Exhibit EA-1
Revised Schedule OI-4

Analysis of Rate Case Expense as of September 15, 2012

Test Year Ended: December 31, 2010

(1) (2) 3 [&Y) (5) 6) (@]
Line Firm or Counsel, Consultant  Hourly Rate Hours Charges Total Type of
No. Vendor Name or Witness Per Person Actuals ' Actuals Expense Service Rendered
1 Rose, Sundstrom & Bentley, LLP Christian Marcelli 315.00 12 3,875 3,875 Legal Fees
2 Rose, Sundstrom & Bentley, LLP Martin Friedman 340.00 171 58,106 58,106 Legal Fees
3 Rose, Sundstrom & Bentley, LLP n/a - n/a 6,835 6,835 Various Expenses (travel, photocopies, phone calls) associated with legal fees
4 M&R Consultants Frank Seidman 150.00 360 53,963 53,963 U&UAnalysis, Assist w/ MFRs, data requests, audit facilitation
5 M&R Consultants Frank Seidman 150.00 - ‘ 437 437 Various Expenses (travel, photocopies, phone calls)
6 Charlotte County n/a n/a n/a ~ - Filing Fee (included as an expense in RSB invoice)
7 Water Service Corp. Various Personnel n/a n/a 47,872 47,872 Assist w/MFRs, data requests, audit facilitation, hearing and PRO+A1
8 Water Service Corp. n/a n/a n/a 970 970 Customer notices, postage
9 Water Service Corp. n/a n/a n/a ‘ 1,193 1,193 Travel, Hotel/Accommodation, Rental Care, Airfare
10 Water Service Corp. n/a n/a n/a | 170 170 Temp Services
11 Water Service Corp. n/a n/a n/a 51 51 Fed Ex & other misc,
12
13 Total 173,471 173,471
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Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven
Rate Case Expense

Invoices




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES OR
TALLARASSEE. FLORIDA 32301

£ E 8582762536 (34C} 377-5865 PLEASSREFER T INVCICE NURIBER
WHEN REMITTING

UTILITIES, INC
ATTN:  JOHN STOVER

233% SANDERS RD MARCH 1G, 291t

NORTHBROCK, IL 60062 - INVOICE # 34512
FILE # 300357-00198
PAGE X

MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE

2/09/1% MS8F REVIEW CHARLOTTE COUNTY ORDINANCES IN PREPARATION .50 17C.0¢
] ¥COR MEETING WITH BUDGET DIRECTOR
2/10/11 MSF TRAVEL TO CHARLOTTE COUNTY WITH MR. FLYNN AND MR. . 7.89 2,584.90

WILLIAMS AND MEZTING WiT: BUDGET DIRECTOR AND
ATTORMEY; RETURM TOD LAKE MARY CFFICE

TOTAL HOURS L BT

]
(4]
Lo
8]
<1
Ut
'y
(=
o s

PROFESSIONAL FE

MARTIN S FRISDMAN B8.10 2,754.00

TRAVEL EXPENSE 265.63
TOTAL CCSTS ADVANCED $ 265.63
TCTAL STATEMENT $ 3,019.63




LAW OFFKCES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES OR
TALLARASSEE. FLORIDA 32304

Vg 852783838 (350) 877-5355 PLESSE REFER LO INVOICE NUMBER

LITIES, INC

ATTN: JONN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RO APRIL 12, 2013
NORTHBROOK, iL 600632 INVOICE 14651
FILE 4 30057-00196
PAGE 1
MATTER: GSANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
: CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
Q7711 MSF  RESEARCH AND DRAFT TEST YEAR REQUEST LETTER . .50 178.29
711/1% MSF  REVISE TEST YEAR REQUEST LETTER AND LETTER TO : 40 136.20
CLIENT REGARDING SAME.
3,/14/11 MSF  FINALIZE TEST YEAR REQUEST LETTER AND LETTER TO : .20 58.C5
MR. DAVIS AND ATTCRNEY YOUNG
TOTAL HOURS = a6
) PROFESSIONAL FEES § 37408 -
MARTIN S FRTEDMAN 1.30 374.09
PHOTOCCPIES 1.00
TOTAL CO5TS ADVANCED $ 1.80
‘POTAL STATEMENT S 375.86

WO DD 5




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
EFER T INVGICE NUMBER

£ 219 59-2763535 503 627.6555 PLEASE REF
" 3535 85 6559 REMITTING

SUNE 2, 201}

INVOICE # 45092
FILE # 30057-00196
PAGE 1
MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 20110CS
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
MSF  REVIEW BOCC AJENDA ITEM AND LETTER TO CLIENT .30 192,08
TOTAL HOURS .30
PRCPESSIONAL FEES S 102.00

MARTIN S FRIEDMAN .30
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ .00
TOTAL STATEMENT $ 102.02

WWOoWL
35802




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

2538 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR

TALLAHASSEE. FLGRIDA 32301
FE! - & i 77- PLEASE REFER TO IRVCICE WUMBER
£ 14 50-278353¢ 850} 877-6555 DL EASE REFER TS A
CTILITIBS. INC
ATTN: JOLN STOVER
2325 SANDERS RD JuULyY 11, 2011
MCRTHBROCK, Il 80062 INVOICE # 45376
FILE # 3CC57-001%¢6
PAGE 1
MATTUER:  SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011065
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
6,/C3/11 CWm REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CONSULTANT REGARDING .30 94 .50

MFRS AND FILING DCCUMENTS WITH COUNTY; LEGAL
RESEARCE RECARDING COUNTY REQUIREMENTS FOR FILING
APELICATION AND MFRS; INTERNAL CONFERENCE
REGARDING SAME; DRAFT CORRESPCNLENCE TO
CONSULTANT REGARDING SAME,

5/05/11 CWM REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM FRANK SETDMAN
REGARDING MFRS 70 BE FILEDR; CONTINUE LEGAL
RESEARCH REGARDING FORM AND REQUIREMENTS FOR MFRS
IN CHARLOTTE CCOUNTY; REVIEW ORDINANCE IN LIGHT CF
SAME; DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO FRANK REGARDING MFR
I8SUES.

6/314/21 CWM REVIEY CORRESPONDENCE FROM FRANK SEIDMAN D] 252.00
REGARDING FORMAT ANE RULES TFCR APPLICATION AND
MFRS; LECAL RESEARCH REGARDING CHARLOTTE COUNTY
ORDINANCE AND REQUIREMENTS.

w
[~
(83
o
X o
L+]
Q

TOTAL HOURS 1.90

PROFESSICNAL FEES $ 598.50

.90 538.3C
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LAW OFFIGES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTCNE FINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 3239¢

F £ ;% 53-2783536 (850) 377.8585 PLEASE REFER TO INVGICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITHING

UTILITIES, TNC
Invoice f: 45376 PAGE 2

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED s .00
TOTAL STATEMENT $ 598.50
ZzoomoSmsansTen




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

2548 SLAIRSTONE PINES GR
TALLAMASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

¥ E L3 59-278383¢

{ PLEASE REFER TQ (NVOICE NUMSER
1850) 877-6555 WHER REMHTTING

AUGUST 15, 201

INVOICE B 453561
FILE M 30957-CC159%
PAGE 1

FRT7I1 CWd REVIEW ADDITICHAL ENGINEERING INFORMATION

MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2311 R/C SANDALKAVEMN

SUBMITTED BY CLIENT: DRAFT CORRESFONDENCE TO
CLIENT REGARDING SAME.

TCTAL HCURS

PRCFESSIONAL FEES

CHRISTIAN ¥ MARCELLI 1.

TCTAL COSTS ADVANCED

TOTAL STATEMENT




LAV OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE FINES DR
TALUAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

FE:m562783528 a17-6655 PLEASE REFER TO INVCICE NUMBER
i 3835 (350 877-6 WHEN REME? TN

[2)

ITIES, iNC
ATTH:  JOHN HTOVER
A33% SANDERS RD SEPTEMBER i3,
c

NORTHBROOK,. IL 60062 INVOzC
FILE & 30057~
PAGE :

t

MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN

CWM  REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR. SEIDMAN REGARDING .39 94.56
STATUS OF PTLING AND 1SSUSS RELATING TO COUNTY'S :
REQUIREMENTS. _
5/18/11 CWM  REVIZW CCRRESPONDENCE FRGM CONSULTANT REGARDING .60 189.
RATE CASE FILING: REVIEW COUNTY CRDIRANCE IN
LIGHT OF SAME: DRAFT CORREZSFONDENCE TC CLIENT AND
CONSULTANT REGARDING CONSULTANT'S INGQUIRY. :
€/23/31 MSF  REVIEW CHANGES TO FILING REQUIREMENTS AND LETTERS . .30
‘ . FO ATTORNEY SURTON AND CLIENT _ )
8724711 MSF  CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WiTH MR. " .49 "136.00
SEIDMAN REGARDING APPLICATION REQUIREMENTS AND
MFRS v
8/34711 CWM  REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM FRANK SEIDMAN .30
REGARDING PREPARATION OF MFRS; LEGAL RESEARCH
“REGARDING ORDINANCE REQUIREMENTS FGR MFRS.
8/25/11 CWM  REVIEW CCRRESPONDENCE FROM CONSULTANT REGARDING .59 1
PREPARATION OF MFRS IN ACCORDANCE WITH COUNTY
ORDINANCE; REVIEW COUNTY ORDINANCE; DRAFT
RESPONSE TC CONSULTANT. '
&/26/11 WM  REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CCNSULTANT REGARDING .30 94.
MFR PREPARATION UNDER CHARLCTTE COUNTY'S
ORDINANCE; REVIEW SCHEDULES FROM CONSULTANT IW
CONMECTICN WITK LEGAL REVIEW OF ORDINANCE.
BEGIN RESEARCH AND DRAFT OF ABRPLICATION 2.3¢
BEVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CONSULTANT REGARDING .59
INFORMATION REQUIRED FOR FILING: DRAFT
CORRESPONMNTDIENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING SAME; REVIEW
CLIENT'S RESPONSE.

Pt
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TOTAL HOURS 5.50

PROPESSIONAL FXEES $ 1,807,390




LAW OFFICES
ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, L1P

2548 PLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE. FLORIDA 32201
FE 8592783536

{8503 3/ 7-6353 PLEASE REFER 1O INVILE NUMBIR
WHEA REMITTING

UTILITIES, IRC

invoice #4; 457548 PAGE 2
MARTIN 5 FPRTIEDMAN 3.90 1,020.00
CHRISTIAN W MARCELLI 2.50 787.59

TCTAL COSTS ADVANCED s .CD
~ TOTAL STATEMENT $

VO
2 338719




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
2548 BLARSTONE PIRES OR
TALLAHASSEE. FLORIA 3230

FE:356-2783538 (850) BY7-655% pLEASE?ETﬁFETTNEO INVOICE NUMBER

OCTORER 11, 2011
IL 60062 INVQICE 4 45974
FILE A 30037-00196
PAGE 1
MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 EATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
3/01/31 MSF REVIEW PRIOR PSC ORDERS AND FINALIZE DRAFT OF .BO 272.48
APPLICATION; LETTER TC MR. SEIDMAN
2-745/11 MSF REVTEW COMMENTS TO APPLICATION FROM MR. SEJDMAN ,40 136.0¢
AND REVISE APPLICATION ACCORDINGLY; LETTER TO MR.
FLYNN REGARDING ADDITIONAL ENGINEERING
INFORMATION )
9/68/21 CwM REVIE®W CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT AND CONSULTANT ' .80 25%.¢T

REGARDING DRAFT OF FINAL MFRS; REVIEW AND CCMMENT
. . ON FINAL DRAFT OF MFRS. N S .
37327311 CWM REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING RATE 70 220.5C
CASE EXPENSE SCHEDULE 8-1Q; PREPARE RATE CASE N
EXPENSE ESTIMATE; DRAFT CORRESFONDENCE TO CLIENT
REGARDING RATE CASE EXPENSE ESTIMATE.

2/14/12 CwWM  REVIEW ADDITIONAL ENGINEERING INFORMATIGON .20 63,81
SUBMITTED BY CLIENT.

9715/11 CaM  REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT OF MFRS AND UsU .80 252,80
DISCUSSION FROM CONSULTANT AND CLIENT.

9/16/11 MEF  REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON DRAFT OF MFRS .40 138.0C

5/21/11 MSF  REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON MFKS; CORRESPONDENCE WITH 1.30 442.00C
MR. SEIDMAN; REVIEW AND COMMENT UPCN REVISED MFRS.

2/21/311 Cv™  REVIEW MFRS FROM CONSULTANT; TELEPHONE COMFERENCE 1.80 567 .00
WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME; DRAFT CCRRESPONDENCE
TO AND REVIEW OORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT AND
CONSULTANT RESARDING MFRS.

QF2ZS1E CHM REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND DRAFT .70 224 .50
CORRESPONDENCE TO CONSULTAMT REGARDING
APPLICATICN AND MFRS; REVIEW AND REVISE MFRS IN
LIGHT OF SAME.

9/23/11 MSF  REVISE APPLICATION T0 INCLUDE MISCELLANECUS 1.10 374.0C

SERVICE CHARGES; PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN
CCNFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT AND MR. SEIDMAN IN
FINALIZING MPFRS




LAY OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

2548 SLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEEZ. FLORIDA 32301

F E1#53.-278353€ 1850 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO iNVOICE NUIABER
’ S AT RETNG ™

Invoice §: 15974 FAGE 2
9723711 CWM PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH .50 282 .4C
CLIENT REGARDING MFR ISSUES AND USED AND USEFUL
SCHEDULE.
§/27/1%1 CWM  REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT REGARDING RATE .30 34.5¢
CASE FILING; DRAFT CORRESPCNDENCE TO CLIENT AND
CONSULTANTS REGARDING SAME.
TOTAL XCURS 19.20
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 3,313.00
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN o 3.00 . 1.360.00
CHRISTIAN W MARCELLI 6.20 1,953.00
FILING FEE 3,509.45
PHOTOCOPIES 258.75
OUTSIDE PHOTOCCPIES 6€80.908
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 4,205.8B3
TOTAL STATEMENT 5 7,518.83




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE. FLORIDA 32301

FEid3$5-2765536 {B50) B77-555% PLEAS%RE.FER TO INVGICE NUMBER

INC
T JOHN STOVER
2333 SANDERS RD NOVEMBER 9, 2011
NORTHBROOK, il 600¢Z INVOICE # 46234
FILE 4 30057-00196
PAGE 1
MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 201% RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 261100%
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
10/87731 MSF TELEPHONE TUONFERENCE WITH MR. WILLIAMS REGARDING .70 2328.90C

UPCOMING BOCC MEETING; CORRESPCNDENCE WITH CLIENT
AND COUNTY KECARDING SAME; TELEPHONE CCNFERENCE
WITH ATTORNEY SURTON OF CHARLOTTE COUNTY

10720/11 MSF  TRAVEL TD FORT CRARLOTTE FOR BGCC MEETING ON 3.00 1,620.00
TRANSFERRING JURISDICTION

10711711 MSF - ATTEND BOCC MEETING AND LETTER TC CLIENTS; RETURN . 5.48 1,835.00
TO LAKE MARY OFFICE

10/35/11 MSF . REVIEW ORDINANCES, APPLICATICN AND MFRS AND S .30 . 10z.00

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. WILL1AMS RECARDING
REQUESTING INTERIM RATES

TOTAL HCURS 9.4¢

ZROFESSIONAL 7ZES $ 3,196.00

MARTIN § FRIEDMAN 9.40 3,196.00

QPERATOR CONFERENCE CALL 45.30
LEXIS SERVICE 13.98
PEDEZRAL ZXPRESS 105.08
PHOTCCCPIES 23.00

TCTAL CCSTS ADVANCED 5 257.897




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

{850) 977-6555 PLEAS
WHEN

PAGE 2
TOTAL STATEMENT 5 3,453.97
TSoESEEXASIEEZ =S

o\ o
402922

GO INVOICE NUMBER




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

2545 BLAIRSTCNE PINES OR
TALLARASSEE, FLORIDA 32381

1,9 NVOICE NUMBER

NG

4532 {B52) 877-6555 LEASE REFER
FE13%522763538 {BS2) B77.655% 5\.'..‘_"55 EA:T

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOEN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD DECEMBER 12, 2011
NORTHBROCK, TL 3408082 INVOICE % 46433
FILE 4 30057-0019¢
PAGES b
MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
20311 R/C SANDALHAVEN
11/04/1) MSF  TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARTY BURTON; REVIEW ' .50 175.¢¢
MFRE AND LETTER TG MR. SEIDMAN
11703711 MSF  REVISW DEFICIENCY COMMENTS FROM MR. SEIDMAN; .3e 102.580
REVIEW DEFICIENCY LETTER FROM MR. DAVIS AT
CHARLOTTE COUNTY; LETTER TO CLIENTS
11/66/21 MSF  RESEARCH AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO DEFICIENCY LETTER 0 58.C0
11/87/11 MSF¥  TELEPHONE CONFERZNCE WITH MARTY BURTON WHO 20 1062.C0
TELEPHCONED .
11714711 MSF _ TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY BURTON AND . .80 17G.00
LETTER TO CLIENT AND CONSULTANT; REVIERW AGENDA H
ITEM AND LETTER TO CLIENT AND CONSULTANT
11/29/1) MSF  TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY BURTCN ARD MR. .80 272.09
DAVIS WHO TELEPHONED REGARDING SCHEDULING AND
OTHER PRELIMINARY MATTERS; REVIEW CORFRESPONDENCE
FROM ATTCRNEY BURTON AND LETTER %0 Ul
TOTAL HOURS 2,60
PROFESSIONAL FEES 5 284.30
MARTIN S FRIEDNMAN 2.5G 824.00
. -
HoHeNo




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP
2448 BLAIRSTOME PHHES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 3230%

F e 552762508 {ESD) 8776555 PLEASE REFER 7O INVOICE NUMEBER
HENf G

46433 EAGE 2

.00

“r

TOTAL CGOSTS ADVANCED

TOTAL STATEMENT S 884.00




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE FLORIDA 32350

REFER 10 iy

CiCE MUMBER

F.E 17 542783535 {850y 277-8558 E
WHEN REMITTING
UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2313% SANDERS RD JANUARY 16, 2012
NORTHBROOK, IL 60362 INVOICE # 46713
FILE 8 30057-09196
PAGE 1
MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
12/0%/11 MSF CORRESPONDENCE wWITH ATTORNEY BURTON AND U 40 13g.0%
REGARDING BILL MESSAGE
12/12/11 MSF TRAVEL T PORT CHARLOTTE FOR SCHEDULING HEARING; 3.80 z.39z.00
ATTEND SCHEDULING HEARING; LETTER TC CLIENT
‘TOTAL HOURS 3.20
PROFESSIONAL FEES 5 3,128.00
MARTIN S8 FRIGDMAN .20 3,128.00
PHOTOCOPIES 1.25
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $1.25

TRTAL STATEMENT




LAY OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES OR

FE1859-2783335 (850; 377-8555 PLEASE REFER rGo INVOICE NUMBER

YIILITIEZS, 1INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2323 SANDERS RD PEBRUARY 10, 2012
NGRTHBROOK, IL 60062 TUVOICE B 46948
FILE & 20057-0019%
PAGE 1
MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
1703712 MSF CORRESPCNDENCE REGARDING RESPONSES TO REQUEST FOR .23 68.0%
AUDIT DOCUMENTS
1/05/12 MSF  TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. POVICH REGARDING .20 68.00
AUDIT REQUEST
1/09/12 MSF  BRIEF REVIEW OF AUDIT RESPONSE AND DOCUMENTS .3¢ 102.02
L/17712 MSF REVIEW DEVELOPER AGREEMENT: LETTER TO MS. HANKS; W30 102.09
LETTER TC MR. WILSON CONCERNING SAME
1/20/12 MSF REVIEW LETTER FORM ATTORNEY BURTON AND LETTER TC -1C 34.00
| MS. MARKWELL , ‘ i
1/32712 MSF REVIEW AND RZDACT CUSTCMER BILL AND LETTER TO .26 68.00
ATTORNEY BURTON
TOTAL HOURS 1,30
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 442.00
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN 1.30 442.00
FHOTCCOFIES 1.50
TOTAL COST3 ADVANCED $ 1.5¢
TOTAL STATEMENT 5 443.50

WOV
H2.0as >




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TAULAHASSEE. FLORIOA 32301

F&tm3e.2783536 {850) 877-85¢5 “;\.“i-iEéﬁEERPEIFTETTN? INVOICE NUMBER

LITIES, INC

ATN: SCHN STOVER'
2335 SANDERS RD MARCH 12, 2012
NORTHEROCK, IL 30062 INVOICE ¥ 47068
FILE 4 30057-0D19¢
PAGE 1
MATTER: SANDALRAVEN 2Gil RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 RE/C BANDALHAVEN
2/02/12 VST REVISW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE (AND IMBEDED .30 102.00
CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPCH FROM ATTCRNEY BURTON .
2/29/12 MSF PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.9¢ 646.00

WITH HEARING OFFICER, CCUNTY STAFF AND OPC STAFF;
TELEPHONE CONSERENCE WITH MR, SEIDMAN WHO
TELEPHONED; TELEPHONE CONPERENCE WITH OPC
ATTORNEZY SAYLOR WHY TELEFHONED; LETTER TO CLIENT
REGARDING TELECCONFERENCE

TOTAL HOURS S 2,20

SPRCFESSIONAL FEES S 748.00

MARTIN & FRIEDMAN 2,20 748.09

TGTATL: COSTS ADVANCED $ .00
TOTAL STETEMENT S 748.83
N N
TAUALS




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERGO, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE. FLORIDA 3230°

€1 ¢ 58.278353 77.555% ALEASE REFER 70 INUOICE SUMIER
F 1R 552703530 1850 877-525 WHEN REMITTIMG )

UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STCVER
2335 SANDERS RD APRIL 11, 2012
NIRTHSROOK, 1If 60062 INVOICE & 417282
FILE 4 30057-0019%
PAGE i
MATYER: SANDALHAVIN 2011 RATE {ASE

3720712

3/23/12
1/26/12

3/27712

MSF
MSF

MSF

MSF
MSF

CAP PROJECT NQ. 2011005
20311 R/C SANDALHAVEN

REVIEW OPC MCTION TC INTERVENE AND LETTER TC

BEGIN RESERRCH AND DRAFT OF SYNOPSIS

REVIEW FILE AND LETTER TC ATTORNEY BURTON;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY BURTON
REGARDING BILLING ISSUE AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE .
WITH MR. FLYNN CONCERMNING SAME; REVIEW AND
COMMENT UPON PRELIMINARY STAFF REPCRT AND REVIEW
COMMENTS CF OTHERS

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM MS.
MARKWELL REGARDING PRMG REPORT; CORRESPONDENCE
WITH MR, SEIDMAN AND MS. MARKWELL REGARDING
RESPONSES

RESEARCH AND DRAFT LETTER TO ATTORNEY BURTON
REGARDING REQUEST FOR INFCRMATION ON PRMG REPORT
REVISE SYNOPS1S AND LETTER TO ATTORNEY BURTON
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY BURTCN WHO
TELEPHONED; RESEARCH AND DRAFT INITIAL CUSTOMER
NOTICE AND LETTER TO ATTORNEY BURTON CONCERNING
SAME

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPC
ATTORNEY REHWINKEL REGARDING INITIAL CUSTOMER
NOTICE

REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR,
SEIDMAN RIGARDING RESPONSES TC MR. WILSON'S DATA
REQUEST

TOTAL HOURS

r-3

PROFESSICONAL FEES $ 1,

G4.00

.20

1.5G
1.60

.60

.40

L3¢
.70

[}
(=)

.20

5.6G

2n4.00

102.90

233.80
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LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERQO, LLP

2348 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

¢ €1.859-2783538 {850) 877-6855 PLEASE REFER TQ iNVOICE HUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

UTTILITIES, INC

invoice #: 47233 PAGE 2
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN 5.60 1,904.90
PHCTOCCPIES .75
TOTAL CO$STS ADVANCED s .75
TCTAL STATEMENT $ 1,904.75
VA&




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES OR
TALLAHASSEE. FLORIDA 32301

FE 14 59-2793506 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER 70 INVOICE NUMBER
R

FTILITIES, NC
ATTN: SOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD MAY 10, 2012
NCRTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOLCE ¥ 47333
FILE # 30057-90196
PAGE 1
MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CARSE
CAP PROJECT NO. 24612005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
4,/03712 MSF REVIEW, RESEARCH AND RESFOND TO CORRESPONDENCE . S0 306.00

FROM MR. SEIDMAN IN PREFARATION OF RESPONSES TO
COUNTY CONSULTANT; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO
CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPC ATTORNEY SAYLER
4/09/12 MSF  REVIEW REVISED FINANCIAL SCHEDULES AND RESPGNSES .50 170,09
AND COMMENT UPON RESPONSES FROM MR. WILSON;
CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR. SHIDMAN
/i2/12 MSF  REVIEW AOM AND LETTER TO ATTORNEY BURTON; e .13 238.00
TELEPHONE COMFERENCE WITH MS. AQUILINO WHO :
TELEPHONED REGARDING RESPONSES TO MR. WILSON'S
DATA REQUEST; INITIAL REVIEW AND RESPOND TO
CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR. SEIDMAN REGARDING USED
AND USESUL RESPONSE 10 MR. WILSON

o

45247312 WSF REVIEW, RKESEARCH AND COMMENT UPON USED AND USEFUL .50 176.¢0
ANALYSIS .
4/18/12 MSF CORRESPONDENCE WITH MS. MARKWELL AND MS. AQUILINCG 2.20 748,00

AND REVIEW PROPOSED RESPONSES TO COUNTY
CONSULTANT QUESTIONS; DRAFT RESPONSES; PREPARE
FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH
COUNTY STAFF AND OPC; LETTER TO CLIENT;
MISCELLANECUS CORRESPCNDENCE

1437712 MSF REVIEW MR, SEIDMAN'S REVISIONS TO USED & USEFUL .20 68.00
ANALYSIS AND CORRESPONDENCE CONCERNING SAME
/20712 MsF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. WILSON WHO .2¢ 63.00

TELEPHONED REGARDING FINAL RESPONSES TO QUESTIONS
AND LETTER TO MR, FLYNN CONCERNINC SAME
3723712 MSF REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON FROPOSED RESPONSE TO DATA .BC 272.00
REQUEET; CCRRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES
CONCERNING SAME;
F30/12 MS¥ PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 2.4¢ 8i€.03
WITH OPC, CLIENT AND COUNTY STAFF REGARDING
ISSURS IDENTIFICATION; REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM

A




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

P E 14 53-2782538 {850) 877.5555 PLEASE REFER TO INVCICE RUMRER
WHEN REMITTING

UTILITIRES, INT

Tevoice #: 47533 PAGE 2

COMBANY AND FINALIZE RESPONSES: LETTER TO MR.
WILSON; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. SEIDMAN:
REVIEW CUSTOMZR COMMENTS AND LETTER TO COMPANY
CONCERNING SAME; REVIEW CCHMPANY RESPONSES

TOTAL HOURS 8.40
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 2,856.00
MARTIN S FRISCMAN 8.40 2,856.00
~ BHOTOCOPTES ' ‘ 5.0
TOTAL CCSTS ADVANCED $ 5.00
TOTAL STATEMENT $ 2,861.00
TNl




200G S

LAW OFFICES 641
SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR :
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
F.E1.#59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 VPVLHEIEQSEBEFFRNTGO INVOICE NUMBER
j
7
Bach_\ 9D |29

UTILITIES, INC

ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD e 15, 2012 Doc_SAAGD

NORTHBROOK. 1L 60062 | INOICE # 47723 .

FILE # 30057-00196
PAGE 1
MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
5/06/12 MSF  REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON COUNTY STAFF REVISIONS TO .40 136.00
REPORT -
5/07/12 MSF PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 2.40 816.00

WITH OPC, STAFF AND COMPANY: AFTER- CONFERENCE
CORRESPONDENCE ; REVIEW LETTER FROM MS. MERCHANT;
REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON REVISED ISSUES
5/09/12 MSF REVIEW CUSTOMER COMMENTS AND LETTER TO CLIENT 3.60 1,224.00
CONCERNING SAME: REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR,
'SEIDMAN. AND ATTACHMENT AND FORWARD TO COUNTY AND.
OPC; REVIEW ANALYSIS BY MR. SEIDMAN OF THE
IMPROVEMENT IN COUNTY STAFF'S POSITIONS: REVIEW
AND RESPOND TO ADDITIONAL CORRESPONDENCE ; REVIEW
LETTER FROM MR. WILSON AND RESPONSE BY COMPANY
AND LETTER TO MR. WILSON: PREPARE FOR AND
PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMPANY AND
MR. SEIDMAN IN PREPARATION FOR PRE-FILED
TESTIMONY.
5/10/12 MSF  REVIEW UPDATED PROPOSED ISSUES AND LETTER TO 70 238.00
COMPANY REGARDING SAME; REVIEW LETTER FROM MR.
SEIDMAN AND ATTACHED SCHEDULE; LETTER TO COMPANY
CONCERNING SAME: REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR.
SEIDMAN AND COMPANY

5/11/12 MSF PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL .80 272.00
WITH MR. SEIDMAN AND MR. HOY REGARDING UU
5/14/12 MSF BEGIN RESEARCH AND DRAFT OF PRE-HEARING 1.40 476.00

STATEMENT; CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING UNBILLED
REVENUES AND PRE-HEARING STATEMENTS
5/15/12 MSF PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 2.60 884.00
WITH MARTY BURTON (ATTORNEY FOR CHARLOTTE COUNTY)
AND OPC ATTORNEY SAYLER; RESEARCH AND REVISE
PRE-HEARING STATEMENT; FURTHER CORRESPONDENCE
WITH CLIENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS




F.E.l.#59-2783536

LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

{850) 877-6555

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #:

47723 ' PAGE

PLEASE
WHENR

REFER 'Ié) INVOICE NUMBER

EMITTIN

5/16/12 MSF

5/17/12 MSF

5/18/12 MSF

5/21/12 MSF
5/22/12 MSF

5/28/12 MSF

5/30/12 MSF

5/31/12 MSF

AQUILINO WHO TELEPHONED
REVIEW, RESEARCH AND REVISE PRE-HEARING STATEMENT

“AND LETTER TO COMPANY CONCERNING SAME: REVIEW AND

COMMENT UPON MR. WILSON CHANGES IN POSITIONS;
MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR.
WILSON REGARDING NEW POSITIONS:; CORRESPONDENCE
WITH MR. SEIDMAN AND COMPANY REGARDING SAME’
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL
WITH COUNTY ATTORNEY BURTON AND OPC ATTORNEY

"SAYLER; LETTER TO CLIENT; CONTINUING

CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPC, COUNTY AND COMPANY;
SEVERAL TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH MS AQUILINO
RESEARCH AND FINALIZE PRE-HEARING STATEMENT
INCLUDING CORRESPONDENCE WITH COUNTY AND OPC AND
COMPANY; LETTER TO CLIENT REGARDING OPC AND
COUNTY PRE-HEARING STATEMENTS '

TRAVEL TGO PORT CHARLOTTE AND ATTEND PRE-HEARING ~

CONFERENCE; ATTEND CUSTOMER MEETING
RETURN FROM CHARLOTTE COUNTY TO LAKE MARY OFFICE:
LETTER TO CLIENT REGARDING PRE-HEARING
CONFERENCE AND CUSTOMER MEETING
REVIEW, RESEARCH AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE
FROM MR. SEIDMAN
REVIEW DRAFT OF PREFILED TESTIMONY OF MR. SEIDMAN
AND OUTLINE FOR MR. FLYNN; PREPARE FOR AND
PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH MR. FLYNN AND
MR. SEIDMAN IN PREPARATION OF PRE-FILED
TESTIMONY; BEGIN PREPARATION OF PRE-FILED
TESTIMONY FOR MR. FLYNN AND LETTER TO MR. FLYNN
REVIEW PSC TRANSFER ORDER AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH
MR. FLYNN AND MR. SEIDMAN REGARDING PRE-FILED
TESTIMONY

TOTAL HOURS

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 10,710.00

1.60

3.20

1.20

8.10
3.40

.30
1.40

.40

31.50

544.00

1,088.00

408.00

2,754.00
1,156.00

102.00
476.00

136.00




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
F.E.I.#59-27835356 (850) 877-6555 SVLHEQ‘ISEER&{:TEI'!RN? INVOICE NUMBER
UTILITIES, INC
Invoice #: 47723 PAGE 3
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN 31.50 10,710.00
PHOTQOCOPIES 11.75
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $11.75

TOTAL STATEMENT

$10,721.75

S ST S




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.|.# 59-2783538 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER .
2335 SANDERS RD JUNE 15, 2012

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 47723
FILE # 30057-00196

MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 10,710.00
CURRENT wss o 178
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: $10,721.75
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: | $ 2,861.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 13,582.75
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LAW OFFICES -ERELEIVED
SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP 6
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR J UL 1 2012
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
F.E.L#59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFéR TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING
Bat \: y )
UTILITIES, INC ch kﬁegj
ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD JULY 11, 2012 Doc_ A
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 (E;f) INVOICE # 47957
FILE # 30057-00196
PAGE 1
MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
' CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN
6/01/12 MSF PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL .60 204.00
WITH ATTORNEYS BURTON AND SAYLER

6/04/12 MSF  PREPARATION OF EXHIBIT AND LETTER TG MS. 1.60 544 .00

AQUILINO; PREPARE DRAFT OF PRE-FILED TESTIMONY OF
MS. AQUILINO AND LETTER TO MS. AQUILINO
6/08/12 MSF CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEYS BURTON AND SAYLOR .40 136.00
AND MR. SEIDMAN REGARDING I&I; REVIEW AND COMMENT
UPON OPC AMENDED PRE-TRIAL STATEMENT

6/09/12 MSF  BEGIN RESEARCH AND DRAFT INTERROGATORIES TO OPC .50 170.00
ON "AFFORDABILITY" ISSUE ' ’
6/10/12 MSF REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM MR. .30 102.00

SEIDMAN ON "AFFORDABILITY" ISSUE; REVIEW LETTER
FROM MR. DURHAM; LETTER TO WITNESSES REGARDING
PRE-FILED TESTIMONY.

6/11/12 MSF  REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON REVISED PREFILED 3.30 1,122.00
TESTIMONY OF MR. SEIDMAN; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR.
SEIDMAN REGARDING HIS TESTIMONY; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH AND LETTER TO MS. AQUILINO
REGARDING HER PRE-FILED TESTIMONY; REVIEW
COUNTY'S AMENDED PRE-HEARING STATEMENT AND LETTER
TO CLIENT CONCERNING SAME; REVIEW AND FINALIZE
MS. AQUILINO'S PRE-FILED TESTIMONY

6/15/12 MSF REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON PRE-FILED TESTIMONY AND .40 136.00
EXHIBITS OF MR. FLYNN

6/16/12 MSF FINALIZE PRE-FILED TESTIMONY FOR E FILING AND .60 204 .00
MAILING TO HEARING OFFICER

6/26/12 MSF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY BURTON WHO .20 68.00
TELEPHONED AND LETTER TO MR. SEIDMAN
TOTAL HOURS 7.90

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 2,686.00




LAW OFFICES
SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
F.E.I.#59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 %Eé\ﬁ%é&ﬁﬁrlmg INVOICE NUMBER
UTILITIES, INC
Invoice #: 47957 PAGE 2
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN 7.90 2,686.00
TRAVEL EXPENSE 364 .81
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 364.81

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 3.050.81

1900
200009, MNM.00901




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
F.E.L# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER :
2335 SANDERS RD JULY 11, 2012
NORTHBROOK. IL 60062 INVOICE # 47957

FILE # 30057-00196

MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 2,686.00
CURRENT™COSTS: e $364.8] e
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: $ 3.050.81
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ 10,721.75

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 13,772.56
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' K LAW OFFICES
SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP AUG 14 201
2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
FEL#59-2783535 . (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

Batch \%(CO\ O\
UTILITIES. INC
ATTN:  JOHN STOVER D"cﬂm

2335 SANDERS RD AUGUST 10, 2012

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 48196
FILE # 30057-00196
PAGE 1

MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN

7/05/12 MSF  CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR. FLYNN AND MR. SEIDMAN AND .40 136.00
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. FLYNN REGARDING
CONFERENCE WITH COUNTY CONSULTANTS ON U&U;

7/06/12 MSF  REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM AND TO .40 136.00

: MR. FLYNN AND MR. SEIDMAN REGARDING U&U

7/13/12 MSF CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY BURTON; REVIEW AND .30 102.00
RESPOND TO LETTER FROM MR. FLYNN

7/16/12 MSF CORRESPONDENCE WITH MS. AQUILINO REGARDING 1.70 578.00

NOTICING; REVIEW AND FORWARD CORRESPONDENCE_FROM _
OPC; REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON COUNTY'S PRE-FILED
TESTIMONY; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND CORRESPONDENCE
REGARDING SCHEDULING
7/23/12 MSF SEVERAL LETTERS TO MS. AQUILINO REGARDING .30 102.00
NOTICING AND HER PRE-FILED REBUTTAL; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MS. AQUILINO WHO TELEPHONED

7/25/12 MSF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MS. AQUILINO AND TO ATTORNEY .20 68.00
BURTON REGARDING NOTICING

7/28/12 MSF REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON PRE-FILED REBUTTAL 1.10 374.00
TESTIMONY OF MR. SEIDMAN

7/29/12 MSF REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON REVISED PRE-FILED .30 102.00

TESTIMONY OF MR. SEIDMAN; REVIEW MR. SEIDMAN'S

CORRECTIONS TO PRE-FILED DIRECT TESTIMONY
7/30/12 MSF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. AQUILINO WHO .30 102.00
TELEPHONED TO DISCUSS HER PRE-FILED REBUTTAL
TESTIMONY; REVIEW AND DRAFT RESPONSE

TOTAL HOURS 5.00
"PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 1,700.00




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

F.E.L.#59-2783535 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice #: 48196 PAGE 2
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN 5.00 1,700.00

OPERATOR CONFERENCE CALL 52.22

PHOTOCOPIES 5.75

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 57.97

TOTAL STATEMENT

7 5\ 003, 290 0070/




r " LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
F.EL#50-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER
2335 SANDERS RD AUGUST 18, 2012
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 48196

FILE # 30057-00196

MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN

CURRENT INVOICE SUMMARY

SUMMARY OF CHARGES RENDERED ON THIS INVOICE:

CURRENT FEES: $ 1,700.00
CURRENT COSTS:  $57.97
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS INVOICE: ©$1.,757.97
OUTSTANDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE: $ 3,050.81

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE THIS MATTER: $ 4,808.78




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLARSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

- {i 877-855: PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
F.E.L# 59-2783536 {850} 877 5 AT REERG

UTILITIES, INC
ATTN: JOHN STOVER

2335 SANDERS RD SEPTEMBER 12, 2012

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 INVOICE # 49407
FILE # 30057-00196
PAGE 1

MATTER: SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE
CAP PROJECT NO. 2011005
2011 R/C SANDALHAVEN

8/03/12 MSF REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON MR, SEIDMAN'S REVISED .30 102,00
PRE-FILED REBUTTAL TESTIMONY

8/06/12 MSF REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM .20 68.00
ATTORNEYS BURTON AND SAYLOR REGARDING PROCEDURAL
MATTERS

8/07/12 MSF CONTINUE REVIEW AND REDRAFT OF MS., AQUILINO'S 1.70 578.00

PRE-FILED REBUTTAL AND LETTER TO MR. SEIDMAN
CONCERNING SAME; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR. FLYNN,
MS..AQUILINO AND MR. SEIDMAN REGARDING PRE-FILE _ e =
REBUTTAL TESTIMONY; REVIEW CUSTOMER COMPLAINTS;
NUMERQUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MS. AQUILINO;
REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON CHANGES TO MR. SEIDMAN'S
PRE-FILED REBUTTAL

8/08/12 MSF CONTINUE TO WORK WITH MS. AQUILINO ON PRE-FILED .90 306.00
TESTIMONY; REVIEW COMMENTS FROM MR, SEIDMAN;
CONFERENCE CALL WITH MR. SEIDMAN AND MS. AQUILINO

8/09/12 MSF CONTINUE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND CORRESPONDENCE 2.10 714.00
WITH MS. AQUILINO, MR. SEIDMAN AND MR. FLYNN
REGARDING PR-FILED REBUTTAL TESTIMONY; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH MR. LUBERTOZZI;

8/10/12 MSF REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON MR, FLYNN'S PRE-FILED 1.30 442.00
REBUTTAL TESTIMONY; REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON
REVISIONS TO MR. SEIDMAN'S PRE-FILED REBUTTAL
TESTIMONY; LETTER TO PARTIES

8/13/12 MSF PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL 1.30 442.00
WITH ATTORNEYS BURTON AND SAYLOR REGARDING
PROCEDURAL MATTERS; DRAFT AFFICAVIT OF MAILING
AND LETTER TO MS. AQUILINO; CORRESPONDENCE WITH
ATTORNEYS BURTON AND SAYLOR

8/15/12 MSF REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON PROPOSED STIPULATIONS;
REVIEW AND COMMENT UPCON PROPOSED EXHIBIT LIST;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR FLYNN; MISCELLANECUS

476.00

b=
w
o




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLARASSEE, FLORIDA 32301

A ’ 776555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
F.E.I.# 59-2783536 (850) 8 P REERNG

UTILITIES, INC

Invoice i#: 48407 PAGE 2

CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEYS BURTON
8/16/12 MSF MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE WITE ATTORMNEYS 1.10 374.00
BURTON AND SAYLOR REGARDING STIPULATIONS AND )
PROCEDURE FOR HEARING; BEGIN MISCELLANEOUS TRIAL
PREPARATION
8/17/12 MSF CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY BURTON AND MR. FLYNN 1.20 408.00
REGARDING COUNTY'S PROPOSED SURREBUTTAL
TESTIMONY; CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEYS SAYLOR
AND BURTON REGARDING STIPULATIONS; GENERAL TRIAL
PREPARATION; REVIEW FINAL STIPULATIONS AND LETTER
TO CLIENT
8/18/12 MSF REVIEW CORRESPCONDEMCE FROM ATTORNEYS SAYLOR AND .90 306,00
BURTON REGARDING STIPULATIONS THAT WERE IN
QUARANTINE FILE; LETTER TO AND RESPONSE FROM MR,
FLYNN; REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM MR. SEIDMAN AND
LETTER TO MS. AQUILINO; OBTAIN ADDITION -
DOCUMENTATION FOR REVISED EXHIBIT
8/20/12 MSF CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY SAYLOR REGARDING 3.40 1,156.00
TELEPHONIC TESTIMONY AND WITH ATTORNEY BURTON
REGARDING PRE-FILED SURREBUTTAL; TRIAL
PREPARATION; REVIEW TESTIMONY OF MS. BROWN AND
LETTER TO MR. FLYNN; REVIEW TESTIMONY OF MR.
EVETTS AND LETTER TO MR. FLYNN CONCERNING SAME.
LETTER TO ATTORNEY BURTON ’
8/21/12 MSF TRIAL PREPARATION INCLUDING CONFERENCES WITH MS. 5.60 1,904.00
AQUILINO, AND MR, FLYNN ; CORRESPONDENCE WITH
ATTORNEY SAYLOR AND BURTON; TRAVEL TO PORT
CHARLOTTE AND CONFERENCE WITH MR. SEIDMAN;

8/22/12 MSF CONFERENCE WITH MR. SEIDMAN, MR. FLYNMN AND MS. 8.00 2,720.00
AQUILINO AND PREPARATION; ATTEND TWO CUSTOMER
HEARINGS

87/23/12 MSF TRIAL AND RETURN TO LAKE MARY OFFICE 12.20 4,148.00

8/25/12 MSF REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON PROPCSED RATE CASE .20 68.00
EXPENSE AFFIDAVITS

8/26/12 MSF REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE FROM THE .30 102.00

HEARING CFFICER REGARDING SCHEDULE; LETTER TO
CLIENT REPRESENTATIVES REGARDING ISSUES
8/27/12 MSF CORRESFONDENCE WITH ATTORNEYS SAYLOR AND BURTCHN; .50 170.00
RESEARCH AND DRAFT PROPOSED RECOMMENDED CRDER
FORMAT AND LETTER TO ATTORNEYS BURTON AND SAYLOR




LAW OFFICES

SUNDSTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP

2548 BLAIRSTONE PINES DR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32301
F.E.i# 59-2783536 (850) 877-6555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING
UTILITIES, INC
Invoice #%: 48407 PAGE 3
8/28/12 MSF REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR. SEIDMAN AND MS. .20 68.00

AQUILINO; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE
FROM ATTORNEY SAYLOR

TOTAL HOURS 42.80
PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 14,552.00
MARTIN S FRIEDMAN 42.80 14,552.00
PHOTOCOPIES .377.00
FEDERAL EXPRESS 12.71
TRAVEL EXPENSE 1,271.97
TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED $ 1,661.68

TOTAL STATEMENT $ 16,213.68




WebTime Query Report

0003 - MARTIN S FRIEDMAN . ' 09/25/2012
Date Client Client Name Matter Matter Description SM/Task Service Hours Rate
09/07/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 0.30 A
CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR. SEIDMAN AND REVIEW SCHEDULES; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR. LUBERTOQZZ!
Date Total (09/07/2012): 0.30
09/08/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 0.40 A
CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR. SEIDMAN [N PREPARATION OF PRO; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. SEIDMAN
Date Total (09/08/2012): R ' 0.40
| i
09/10/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 1.30 A
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH SANDALHAVEN REPRESENTATIVE TO DISCUSS PROPOSED RECOMMENDED ORDER
Date Total {09/10/2012): : o T B 1.30
09/15/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 470 A
REVIEW TRANSCRIPT AND BEGIN RESEARCH AND DRAFT OF PROPOSED RECOMMENDED ORDER
Date Total (09/15/2012): . 4.70
09/16/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 580 A
CONTINUE REVIEW TRANSCRIPT AND RESEARCH AND DRAFT OF PROPOSED RECOMMENDED ORDER
Date Total (09/16/2012): ‘ : e S : _ 5.80
09/17/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 0.20 A
REVIEW AND INCORPORATE INITIAL COMMENTS FROM MR. SEIDMAN ON WHAT HAS BEEN DRAFT THUS FAR; LETTER TO MR. SEIDMAN
Date Total (09/17/2012): : 0.20
09/22/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 470 A
CONTINUE RESEARCH AND DRAFT OF PROPOSED RECOMMENDED ORDER
Date Total {09/22/2012): 4.70
09/23/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 410 A

Page 1




WebTime Query Report

0003 - MARTIN S FRIEDMAN

09/25/2012

Date Client Client Name Matter Matter Description SM/Task Service Hours Rate

CONTIN\l}JIE RESEARCH AND DRAFT OF PROPOSED RECOMMENDED ORDER; LETTER TO MS. AQUILINO AND OTHERS WITH DRAFT (WITHOUT QUALITY
OF SERVICE)

Date Total (09/23/2012): 4.10

09/24/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 - 470 A
RESEARCH AND DRAFT QUALITY OF SERVICE ARGUMENT; REVIEW AND INCORPORATE COMMENTS FROM MR. SEIDMAN AND MR. FLYNN

Date Total (09/24/2012): S ‘ 470
!

09/25/2012 30057  UTILITIES, INC 196 SANDALHAVEN 2011 RATE CASE 10000 2.30 A
FINAL REVIEW AND EDITING OF PROPOSED RECOMMENDED ORDER; CORRESPONDENCE WITH MR. SEIDMAN; COMPILE RATE CASE EXPENSE
DOCUMENTATION

Date Total (09/25/2012): 2.30

; Report Totals: 28.50

#9440

Page 2




18444 Lost Lake Way
Jupiter, FL 33458
Phone or Fax (561) 743-9510
e-mail: frankdenjup@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 03/10/11
21100.10
CONSULTING - EAGLE RIDGE U&U, TYE 12/2010 ({ER}
SANLANDO U&U, TYE 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR U&U, TYE 12/2010 {LAB}
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 {SAND)

PREVIOUS BALANCE $  0.00
Week of: HOURS
02/07/11 FS CONSULTING - ALL 2ﬁ3ﬁofin\dﬁab0“00
DEVELOP CASE HISTORIES 3.00 450,00
02/14/11 FS CONSULTING - ER
 UsU & “F” SCHEDULES 9.00  1350.00
02/21/11 FS CONSULTING - ER
U&U & “F* SCHEDULES 2.00 300.00
02/28/10 FS CONSULTING - i } ;
UsU & “F* SCHEDULES 3.00° 450,00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 17.00 § 2550.00
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
03/10/11 PAYMENT, as of - 00.00
BALANCE DUE $ 2550.00

NOTE: "ALL” -~ ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.

2110 O5nes, @ =0l $H72.C0 Sandingven




18444 Lost Lake Way
Jupiter, FL 33458
Phone or Fax (561} 743-9510
e-mail: frankdenjup@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 07/11/11
21100.10
CONSULTING —~ EAGLE RIDGE U&U, TYE 12/2010 (ER)
SANLANDO U&U, TYE . 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR U&U, TYE 12/2010 (LAB)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND)

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 4237.50
Week of: HOURS
06/01/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND
INPUT FOR MFR'S 00.25 37.50 %

06/01/11 FS CONSULTING - ER
SIGN OFF “F” SCHEDULES. 00.25 37.50

06/01/11 F§ CONSULTING - LAB
“F" SCHEDULES. . N ; . 00.25 37.50

06/06/11 FS CONSULTING - LAB
“F* SCHEDULES. 00.50 75.00

06/13/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE MFR’S 26.00 3900.00 °®

06/20/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND

PREPARE MFR'S 30.00 4500.00 ¢
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 57.25 $ 8587.50
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
06/01/11 PAYMENT - 2137.50
07/06/11 PAYMENT - 2100.00
BALANCE DUE $ 8587.50

NOTE: “ALL” ~ ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.

025
2 00
20.00 . e
e 1oNG. & 135Dy S%Zﬂ' S0 Spndal!




18444 Lost Lake Way
Jupiter, FL 33458
Phone or Fax (561) 743-3510
e-mail: frankdenjup@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 08/1/11
21100.10
CONSULTING - EAGLE RIDGE UsU, TYE 12/2010 (ER)
" SANLANDO UsU, TYE 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR U&U, TYE 12/2010 (LAB)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND)

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 8587.50
Week of: HOURS
04/14/11 FS CONSULTING - SAN
U&U & “F* SCHEDULES (CORRECTION) (2.00) (300.00)

05/23/11 FS CONSULTING - ER
U&U & “F” SCHEDULES (CORRECTION,
NOT PREVIOQUSLY BILLED} 4.00 600.00

07/04/11 FS CONSULTING. - SAND .. - -
PREPARE MFR’S 4.00 600.00 »

07/11/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE MFR’S 7.00 1050.00 »

07/18/11 FS CONSULTING -~ SAND
PREPARE MFR'S 14.00 2100.00 ¢

07/25/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND

PREPARE MFR'S 3.00 450.00 ¢
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 30.00 $ 4500.00
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
07/27/11 PAYMENT - 8587.50
BALANCE DUE $ 4500.00

‘'NOTE: “ALL” - ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.

Hod
7.00
(4. DO
2.00

26 6015 @ 150Mr. 4002 Sandalhaer)




18444 Lost Lake Way
Jupiter, FL 33458
Phone or Fax (561) 743-9510
e-mail; frankdenjup@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consultants, inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYARLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 09/712/11
21100.10
CONSULTING - EAGLE RIDGE U&U, TYE 12/2010 (ER}
SANLANDOC U&U, TYE 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR U&U, TYE 12/2010 {(LAB)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND)

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 4500.00
Week of: HOURS
08/1/11 FS CONSULTING -~ SAND
PREPARE MFRs 2.00 300.00 +
08/8/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE MFR'S 9.00 1350.00 2
08/15/11 ¥S CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE MFR’S 8.00 1200.00
08/22/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND T
PREPARE MFR'S 19.00 2850.00 <
08/29/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE MFR'’S 9.00 1350.00 ¢
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 47.00 ¢ 7050.00
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
08/16/11 PAYMENT ~ 4500.00
BALANCE DUE $ 7050.00

NOTE: "ALL” ~ ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.

2.0
90
A.0
\a.0
O]D

7.0
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18444 Lost Lake Way
Jupiter, FLL 33458
Phone or Fax (561) 743-9510
e-mail: frankdenjup@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 10/13/11
21100.10
CONSULTING — EAGLE RIDGE U&U, TYE 12/2010 (ER)
SANLANDO U&U, TYE 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR U&U, TYE 12/2010 (LAB)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND)

PREVIOUS BALANCE § 7050.00
Week of: HOURS
09/1/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE MFRs 5.00 750.00
09/5/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE MFR’S 24.00 3600.00 *
09/12/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND . ,
PREPARE MFR'S 25.00  3750.00 °
09/19/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND -
PREPARE MFR’S 25.00 3750.00 ¢
09/19/11 PS CONSULTING - LAB
FINAL “F* SCHEDULES 1.50 225.00
09/26/11 FS CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE MFR’S 8.00 1200.00 ¢
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 88.50 $13275.00
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
10/13/11 PAYMENT, as of - 0.00
BALANCE DUE $20325.00

NOTE: “ALL” - ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.
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36 Yacht Club Dr. #403
North Palm Beach, FL 33408
Phone or Fax (561) 207-6083

e-mail: frankdenjup@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 03/06/12
21100.10
CONSULTING - EAGLE RIDGE U&U, TYE 12/2010 (ER)
SANLANDO U&U, TYE 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADCR U&U, TYE 12/2010 (LAB)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND)

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 675.00
Week of: HOURS
02/01/12 FS CONSULTING - ER
U&U RESEARCH. 1.00 150.00

02/06/12 FS CONSULTING - ER
CONFERENCE CALLS & PREP; PSC & UI. 2.75 412.50

02/27/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND
CONFERENCE CALL & PREP W/COUNTY RE

.. . LSSUES & PROCEDURES. - 2.00: 300.00
‘ FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 5.75 $ 862,50
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
01/04/12 PAYMENT - 675.00
BALANCE DUE $ 862.50

NOTE: “ALL” - ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.
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36 Yacht Club Dr. #403
North Palm Beach, FL 33408
Phone or Fax (561) 207-6083

e-mail: frankdenjup@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS RCAD
NORTHBROOK, 1L 60062 04/02/12
211C0.16
CONSULTING - EAGLE RIDGE U&U, TYE 12/2010 (ER)
SANLANDO U&U, TYE 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR U&U, TYE 12/2010 (LAB)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND)

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 862.50
Week of: HOURS
03/12/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND
REVIEW COUNTY PRELIM REPORT; PREPARE 3
DISCOVERY. 3.00 450.00
03/26/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND
ASSIST W/RESPONSE TO COUNTY INQUIRIES. 4.50 675.00 *
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 7.50° $ 1125.00
PAYMENTS .AND. CREDITS I L . e
03/30/12 PAYMENT ©. - _862.50

BALANCE DUE - $.1125.00
NOTE: “ALL” - ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.

%
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36 Yacht Club Dr. #403
North Palm Beach, FL 33408

Phone or Fax (561) 207-6083
e-mail; frankdenjup@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 05/07/12
21100.10
CONSULTING - EAGLE RIDGE U&U, TYE 12/2010 (ER)
SANLANDO U&U, TYE 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR U&U, TYE 12/2010 (LAB)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND)

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 1125.00
Week of: HOURS
04/02/12 FS CONSULTING -~ SAND
U&U BACKGROUND & SUPPORT FOR °
RESPONSE TO COUNTY PRELIM REPORT. 5.00 750.00

04/09/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND _
CRITIQUE OF COUNTY PRELIM U&U REPORT. 4.50 675.00 *

04/16/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND

CRITIQUE UPDATE. 2,00 300.00 °*
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 11.50 $ 1725.00
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
04/26/12 PAYMENT - 1125.00
BALANCE DUE $ 1725.00

NOTE: "ALL” - ALLOCATE 25% BACH SYSTEM.

s aundalhastn
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36 Yacht Club Dr. #403

North Palm Beach, FL. 33408 O\.b
Phone or Fax (561) 207-6083 Bmh_@,j_,___

e-mail: frankdenjup@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consuitants, Inc. Doc MQ—-

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

UTILITIES, INC.

2335 SANDERS ROAD

NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 06/13/12
i 21100.10

CONSULTING - EAGLE RIDGE U&U, TYE 12/2010 (ER)
SANLANDO D&U, TYE 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR U&U, TYE 12/2010 (LAB)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND)

PREVIQUS BALANCE $ 1725.00

Week of: HOURS

05/67/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND i
CONF.CALLS W/FRIEDMAN, FLYNN AND
COUNTY,OPC & UTILITY, incl PREP. !
DEVELOP POSITION FOR PREHEARING :
STATEMENT. 5.25 787.50

05/21/12 ¥S CONSULTING ~ SAND e )
RESEARCH EWD AND OP. PERMIT. 0.50 75.00

05/21/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND
DRAFT DIRECT TESTIMONY: DRAFT OUTLINE
FOR FLYNN; CONF. CALL W/FRIEDMAN,

FLYNN. 4.00 0 -
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 9.75 ¢$ 1462.50 gi

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
06/09/12 PAYMENT - 1725.00
BALANCE DUE $ 1462.50

NOTE: “ALL” - ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.

200005 72910 .0pA101




36 Yacht Club Dr. #403

North Palm Beach, FL 33408

Phone or Fax (561) 207-6083 Bag .
e-mail: frankdenjup@att.net ch ' CZ%

Management & Regulatory Consultants, Inc. Dg, %

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS ROAD
NORTHBROOK, IL 60062 08/06/12
21100.10
CONSULTING - EAGLE RIDGE UsU, TYE 12/2010 {ER)
SANLANDO U&U, TYE 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR Us&U, TYE 12/2010 (LAB) 6\
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND) ElLi

PREVIOUS BALANCE $ 1462.50
Week of: ) HOURS
06/11/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND .
REVIEW & COMMENT - FLYNN DIRECT TEST. 1.00 150.00

07/03/12 ¥S CONSULTING - SAND
CONF. CALL W/WOODCOCK, WILSON, FLYNN
RE U&U STIPLULATION. 0.75 112.50

07/16/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND __ -
REVIEW COUNTY DIRECT TEST., PREPARE

REBUTTAL TESTIMONY. 22.00 3300.00

07/23/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE REBUTTAL TESTIMONY. 17.00 2550.00

07/30/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND
PREPARE REBUTTAL TESTIMONY. 7.00 1050.00
FPOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 47.75 $ 7162.50

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
07/27/12 PAYMENT = g
BALANCE DUE $ 7162.50

NOTE: “ALL” - ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.




36 Yacht Clob Br. #403
North Palm.Beach, FL 33408
Phone or Fax (561)207-6083

e-mail: frankdenjup@att.riet

Management & Regulatory Gonsultants, inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTTLITIES, ING

2335 SANDERS ROAD:
NORTHBROOK, IL 60082

TONSDETING - EAGLE RIDGE U&U, TYE 12/2010 (ER)

Welek of
08/01/12

U8106/12

Dg/T3/12

(8/207%2 |

08/27/12

EXPENSES
B/21712
B/23/12
B/24/12
8/24/12

Fs

FS

ES

SANLANDG Usll, T¥E 12/2010 (SAN)
LABRADOR U, ¥YE 12/2010 (LAB)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 (SAND)

PREVIOUS SALANCE

CONSPLTING = SAND

PREPARE REBUTTAL TESTIMONY.

CONSULTING -~ SAND
PREPARE _REBD
REVIEW OF PR

TESTIMONY INCE.
HOUILING.

CONSULTING ~ $
: ASSEMBLE

CDNSULTING-— -SAND

PREBARE FOR, ATTEND, AND
TESTIEY BT HEARINGS, INCL, TRAVEL.

CONSULTING
§ & INPUT EGR “PRO™,
FQR,CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

~ Meal

Lodging

- TPravel, Rentazl car
Travel, Fuel

PRYMENTS AND CREDITS
09/04/12 PAYMENT

BALANCE DUE

NOTE: “ALL” — ALLOCATE 25% EAGH SYSTEM.

08/04/12
21100.10
§ T182.50
HOURS
5.00 7510, 00
850 1275.00
4.50 635. 00
24 .08 F600.00
5.58 825.00
47.50 $ 7125.00
5  5.69
219.76.
164.18
$436.57
- 7162.50
$ 7561.3




36 Yacht Club Dr. #403
North Palm Beach, FL 33408
.Phone or Fax (561).207-6083
e=maik: frarikdenjup@att net -

Management & Regulatory Consultants, inc.

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
UTILITIES, INC.
2335 SANDERS.ROAD _
NORTHBROOR, IL 60062 09/28/12
21100.10
CONSULTING - EAGLE RIDGE U&ly, TYE 12/2010 (ERY
SANLANDC UsU, TYE 1272010 (SAN) .
LABRADOR U&U,. TYE 12/2016 (LAR)
SANDALHAVEN M&R, TYE 2010 [SAND)

PREVIOUS ‘BALANCE $ 71561.57
HOURE

CONSULTING ~ SAND :
ASSIST W/PRC; TEL. CONF. RE PRO. 2.50 373.00

09/10/12 FS CONSULTING - SANE » i
: ASSTIST W/BRO. 2.00 300,00

B4/177/12 FS CONSULTING - SAND:
‘ ASSIST W/BRO: -4.,00 600,00

09/24/12 FS CONSULTING ~ ‘SAND-

-~ ASSIBT W/PRO:. - ~.4.25 637,50
FOR ‘CURRENT :SERVICES RENDERED 12,75 $-1912.50

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS
09/28/12. 'PAYMENT, as of - 0.,0¢C
' BALANGE DUE $ 9474.07

NOTE: “ALL’ - ALLOCATE 25% EACH SYSTEM.
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Infosend

4240 E, La Palma Avenue
Anzheim, CA 92807-1816
Phone: 714.993.2690 » Fax:714.993.1306 AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.

o,
~

INVO'C E 4N6/2012 58246

]'lIU"I"I‘lll”ll"ll"illll"ll'Illll'lllllllll”'ll'lll’l[

ATTN: Adrienne Krugler
UTILITIES, INC INFOSEND, INC -
2335 Sanders Road 4240 E. La Palma Ave.
Northbrook, IL 60062 - : Anaheim, CA 92807-1816
[J cHECK 20X FOR MARING ADDRESS CHANGE. PLEASE INICATE CHANGES ON THE REVERSE SIDE. PLEASE DETACH AND-RETURN UPPER SECTION WITH PAYMENT
T 20 Lo s Aveve TERMS | DUE DATE PO¥ - ACCOUNT # INVOIGE
Anshei, CA 52807-1816
mf?ég. ere Fom A NET30 | 5172012 2966 58246
DATE DESCRIPTION Qty RATE AMOUNT
04/05/12 | UTLO406A : Letter Postage (Level-1 Sort) (519 Mailpieces) 1 207.10 207.10
UTL0406A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(2 Pages: 1 Accts) 1 0.404 0.40
UTLO406A : Letter Postage (Non Bar-Ceded) ul - 0.45 495
UTLO406A : Address Update .16 0.25 4.00
UTLO0406A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 532§ 0.0465 24,74
UTLO406A : Paper Stock ' 5324~ 0.0122 6.49
UTLO406A : UT1# 10 Outgoing Envelope. .. . bo- =S - - 00142 7.54 e
UTLO406A : # 9 Retum Envelope 5154, 0.0121 6.23
UTLO4G6A : UTI LETTERS 993.PDF '
04/09112 | UTF0406A : Statement Postage (Level-2 Sorl) 2 0.404 10.10
UTF0406A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(2 Pages: 1 Accts) i 0.404 0.40
UTF0406A : Address Update 2 0.25 0.50
UTF0406A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 27 0.0465 1.26
UTFQ406A : Paper Stock 2717 0.0122 0.33
UTFC406A : UTT # 10 Outgoing Envelope 26 0.0142 0.37
UTF0406A : # 9 Return Envelope 19 0.0121 023
@ UTF0406A : UTL.STMT.1014B.PDF
04/09/12 | UTF0406B : Statement Postage (Levet-2 Son) 38 0.404 15.35
UTF0406B : Multiple Page Statement Postage(3 Pages: ! Accts) ! 0.404 0.40
UTF0406B : Address Update ) 0.25 0.25
UTF0406B : Data Processing/Msil Prep Services 41 0.0465 1.5}
UTF0406B : Paper Stock 411~ 0.0122 0.50
UTF0406B : UT! # 10 Outgoing Envelope 39 0.0142 0.55
¢ UTF0406B ; # 9 Retumn Envelope 32 0.0i21 0.39
&) |UTP0406B : UTL.STMT.1014A.PDF
04/09/t2 | UTI0406A : Statement Postage (Level-1 Son) (5822 Mailpieces) 1 2,099.70 2,099.70
UTI0406A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(47 Pages: 20 Accls) | 8.976 8.98
UTI0406A : Statement Postsge (Non Bar-Coded) 55 0.45 24.75
UTI0406A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 19 0.446 3.47
UTI0406A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 2 0.646 1.29
UTIO406A. : Address Update 60 0.25 15.00
UTI10406A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services o 5,924 0.0465 275.47
UTI0406A : Paper Stock 5,924 .~ 0.0122 72.27
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS
Page 1 Total
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infosen

BitlPrint eBila, Owivnsig.

4240 E. La Palma Avenue
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816
Phone: 714.993.2690 - Fax:714.993.1306

AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.
INVO|CE 4/1672012 58246

CUSTOME!

]llllllllllllllllllllI".Il"l“ll'l'""!“lll‘“l”l"llll”

ATTN: Adrienne Krugler

UTILITIES, INC INFOSEND. INC
2335 Sanders Road 4240 E. La Palma Ave,
Northbrook, IL 60062 Anaheim, CA 92807-1816
[ cHECK BOX FOR MAILING ADDRESS CHANGE. PLEASE INDICATE CHANGES ON THE REVERSE SIOE. PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN UPPER SECTION WITH PAYMENT
poinbetely
7T e a240E Lapaima venue TERMS | DUE DATE P.O# ACCOUNT # INVOICE
INfosena mmcressmams -‘ »
BAPI et Drierrd.  Fax: 714.993,1306 NET 30 5/1112012 2966 58246
DATE DESCRIPTION QTY ) RATE AMOUNT
UTI0406A : Large Flat Envelope 1} 0.15 0.15
UTIB406A : UTI # 10 Outgoing Envelope - 53896 0.0142 83.72
@ UTI0406A : # 9 Return Envelope 48761 0.0121 59.00
LUTI0406A : UTLSTMY.1014B.PDF . 8 L
04/09/12  UTI0406B : Statcment Postage (Level-1 Sort) (5728 Mailpieces) 2,059.86 2,059.86
|- - - UTI0406B + Multiple Page Statement Postage(57 Pages: 24 Accts). - - . 9696 ... 970 %
UTI04068 : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 045 2430
UTI0406B: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 0.446 392
UTIO406B: Forgign Meil Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 0.646 0.65
UT10406B : Address Update 0.25 12.00
UTIC406B : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 0.0465 27151
UTI0406B : Paper Stock 0.0122 71.24
UTI0406B : UTT # 10 Outgoing Envclope 0.0142 82.45
UTT0406B : # 9 Return Envelope 0.0121 57.63
UTI0406B : UTL.STMT.1014A PDF
04/10/12 UTLO409A : Letter Postage (Level-2 Sort) 115 0.404 46.46
UTLO409A ; Multiple Page Statement Postage(2 Pages: 1 Accts) t 0.404 0.40
UTLQ409A ; Letter Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 1 0.45 045
UTLO409A ; Address Update 25 025 6.25
UTLO0409A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Serviees 118 0,0465 5.49
UTL0409A : Paper Stock 118} 0.0122 1.44
UTLO0409A ; UT1 # 10 Outgoing Envelope 117 0.0142 1.66
UTLO409A : # 9 Refurn Envelope 106 0.0121 ’ 1.28
UTLO409A : UTI LETTERS 994 PDF
0471012 | UTNO409A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(1648 Pages: 824 Accts) 14~ 335.288 335291
UTNO409A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 334 0446 14.724
UTNO409A: Foreign Mail Additionat Postage-INTERNATIONAL 14 0.646 714~
UTNO409A : Address Update 187" 0.25 4.50.4—
_ UTNO409A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 1,648 0.0465 76.63-1—
UTNO409A : Paper Stock . 16887 0.0122 20.11 4~
UTNO409A : UT1 # 10 Dutgoing Envelope 8244~ 0.0142 11704~
UTNO409A : UTL.CVST.446A.PDF
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS
Page 2 Total




ey
%

infosend

BibPrint. eBits. Driyered.

4240 E. La Palma Avenue
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816
Phone: 714.993.2690 » Fax: 714.993.1306 AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.

INVOICE N 4716/2012 58246

CUSTOME

- T, -
“

'!l’"li!l"lllI"llllllllllllnulllIl”l“lll‘)l“,llll;l'”

ATTN: Adrienne Krugler

UTILITIES, INC INFOSEND, INC
2335 Sanders Road 4240 E. La Palma Ave.
Northbrook, IL 60062 Anaheim, CA 92807-1816
[ cHECK BOX FOR MAILING ADDRESS CHANGE. PLEASE INDICATE CHANGES ON THE REVERSE SIDE. PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN UPPER SECTION WITH PAYMENT
T T, ::::s: la g:)ma Avenue TERMS | DUE DATE PO# ACCOUNT # INVOICE
im, CA 92807-1816 : :

, Iﬂpré .se..Qg Pasiiergivoi NET30 | 5/17/2092 2966 58246
DATE DESCRIPTION Qry RATE AMOUNT
04/10/32 | UTF0409A : Statement Postage (Level-2 Sost) 0.404 4.44

UTFO0403A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(21 Pages: 7 Accls) '2.828 2.83
.| UTF0409A : Data Processing/Mai! Prep Services 0.0465 149
UTF0409A : Paper Stock 0.0122 0.39 .
UTFO0409A : UT1 # 10 Outgoing Envelope 0.0142 0.26
UTF0409A : # 9 Return Envelope : 0.0121 0.17.
’ UTF0409A ' UTLSTMT.101SFPDF -~ . T - - - [t MR T e
04/13/12 | UTT0409A : Statement Postage (Level-1 Sort) (4527 Mailpieces) 1) 1,628.03 1,628.03
UTI0409A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(4038 Pages: 1340 Accts) 1] 546.466 546.47
UTTO0409A : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 39 045 40.05
UTI0469A: Forcign Mai) Additional Postage-CANADA 58 0.446 25.87
UTI0409A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 2 0.646 129
UT10409A : Address Update 58 025 14.50
UTI0409A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 8,654 0.0465 402.41
UTI04C9A, : Paper Stock 8,654 | 0.0122 105.58
UTI0409A ¢ Large Flat Envelope 2 0.15 0.30
UTI0409A : UT} # 10 Outgoing Envelope 5,954 0.0142 84.55
UTI0409A : # 9 Return Envelope 5,036 0.0121 60.94
@ UTT0409A : UTLSTMT.10{5.PDF ..
04711712 | UTI0410A : Statement Postage (Level-] Sort) (803 Mailpieces) ) 31823 318.23
UT10410A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(139 Pages: 35 Accls) 1 17.428 17.43
UTIC410A : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 27 0.45 12.15
UTI0410A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 3 0.646 1.94
UTI0410A : Address Update 28 0.23 7.00
UTI0410A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 9691, 0.0465 45.06
UTI0410A : Paper Stock 969 0.0122 11.82
UTI0410A : Large Flat Envelope 3 0.15 0.45
UTI0410A : UT1# 10 Outgoing Envelops 862 0.0142 12.24
- UTI0410A : # 9 Return Envelope 712 0.0121 8.62
5 UTI0410A ; UTTL,.STMT.}016.PDF
04/11/12 UTLO4L0A : Letter Postage {Level-2 Sor) 435 0404 175.74
UTLO4 t0A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(2 Pages: 1 Accts) } 0.404 0.40
UTLO410A : Letter Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 9 043 4.05
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS
Page 3 Total
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infosend

DibFrint, aBMils. Dwliwiracd

4240 E. La Palma Avenue
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816

Phone: 714.993.2690 « Fax: 714.993.1306

AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.

INVOICE

:CUSTOMER:

ATTN: Adrienne Krugler
UTILITIES, INC

2335 Sanders Road
Northbrook, IL 60062

D CHECK 80X FOR MAILING ADDRESS CHANGE. PLEASE INDICATE CHANGES ON THE REVERSE BIDE.

58246

4/16/2012

!IlIl"lIllIlli'IlllDllllIlll”IllINI'"]"llllll"!lllllllll

INFOSEND, INC
4240 E. La Palma Ave.
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN UPPER SECTION WITH PAYMENT

e,
/77T 40 La paima vence TERMS | DUE DATE PO# AGCOUNT # INVOICE
infosend hmisn '
s sima triment Fax: 774,993.1306 NET30 | 51772012 2966 58246
DATE DESCRIPTION Qry RATE AMOUNT
UTLO0410A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 3 0.446 1.34
UTLO410A : Address Update 16 025 400
UTLOG410A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 446 0.0465 20.74
UTLO410A : Paper Stock a6 L 0.0122 5.44
UTLO410A ; UTI # 10 Outgoing Envelope 4as) - 0.0142 6.32
UTL0410A : # 9 Retum Envelope 432877 - 0.0121 5.23
¢+ - [YTLO410A-+ UT! LETTERS 995.PDF - - - - o
04/11/12  [UTNO410A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(2475 Pages: 825 Accts) 147 335,738 33574 J
""" ]UTNO430A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 3397 0446 4.2
UTNO410A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL np~ 0.646 7.1
UTNO410A : Address Update 15} 0.25 4,504
UTNO410A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 2,475¢" 0.0465. 115094772
UTNO410A : Paper Stock 24751 0.0122 302017
@ UTNG410A : UT} # 10 Oulgoing Envelope 8254 0.0142 11734
UTNO410A : UTI.CVST.446A.PDF
04/11/12 | UTF0410A : Statement Postage (Lcvel-2 Sort) 16 0,404 6.46
UTF0410A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(2474 Pages: 823 Accts) 1 333.872 333.87
UTFO410A: Foreign Mail Additions) Postage-CANADA 9 0.446 4,01
UTF0410A : Address Update 5 0.25 1.25
UTF0410A ; Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 2,490 0.0465 115.79
UTFO410A : Paper Stock 2,490 |~ 0.0122 30.38
. UTF0410A : UTI # 10 Outgoing Envelope 839 0.0142 11.91
UTF0410A : # 9 Retum Envelope 678 0.0121 8.20
/ 0 ) |UTF0410A : UTLSTMT. 1016.PDF
04712712 JUTIO411A : Statement Postage (Level-1 Sort) (479t Mailpieces) ] 1,716.43 1,716.43
UTI0411A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(90 Pages: 38 Accts) 1 15.444 15.44
UTI0411A ; Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) ' 74 0.45 3330
UTI0411A: Forcign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 32 0.446 1427
UTI0411A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 4 0.646 2.58
UTI0411A : Address Update 42 0.25 10.50
UTI041 1A : Data Processing/Mai) Prep Services 4,958 0.0465 230.41
UTI041 1A : Paper Stock 4,955 0.0822 60.45
UTI04) 1A : UTI # 10 Outgoing Envelope 4,903 0.0142 69.62
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS
Page 4
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BiliPrml. eBils. Dutivrcnd,

4240E. La Palma Avenue
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816
Phone: 714.993.2690 » Fax:714.993.1306

AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.

INVO!C E 4/16/2012 58246

ATTN: Adrienne Krugler Hahuahlbehhindoaboad bbbl Blasddnadi

UTILITIES, INC INFOSEND, INC
2335 Sanders Road 4240 E. L a PalmaAve.
Northbroak, iL 60062 Anaheim, CA 52807-1816
[] cHEGK BOX FOR MAIUING ADDRESS GHANGE. PLEASE INDICATE CHANGES ON THE REVERSE SIDE. PLEASE DETACHAND RETURN UPPER SECTION WITH PAYMENT
e
TS 240 Lapaima Aventie TERMS | DUE DATE P.O# ACCOUNT # INVOICE
infosend i
Bt w0 i Fax 714,993,1306 NET30 | 5172012 2966 58246
DATE PESCRIPTION Qary RATE AMOUNT
UTI04] 1A : # 9 Retorn Envelope 3,786 . 00121 45.81
_ {UTI04}1A : UTL.STMT.1017.PDF .
04/1212 | UTLO411A : Leiter Postage (Level-1 Sort) (1350 Maitpicces) .. . 50297 502.97
UTLO41A : Letter Postage (Non Bar-Coded) [ ¥3 - 045 540
UTLO41LA: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA ) P 0.446 045 o
UTLO411A : Address Update . _ .. . : R IS AR 025 7.00 i
UTLO411A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services . o362 .0.0463 63.33
UTLO411A : Paper Stock . 13621 +0,0122 16.62
UTLO411A : UTI # 10 Outgoing Envelope 1,36t} 0.0142 19.33
UTLO411A : # 9 Retum Envelope 1,351 0.0121 16.35
UTLO411A : UTI LETTERS 996 PDF
04/12/12 UTFD411A : Statement Postage (Level-1 Sort) (2691 Mailpieces) 1 957.04 957.04
UTFO411A : Multiple Page Staterent Postage(50 Pages: 19 Accls) 1 7676 7.68
UTFO411A : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 32 045 14.40
UTFO0411A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 7 0.446 3.12
UTFO411A : Address Update 33 0.25 8235
UTFQ411A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 2,173 0.0465 128.94
UTFO0411A ; Paper Stock 2,173 0.0122 33.83
UTFO411A : UT1# 10 Outgoing Envelope 2,742 0.0142 38.94
UTF0411A : # 9 Refumn Envelope 2,284 0.012) 27.64
UTFO411A : UTLSTMT.1017.PDF
04/12/32  [UTFO0412A : Statement Postage (Level-2 Sort) 431 : 0404 174.12
UTFO0412A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(8 Pages: 3 Accts) ] 1.212 121
UTFO412A : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 6 045 2.70
UTFO0412A : Address Update 5 0.25 1.25
UTFO412A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 445 0.0463 20.69
UTF0412A : Paper Stock 445 |~ 0.0122 543
UTFO04124 : UTJ # 10 Ouigoing Envelope 340 0.0142 6.25
UTFO412A : # 9 Return Envelope 360 0.012] 4.36
UTFO412A : UTL.STMT.1018.PDF
04713/12 TUTI0412A : Statement Postage (Level-1 Sort) (3241 Mailpieces) 1 1,227.81 1,222.81
UTI04124 : Multipte Page Statement Postage(1572 Pages: 780 Accts) I 315.12 315,12

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS

Page 5




f;:w\“
infosend

BillPrint. sBlls. Oclyarsd,

4240 E. La Palma Avenue
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816

Phone: 714.993.2690 « Fax:714.993.1306 AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.
lNVOI CE 4/16/2012 58246
CUSTOMER s ER - WAKE. ABLE

"llll"ll"llll”lll'l)lIHln'Hl!lll”l“"llll'""ll'""

ATTN: Adrienne Krugler

UTILITIES, INC INFOSEND, INC
2335 Sanders Road 4240 E. La Palma Ave.
Northbrook, IL 60062 Anaheim, CA 92807-1818
[ cHEcK BOX FOR MAILING ADDRESS CHANGS. PLEASE INDICATE CHANGES DN THE REVERSE SIDE. PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN UPPER SECTION WITH PAYMENT
ST e OE arai s TERMS | DUE DATE P.O# ACCOUNT# |  INVOIGE
Ansheim, CA 2807-1816
Phene: 714.993,2690
infosend s S Rp— —
DATE DESCRIPTION QTY RATE AMOUNT
UTI0412A : Staternent Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 54 0.45 24.30
UTI0412A: Forelgn Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 4 0.446 178
UTIO412A: Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 1 0546 ) 0.65 R
UTI0412A : Address Update 44 0.25] ° ) 11.00
-JUTIO412A : Data Processing/Mai) Prep Services 4,867 0.0465 T 22632
UTI0412A ; Paper Stock 4,867 (.~ 0.0122 L5938 |
- | UTID412A : UTL# 16 Outgoing Envelope - : T 40754 C 0.0142 C 5187
UTI04]2A : # 9 Retumn Envejope 3,236 0.012t AT
UTI0412A : UTELSTMT.1018.PDF = :
04/13/12 UTLG412A ; Letter Postage (Level-2 Sort) 366 0.404 147.86
UTLO412A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(2 Pages: | Accts) I 0.404 0.40
UTLO412A ; Letier Postage (Non Bar-Codcd) 3 0.45 1.35
UTL0412A ; Address Update 20 0.25 5.00
UTLO412A : Data Processing/Masil Prep Services 37 0.0465 17.25
UTL04(2A ; Paper Stock 37T 0.0122 4,53
UTLO412A: UTI# 10 Outgoing Envelope 370 0.0142 525
UTLO412A : # 9 Return Envelope 363 0.0121 4.39

UTLO412A : UT1 LETTERS 997.PDF

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS

Page 6 Total $17,098.79




Info Send Jendor # 3035654 . 5/ (‘{ (p [/4
Date 07.302012 Invoice # L ob>7 - H wrt
RT 385102 6070 $63.50
FOG 182233 5545 $139.99
NT 451100 5545 $210.58
FOG 182176} . 5545 $11.45 ‘\MM’\
FOG 182150] 5545 $B3.47 _
o 2011005 0 Sas133]* %W@“&K |
ov 385102] 6070 51,241.26] S
v 2011007 0 ' $372.71
RT 2012001 0 £1,178.28
FOG 187101 5545 $93.27
FOG 182218 $545 $301.81
FOG 182217 5545 - _sn2.04
FOG 2011077 0 $729.53
102105 5525 $432.25
102105 6050 , $1,647.50
102105 5535 $878.67
102105 5540 $13,447.58
Involce Total i 521,505.31]
prepared by Adrienne Krapler el
Approval Z
pate & oL
cv-cover sheets m Y
cee-consumer confidence reports ' .
rt-Rate Notice pis 07 i

at-notice
FOG-Fats, Olis and Grease




P
fosend

SiaPrint, vBiRa, Dalivered. |

4240 E. L a Palma Avehue
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816
Phone: 714.993,2690 » Fa)g{-*. 714.993.1306

AMOUNT PAID DATE | iNvoIcE No.

lNVOIC%E 7/30;2612 ~ V60637

ATTN: Adﬁmne Krug’er "IIIIll’l"ll'luilli"(ll“"I_ll]"il"’"lu’lll"’“'l"“‘
UTILITIES, INC INFOSEND, INC
2335 Sanders Road: 4240 E. La Palma Ave.
Northbrook, IL 60062 Angheim, CA 92807-1816
(] CHECK BOX FOR MAILING ADDRESS CHANGE. PUEASE INDICATE CHANGES ON THE REVERSE SIDE. PLEASE DETACHAND RETURN UPPER SECTION WITH PAYMENT
mﬁm kvuwdd TERMS } DUE DATE P.O# - ACCOUNT # INVOICE
sen :’ CA92807-183 : _ . '
quég. Aty NET20 | 8212012 2966 60637
DATE | DESCRIPTION o ary RATE | AMOUNT
UTF0720D : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 3,323 0.0465 154.52
UTFO720D : Paper Stock 3 3,323¢ 0.0122 40.54T7
UTFO720D : UT1 # 10 Oulgmng Envelope 1,963 0.0142 27877
UTFO720D : # 9 Retun Envélope 1,797 0.0121 “214T
@ UTF0720D : UTLSTMT.1091.PDF L
i
07/23/12 . UTF0720B : Statement e (Level-2 Sort)- - 15 Cee 0404} - - 606
UTF0720B : Multipte Page ent Postage(8 Pages: 4 Aocts) 1 1.616 162
UTF0720B : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 23 0.0465 C 107
UTFO0720B : Paper Stock | 3¢ 0.0122 0.28T
UTF0720B : UTI # 10 Outgojng Envelope 19 0.0142 0277
UTF0720B : # 9 Return Eavelope 17 0.0121 0.21T
@ UTF0720B : UTLSTMT.1092.PDF
0772312 {UTFOT20C : Statement Postabe (Level-2 Sort) 5 0.404 202
UTFO720C : Multiple Page Siatement Postage(61 Pages: 30 Accts) T 12,12 2.12
UTF0720C : Data Processingf/Mail Prep Services 66 0.0465 3.07
UTF0720C : Paper Stock L 66{— 0.0122 0.81T
UTF0720C : UTT # 10 Outgoing Envelope 35 0.0142 0.50T
UTF0720C : # 9 Refum Em/éope 34 0.0121 0.41T
UTF0720C : UTL.STMT.1093.PDF
072312 UTF0723B : Staiemetnt Posta“. e (Level-2 Sort) 10 0.404 4.04
UTFQ723B : Multiple Page S ent Postage(4 Pages: 2 Accts) 1 0.808 0.81
UTF0723B : Address Updats; 1 025 025
UTF0723B : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 4] 0.0465 0.65
UTFO723B : Paper Stock | 14§ 0.0122. 0171
UTFG723B : UTI # 10 Outgoing Envelope 12 0.0142 0.17T
UTF07238 : # 9 Retum Envejope 9 0.0121 01T
UTF0723B : UT1L.STMT.10%: 1B.PDF )
07/23/12 UTFO723A : Statement Postage (Level-2 Sort) 14 0.404 5.66
UTFO723A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(10 Pages: 5 Accls) t 2.02 202
UTF0723A ; Statement Postage {Non Bar-Coded) 1 045 0.45
UTFO723A : Address Update; i 0.25 0.25
UTF0723A : Data Pmcssmg_lrMail Prep Services 25 0.0465 1.16
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS |
Page 2 Total




/ ":Zt:;:
lnfosend

BiliPriol, eBdla. Oslxtof\d

4240 E, La Palma Avenue
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816 |
Phone: 714.993.2690 « Fax:714,993.1306 AMOUNT PAID ; - RN,

lNVOlOiE 0 7pqa1 | 60637

ATTNZ Adri‘enne Krugler "!'llllll"Il!!"lllilllll"'l‘“"]llll‘"l"‘ull"l"l"l'""

UTILITIES, INC INFOSEND, INC

2335 Sanders Road 4240 E. La Palma Ave.

Northbrook, iL 60062 Anaheim, CA 62807-1816
DWEO(BOXFORMMNGADDRESSCHANGE. HiEASEND!CAT‘EOHANGESONﬂIEREVERSES&DE PLEASEDETAG-MMDREWUPPERSEMWHHPAY’JENT
T, 2t Lapsims vemd TERMS | DUE DATE P.O# ACCOUNT# | INVOICE

Phone: 714, ’ .
mr?f?ﬁﬁmd o 719,995, 1306 NET20 | 8212012 2966 60637
DATE _ ' DESCRIPTION | aw RATE AMOUNT

'UTFO723A : Paper Stock 25~ 0.0122 031T
UTF0723A : UTI # 10 Owgding Envelope 20 0.0142 ~ 0.28T
UTF0723A : # 9 Retum Envelope 19 0.0121 0.23T

v UTF0723A : UTLSTMT.1094A.PDF

|

0724712 | UTI0723B : Statement Postae (Level-1 Sort} (4941 Mailpisces) 1 1,782.40 1,782.40
UTI0723B : Multiple Page Slatement Postage(1532 Pages: 753 Accts) R | 305.846] 305.85
UTIO723B : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 96 0.45. - 4320
UTI0723B : Forcign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 7 0446 312
UTI0723B : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 481 0.646. 31.01
UTI0723B : Address Update | 47 0.25 I35
UTI0723B : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 6,569 1~ 0.0465 305.46
UTIO723B : Paper Stock | 6,569 0.0122 80.14T
UTT0723B : Large Flat Bave I 0.15 0.15T
UT10723B : UT1 # 10 Outgoing Envelops . 5,789 0.0142 82207
UTI0723B : # 9 Return Envel 4,958 0.0121 59.99T
UTI0723B : UTLSTMT.1094B.PDF

07724112 {UTI0O723A : Stetement Postage (Level-1 Sort) (4972 Mailpieces) } 1,79131 1,791.31
UTIO723A : Multiple Page 5¢ Postage(1347 Pages: 671 Accts) 1 271222 271.22
UTI0723A : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 82 0.45 36.90
UTI0723A : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 6}- 0.446 2.68
UTI0723A : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 53 0.646 3424
UTIO723A : Address Update 61| 025/ 15.25
UTI0723A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 6,401 0.0465 297.65
UTI0723A : Paper Stock 6,401 0.0122 78.09T
UTIOT23A : UTL# 10 Outgoing Envelope 5725 0.0142 81307
UT10723A : # 9 Retum Envelope 4,384 0.0121 59.10T{
UTI0723A : UTLSTMT.1094A PDF

0724112 |UTNOT23B : Notices Postage (Level-1 Sort) (769 Mailpieces) 1 289.95 289.95 ]
UTNO723B : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 574 045 256571
UTNO723B : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 34} 0.446 15.16-7
UTNO723B : Foreign Mail Additionsl Postage-INTERNATIONAL n 0.646 72407
UTNO723B : Address Update 197, 025 47577
UTNO723B : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 1,657] 0.0465 76821 J

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS Mﬁ’w

Page 3 Total o o
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infosend;, |

I 4240E.LaPalma Avelluue

Anaheim, CA 92807-1816

BitPrinl. wBits, Defwred,

Phone: 714.993,2690 » FaxI 714.993.1306 AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.
INVO ’CE 3072012 60637
MAKE CHECKS PAYABLE T
ATTN: Adrienne ngler ' ‘lllcu']sllnh‘|mluillu"’n‘luu"l"nllal"lnu‘n"
UTILITIES, INC INFOSEND, INC
2335 Sanders Road 4240 E. La Palma-Ave.
Northbrook, IL 60082 : Anaheim, CA $2807-1816 o !
g

D CHECK BOX FOR MAILING ADURESS CHANGE. FLEASE INDICATE CHANGES ON THE REVERSE SIDE.

----------------------------- J am w4 Na M N AP W SR S WD WD A W AR M M A W MR WY W R T e GR T M M W R PR WD W M e W M N S W B wh e e Gr da W 4) S Y W AP W E W W e e
4240E L Patma Avenue TERMS | DUE DATE P.O# ACCOUNT # INVOICE
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816; . i
logadangamisad NET20 | 8n12012 2966 60637
DESCRIPTION Qry RATE AMOUNT
‘UTNO723B : Paper Stock 1,652 0.0122 20,1571
UTNO723B : UTI # 10 Outgding Envelope 8261 00142 11737
{{)  |uTNO723B: UTLCVST.256B.PDF :
0772412 | UTNOT23C : Notices P‘ostngd‘ {Level-1 Sort) (2467 Mailpieses) - 838,14 888.147]
UTNO723C : Statemient Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 271 045 12,157
UTNO723C : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 7 04d6).. . . 3f . ..
UTNO723C : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL H 0.646 0.65~1
UTNO723C : Address U 364 025 9.00]
UTNO723C : Dats Processing/Mail Prep Services 4,988 0.0465 231.97 |
UTNO723C : Paper Stock | 49881 0.0122 60.85T]
UTNQ723C : UTT# 10 Outgoing Envelope 24944 0.0142 3541
)2 ) |umiorzsc:umcvsT. 1ssc PDF
0772412 |UTN0723D : Notices Postages {Level-1 Sort) (752 Mailpieces) 3% 265.88 265.88
UTNO723D : Statentient Postzige (Non Bar-Coded) &j 0.45 2.70]
UTN0723D : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA A .8.446 1.34-7
UTNO723D : Foreign Mai! Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 7, 0.646 1.28-1
UTNQ723D : Address U " 0.25 1751
UTNO723D : Data Pmossiné{Mail Prep Services 15161, 0.0465 70.49~]
UTN0723D : Paper Stock 15161 0.0122 18.50T
UTN0723D : UT} # 10 Outgoing Envelope 758 0.0142 10.76T1
{} UTNO723D : UTLCVST. 249D.PDF :
07124712 | UTLOT23A : Letter Postage (chel-z Sort) 219 0.404 38.48
UTL0723A : Multiple Page Slatement Postage(2 Pages: 1 Accts) i 0.404 0.40
UTLO723A : Letter Postage (Non Bar-Coded) s 045 225
UTLO723A ; Address Update! 21 0.25 525
UTLO723A : Data Processing{Mail Prep Services 226} 0.0465 1051
UTLO723A : Paper Stock | 226 0.0122 2.767
UTLO723A : UTI# 10 Outgolng Envelope 225 0.0142 3.20T
UTLO723A : # 9 Retum Envelope 215 0.0121 2.60T
UTLOT23A : UTT LETTERS ;oss PDF
0772512 | UTIO724A : Statement posmge {Level-t Sort) (3163 Mailpieces) 1 1,125.63 1,125.63
UTIO724A : Muitiple Page Stitement Postage(103 Pages: 51 Accts) } 20.65 20.65
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS
; Page 4 Total




; |

infosend, |

BilPrnl, oBlls. Dalwered, !

4240E. La Palma Avehue
Anaheim, CA92807-1816 |

Phone: 714.993.2690 « Fax!714.993.1306 ‘
¢ AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.
'NVOICE 7/30/2012 60637
CUSTOMER - o - MAKE CHECKS PAYABLETIO
A’rrN: Adﬁmne K!ug!er : “’I‘llll!)llllll’lllllllllnll"ll[ll)ll‘l""llll‘l”lllllll"
UTILITIES, INC INFOSEND, INC
2335 Sanders Road : 4240 E. La Palma Ave.
Northbrook, iL. 80062 Anaheim, CA82807-1816
b ;
!
DU-IEG(BOXFORMMJNGADOHESSOMNGE. PLT&ASEINDICAYECHANGESONWEREVERSESIDE. PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN UPPER SECTION WATH PAYMENT
Eaialietied .’.::\::.”“"““""““? “““““““ - "'"““"‘f""‘""‘"’.“ """ L S s S
ﬁf'ﬁ - 40E et pvene] TERMS | DUE DATE pO# ACCOUNT # INVOICE
A”ahdﬂ\ -181 % '
’“f‘l%ﬁ’m'd el NET20 | 82172012 2966 60637
DATE | DESCRIPTION ary RATE AMOUNT
UTI0724A : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 106 0.45 41.70
UTIO724A : Foreign Mait Additional Postage-CANADA 2 0.446 0.89
UTH0724A : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 1 ) 0.646 0.65
UTI0724A : Address Update | 37 025 925
UTI0724A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 3372 0.0465 156.80
UTI0724A : Paper Stock  ; 33724 0.0122 4147
< - JUTH0724A - UTI # 10-Outgoing Envelope - 3,320 0.0142 s 44T -
UTI0724A : # 9 Return Envelope 2,964 0.0121 " 35.86T
UTI0724A : UTLSTMT.1095.PDF “F
67/25/12  JUTFO724A : Statement Posmi;e {Level-1 Sort) (1158 Mailpieces) 1 41353 41353
UTFO724A : Multiple Page Stateinent Postage(26 Pagés: 13 Accts) 1 5252 525
UTF0724A ; Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 3 045 1035
UTFO724A : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 1 0.446 0.45
UTF0724A : Address Update} 9 0.25 225
UTF0724A : Data ProcessingfMail Prep Services 1,207 0.0465 56.13
UTFO0724A : Poper Stock 1207} 0.0122 14.73T
UTF0724A : UTI # 10 Outgolng Envelope 1,194 0.0142 16.95T
: UTFO724A : #9 Retum Envelope 1,020 0.0121 12347
)5— UTFO724A : UTLSTMT.1095.PDF -
07725712 |UTNO724A : Statement Postage (Level-2 Sort) 1,781+ 0.404 719.52-1
UTNOT24A : Statement Postdge (Non Bar-Coded) 491 043 18.00-1T
UTNO724A : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 4 0.646 2581
UTNOT24A : Address Updatg 3l 025 775"
UTNO724A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 72841 0.0465 338.711
UTNO724A : Paper Stock | 7.284Y 0.0122 88.86T.L
UTNO724A : UTI# 10 Outgolng Envelope 1,821/ 0.0142 25.86T |-/
[ 6/ |UTNOT24A : UTLCVST.188E.PDF
0772612 JUTI0725A : Statement Postage (Level-1 Sort) (5868 Mailpieces) 1 2,100.49 2,10049
UTI0725A : Multiple Page Stitement Postage(3029 Pages: 1506 Accts) 1 609.436 609.44.
UTI0725A : Statement Poslage (Nor Bar-Coded) 134 0.45 6030
UTI0725A : Foreign Mail Adilitional Postsge-CANADA 67 0.446 29.88
UTI0725A : Foreign Mail Adifitional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 4 0.646 2.58
UTIOT25A : Address Update 74 025 18.50
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS




’//::_:::3:;,:_ S :
infosend

4240 E. La Palma Avenue
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816 |
Phone: 714.993.2690 « Fax§ 714.993.1306

i

BiliPrint. wBils. Datyesad.

AMOUNT PAID

DATE

INVOICE NO.

ATTN: Adrienne Krugler

2335 Sanders Road

{
UTILITIES, INC <
i
Northbrook, IL 60062 ;

7/30/2012

60637

‘*l’.ll.]l!illll"'llllllllll"l'l'lllllll’llll'll“!lllll'll!i

INFOSEND, INC

4240 E. La Paima Ave.
Anzaheim, CA 92807-1816

PLEASE DEYACH AND RETURN UPPER SECTION WITH PAYMENT

................................ Ny,

*,  4240E.L2 Paima Avere] TERMS | DUE DATE PO# ACCOUNT # INVOICE
AnahehCAPZBW-lmai :
Soerprgrntl NET20 | 82172012 2966 60637
| DESCRIPTION Qry RATE AMOUNT

UTI0725A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 9,031 0.0465 419.94
UTIO725A : Paper Stock | 9,031 =~ 0.0122 110.18T
UTI0725A : UTT # 10 Outgoing Envelope 7,508 0.0142 106.61T
UTIO725A : # 9 Retien Envelope 6372 0.0121 77.10T
UTI0725A : UTLSTMT.1096.PDF

07/726/12 _ | UTLO725A : Letter Postage (Level-1 Sort) (1328 Mailpieces) — 505.27- 505.27
UTLO725A : Letter Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 24 045 10.80
UTLO725A : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 1 0.446 0.45
UTLO725A : Address Updatel 35 025 8.75
UTLO725A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 1,355 0.0465 63.01
UTLO725A : Paper Stock | 1,355{~ 0.0122 16.53T
UTLO725A : UT1 # 30 Outgoing Envelope 1,352 0.0142 19.20T
UTLO725A : # 9 Retum Envelope 1,319 0.0121 15.96T
UTLO725A : UTI LETTERS 1070.PDF

07726/12  JUTNO725C : Nolices Postage (Level-1 Sort) (560 Mailpieces) 1y 194.37 194.37 -1
UTNO725C : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 3% 045 2701
UTN0725C : Address Updates 12147 025 30251
UTNO725C : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services L1324 0.0465 s2.64-1"
UTNO725C : Paper Stock ' 1,13247 0.0122 13817~
UTNO725C : UTI # 10 Outgoing Envelope 5664 0.0142 8.047}—

} &) JUINO725C: UTL.CVST.479B.PDF

07726/12 | UTLOT24A : Letter Postage (Level-2 Sort) 141 0.404 56.96
UTLO724A : Multiple Poge Statement Postage(8 Pages: 4 Accts) 1 1616 1.62
UTL0724A : Letter Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 2 045 050
UTLO724A : Address Update’ 1 0.25 275
UTL0724A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 151 0.0465 7.02
UTLO724A : Paper Stock 1515 0.0122 1.84T
UTLO724A : UTT # 10 Outgoing Envelope 147 0.0142 2.097
UTLO724A : # 9 Retum Envelope 137 0.0121 1.66T
UTLO724A : UTI LETTERS 1069.FDF

07/26/12 | UTNO725B : Statement Posiage (Level-2 Sort) 374 0.404 149.88 <]
UTNO725B : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 1 045 0.45_4+—

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS

Page 6 Total
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4240 E, La Palma Avenue
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816

Phone:714.993.2690 + Fax: 714.993.1306 '
AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.
INVOI CE 773012012 60637
MAKE CHECKS PAYABLETO .
ATTN: Adrienne KNQ[er ; "‘llIlllll"lI‘l"l"]lllllul"ll!l"l"l“"lill"'l"l!l‘l"
t UTILITIES, INC ! INFOSEND, INC
2335 Sanders Road 4240 E. La Palma Ave.
Northbrook, it. 60062 : Anaheim, CA 92807-1816
3
D CHECK BOX FOR MNLINGADDRESS CHANGE. PLlEME INDICATE CHANGES ON THE REVERSE SIDE. PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN UPPER SECTION WITH PAYMENT
Rttt e L L L L L LR LR LT PP PP P P PP e PP PP O T PP TP TP PR L P T T e P LT
e $40E Lo abma e TERMS | DUE DATE PO# ACCOUNT # INVOICE
-1B16;
Phone: 714,993, ¢
‘nf‘i.’ﬁﬁndm T NET20 | 8212012 2966 60637
DATE DESCRIPTION (4124 RATE AMOUNT
UTNO725B : Address Updatd ™ 025 1175
UTNO725B : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 7441, 0.0465 34.60—1"
UTNO7258 : Paper Stock | 7441 0.0122 9.08T4~
UTNO725B : UT1 # 10 Outgding Envelope kyr2 0.0142 5.28T|~
UTNO725B : UTLCVST.345A.PDF :
07/2%6{2  [UTNOT25A : Statement Posu_ig; {Level-2 Sort) L BER{ ) 0.404. 44935 4~
UTNO725A : Statenient Postage (Non Bar-Coded) - 21 0.45 0.90 4~
UTNO725A : Address Update 8- 0.25 200 4~
UTNOT25A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 44564 0.0465 20720 4
UTNO725A ; Paper Stock | 44561 0.0122 5436TH
UTNO725A : UT # 10 Outgding Envelope 1,114 0.0142 15.82T4~
UTNO725A : UTL.CVST.19J A PDF
UTFO725A : Statement Postage (Level-2 Soit) 47 0.404 1899
UTFO725A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(26 Pages: 13 Accts) 1 5252 5.25
UTFO725A : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 1 0.45 0.45
UTFO725A : Address Update! 1 025 0.25
UTFOT25A ; Dats Processing/Mail Prep Services 4 0.0465 344
UTF0725A : Paper Stock "t 0.0122 0.50T
UTFOT725A : UT1 # 10 Outgoing Envelope 61 0.0142 0.87T
UTFOT725A : # 9 Return Eavelope 44 0.0121 0.53T
UTFO0725A : UTLSTMT. 1096 PDF
12 |UTFOT26A : Statement Postage (Level-1 Sort) (2567 Mailpicces) 1 921.64 921.64
UTF0726A : Multiple Page Statement Postage(34 Pages: 17 Accts) i 6.868 6.87
UTFO0726A : Statement Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 54 0.45 24.30
UTF0726A : Fareign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA .28 0.446 1is
UTFO726A : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-INTERNATIONAL 2 0.646 129
UTFO726A : Address Update’ |24 0.25 6.00
UTF0726A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 2j655 0.0465 12346
UTFO726A : Paper Stock 2i6557 0.0122 32.39T
UTFO726A : UTI # 10 Oulgoing Envelope 2638 0.0142 37.46T
UTFO0726A : # 9 Retwrn Envelope 2:054 0.0121 24.85T
@ UTFO726A : UTLSTMT.1097.PDF
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS
Page 7 TOtal




e,
e e,

mfosend

BilPrinl. oBMx D‘Jnnned

4240E.La Palma Avenue %
Anaheim, CA 92807-1816 :
1 Phone:714.993.2690 « Faxi714.993.1306

AMOUNT PAID DATE INVOICE NO.

INVO!CE

713012012 60637

ATTN: Adrienne Krugler } hlashloldbdididiloniliblolandall

UTILITIES, INC ‘ INFOSEND, INC
2335 Sanders Road: 4240 E. La Palma Ave,
Northbrook, i 60062 Anaheim, CA 92807-1816
DGHECKBOXFORMM.NGADDRESSCNANGE. PLFASE)ND&WEWANGESONTHEREVERSESDE. FLEASEDE!'ACHANDRETURNUPPERSECT’ONWITHPAYMENT
----------------------------- ._i._..-.-_--..--..--....-._----..---_--_----_..-.....-..‘-u-._~-------_--- - e e L W Te b wm
/ T e patna Avee, TERMS | DUE DATE P.O# ACCOUNT # INVOICE
Anahelm, -181
f%ﬁﬁg isgeriroran NET20 | 82172012 2966 60637
DATE DESCRIPTION Qry _RATE AMOUNT
072712 JUTIOT726A : Statement Postage (Lovel-1 Sort) (705 Mailpieces) 1 270.78 270.78
UTI0726A : Multiple Page Siatement Postage(62 Pages: 31 Accts) i 12524 12.52
UTI0726A : Staiement Postage (Non Bar-Codex) 20 045 9.00
UTI0726A : Address Update | 17 0.25 425
UTI0726A : Data Processing/Mail Prep Services 81 0.0465 36.60
UTI0726A : Paper Stock 787 r 0.0122 9.60T
UTI0726A : UTL # 10 Owigoi gg Envelope , o . 756 S 0.0142 : 10747
;2 3 UTIOT26A : # 9 Return Enve 641 0.0121 7.76T |
UTIO726A : UTLSTMT.1097.PDF
§7727/12 | UTLOT26A : Letter Postage (Level-2 Sort) 198 0.404 79.99
UTLO726A : Multiple Page S‘latement Postage(2 Pages: | Accts) | 0.404 0.40
UTLO726A : Letter Postage (Non Bar-Coded) 4 0.45 1.80
UTLO726A : Foreign Mail Additional Postage-CANADA 1 0.446 0.45
UTLO726A : Address Update! 3 0.25 775
UTLO726A : Data ProcessingfMaif Prep Services 204 0.0465 9.49
UTLO726A : Paper Stock | 2047 0.0122 249T
UTLO726A : UTI # 10 Oulgomg Envelope 203 0.0142 2.88T
UTLO726A : # 9 Return Envelope 195 0.0121 2.36T
UTLOT26A : UTI LETTERS 1071.PDF .
0730/12 | Sales Tax 8.25% 146.36
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS
Page 8 Total 321,505.31




0728377 EXPENSE REPORT Form Dateh /0 %o7
1) Complets &if sactions where applicable 354 oty Y
2) Attach recelpts anto separate pags, attech to form , RECEI VEEP o Name—— John D Williams
3) Explain ALL entertalnment expenses on the back of form JUN D9 201 Business Unit 102102
4) Kaep photocopies of &l forms for your protection Project Number 2011005
5) Submit completed form to supervisar for approval
Total Account
2911 . Codes
2011005 . ' )
fMoals ' saLslV , 6200
[iHotsl ( room, tax, phone cafis) ' | 27900}/ 6188
iMlicage Driven 45000 f '
Mileage Valus @ 05] 32500 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 : 5195
j  [Airfsre fincluding panaltios) 26 D ; 222G A0 6190
Car Rental (inculding fuel) 6198
aking ) ’ 6207
Tolts $0.00 6207
Taxi - Limousing ' , T 6155
ntertainment B 50.001 6208
niverstyEducation $0.00 5650
ts 4 $0.00] 6388
{Phons Expanse 50.008 5945
Tufion (OPS} ' 50.000 - 5820
Other: : 50.00¢
Purpose of tha Expenss: |Travel to meet with Charlotte County Regulators . Paymant Recap
usiness Bonef: Preparing o filea Rme Case ~ JUN + O LU1I Total of the Front of the Expanss Fom: se8819 S 20 (,Q
{i¢ Days on Business: 2 | ! Jsubtract Any Advance: ] fexs
lExplanstion: Travel to Orlanco and then on & Chariotte County to mest with County Reguistors}piet Amourt Dua fo the Employsa: 83619 ™ 39 (7
Travel from Orlamdo was with M Freidman and P Elymn, 1 hereby cortily et the above sxpencitirss repressnt cash spant for
hgitmats company businsss only and include no fems of & persony bative.
fActhortzed Slgnature: % hofom "~ [Employes Sigasture: Ph N lioen N
Dete Authortzed: i [w Joats Signed: )
J\& - JUN 13 2011 |
£y,

M




Date Amount Namse of Establishment Customer’Company Name Description of Expensea
Location fndividual Name (Purposa, City, Place)
2/09/2011 $310.19{Sheraton Orlando North Twa Hotel nights and some food In Orlando

- $310,19,




£47 22

Sheraton Orlando North

600 N Lake Destiny Dr N s S Y
Mailkang, FL 32751-4124 o Y Y
t —~ 407 6460 5000 o T ‘\)¢‘L
1 — 407 6609008 e Sheraton
GUEST / CLENT TRAVEL AGENT / CHARGE TO
ROOM 617
Mr John Williams NATE 124.00
# PERS. 1 L
121 N Monroe St - Fouo 267473 EX-A
Apt 1210 PAGE 1
Tallahassee, FL 32301-1548  ARAME 09-FEB-11 16:37
DEPART 11-FEB-11
PAYMENT ;\x"_.”‘ .
SCIHIENION
, paws
09-FEB-11 RT617 .. CRR Room Chrg Restricted , 124.00
09-FEB-11 RT617 Sales Tax 6.5% 8.06
09-FEB~11 RT617 Occupancy Tax 6% 7.494
09-FEB-11 DEPOSIT Deposit Applied 279.00-
09-FEB-11 617 Club Lounge ’ . 8.75
10-FEB~11 RT617 CRR Room Chrg Restricted 124.00
10-FEB-11 RT617 Sales Tax 6.5% 8.06
10-FEB-11 RT617 Occupancy Tax 6%, ... » 7.44
10-FEB-11 617 Club Lounge . w 15.00
10-FEB~11 3082 Celestial Lounge e 22.89

11-FEB-11 AX American EXpress W 46,68~

Balance Due e

For your convenience, we have prepared this zero-balance folio :,n :LcatJ.ng a
$0 balance on your account. Please be adviged r.hat ahy charges not reflected
on this folio will be charged to the credit card on file with the hotel.
While this folio reflects a $0 balance, yoyr credit card may not. be charged
until after your departure. You are ultxmg.l;e}x responszble for paying all of
your folio charges in full. .

*+ continued on the next page *"‘."

SIGNATURE 1 egrse 10 remain pe-sonnsy abe for 012 paymoat of v octount * he otrporation or oU1er wirid gty bilkad sk b9 pasy pivt ur 6 of thows chorgies.

Mr John Williams ~ ROOM . DEPART AGENT
FOLIO 267473  09-FEB-11 617 : :

B

1
PERAD RN Y
SO
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Employee Travel and Business Expense Reimbursement Form

.ﬂftl/ities. fnc:

ACCOUNTING USE

1 1021105200 Trlig AT
2. 20110056185 230.88-
3. 2011005.8190. " -7 080" (-
4. 2011005.6195 79.30
5. 20110056200 " -~ -7, " '39.54.
6

7

8

»

tEmployee Name:. Erin fawiline z

[Busmess Unit.. " 102110 i

EMPLOYEE USE

Total,expe‘nses - h 4 $ ' 700.32

Less cash advances -
Less amounts charged on corporate credit card -

Net amount due employee $ 700.32

MlLEAGE REIMBURSEMENT CALCULATOR e
Mues drlven -

IRS mileage rate § 0555

Mlleage relmbursement 3 -

Note that the mileage reimbursement calculared above
must be manually entered on page two of this form,

e PURPOSE OF- EMPLOYEE TRAVEL -
Sanda!haven rate case. It will not et me type it on the
form anywhere, but anything with the code; 2011005
should go to account 2011005.2909 not the codes that it
is forcing me to choose from.,

al22l 2007

- DagitaPy signed by Aichard J, Durham e

R|chardJ Durham Ore enoRichand . Durivam, oxLRiMRS, Inc., o
: vmmwusm.mo 00, B / 2 5 / 2 O}_z_.

_mployee Slgnature

Date

Approved By Date

L E

2206
_us5 9




e
A Utilities. Inc:

07/19/42 , Airfata”

Employee Travel and Business Expense Reimbursement Form

Employee Name

. |ErinPovich

41102110

1. R G

2. 08/20/12. Alrfare Umted A|rhnes 2011005

3. 08/24/12 Aiffare AUhited Alifigs 4ge: 5201100536190 ¢

4, 08/21/12 Lodging Marriott Spnnh Hill Suites Room night of 8/20/2012 2011005 . /
5. 08/24/12 Lodging. . 7 . Matriatt Sprinii Hill: Stiites, . ‘Room. night 6f.8/23/2042. Lt T 20110050 6185 115.44

6. 08/20/12 Ground transportahon My Personal Taxi Cab from Northbrook Office to Airport 2011005 6195 33.00 %
7. 08/24/12" Ground transportation' Chidice Taxi i~~~ " " Cab fromi Alrport to'NoHRBfook Office . '2011005 6195 46.30

8. 08/20/12 Meals-lunch McDonalds Lunch 8/20/2012 2011005 6200 2.33 [/
9. 08/24/12 Meals:Unchs. McBohald Lirich.8/24/20

10. 08/24/12 Meals-breakfast ZaZa Cuban Coffee Breakfast 82412012

11. 08/07/12. Meals:dinhe
12, 07/24/12 Meals-lunch
14,
15.
16.
17.
18.
19.
20.
21.
22,
23.
24,
25,
25.
27.
28.
29,
'so

oY S IR HE T A Diner o AR s
Zapatista Darrien's Welcome Lunch (Darrin, Erin & Jason)
D 2 SR R3S

102{10
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Employee Travel and Business Expense Reimbursement Form

« Utllities, ine:

In General

1. Refer to the Employee Travel and Business Expense Reimbursement Policy for further guidance on specific expense items.
2. All expense reports should be sent to the Accounts Payable Department in Northbrook 1},

. 3.  Allreceipts not aiready "8.5 by 11.0" must be taped to an 8.5" by 11.0" sheet of paper and accompany the expense report. Original
expenses must be submitted in order for an expense to be reimbursed.

4. All questions, including assistance with object codes, should be directed to Accounts Payable.
Page 1
5. input name and business unit (which will automatically carry fOI’W;ElI'd to page 2).

6. Expense Summary - input the amount of any cash advance or ahy amounts charged on a corporate credit card as a negative
number. All other amounts will calculate automaticaily.

7. Mileage Reimbursement Caiculator - input the pumber of miles driven and the mileage reimbursement will be calculated. Note that
the amount of the reimbursement does not automatically feed into page two of the form.

8. Input purpose of employee travel.

9.  Sign and date.
10.  Approver sign and date.
Page 2

11.  Input date, vendor, description, BU or project code and amount of each expense item.

12, Input the type of expense by clicking on that field which will provide a drop down menu of expense items to choose from. Hotel bills

shouid be split out between lodging, meals, telephone, etc. If "project cost " is selected, a project code must be entered in the BU or
product code column, :

13. Object codes will automatically be displayed once the type of gxgﬂeg§e is selected.

14, In order to be reimbursed, expenses for business meetings must provide the names and companies of those in attendance along with

the purpose of the business meeting. This information can also be input in the fields provided on page 1.

i




Print
Subject: Receipt Confirmation
From: taxi@mypersonaltaxi.com {taxi@mypersonaltaxi.com)
To: erin_wif@yahoo.com;
Date: Monday, August 20, 2012 3:54 PM

Transaction location

MY PERSONAL TAXI & LIVERY, INC.
630-338-3403
taxi@mypersonaitaxi.com

08/20/2012 01:52PM

Tip $3.00
TOTAL $33.00

Thank you for using My Personatl Taxi

Cardholder Name AQUILINO/ERIN

Card # XXXX XXXX XXXX 3077
* Exp:Date XX/XX ’ CoC

Auth # 07728C

Merchant # XXXXXXXXXXXX1949

hitn-iins me2 nuil vahoo.com:dedaunch? ov 0 rand~drletio2do3t0

Page 1 of |

Ri25,2012




United Airlines - Thank You for Choosing United Airlines Page 1 of 2

Horng > Thank You for Choosing United Airlines

Thank You for Choosing United Airlines

United Confirmation Number PMHDQS8

i Purchase Summary
}

1 Aduits (age 18 to 64) $232.00
Additional Taxes/Fees . $21.60
Total Price $253.60
Payment Information

Name of Cardhoider: Erin P Aquilino

Card Type: Visa

MileagePlus Members: Upon completion of this itinerary, you will earn up to 2,010 MileagePlus

award miles.*

Flight Details United Cenfirmation Number | PMHDQS
1

Mon., Aug. 20, 2012 } Chicago, IL (ORD - O'Hare) to Orlando, FL (MCO)

Depart: Arrive: Trave! Award Miles/ Flight: UAZ7

6:13 p.m, 9:47 p.m. Time:2 hr Premier Qualifying*:  Aircraft: Boeing 737-800

Mon., Aug. 20, 2012 Mon., Aug. 20, 2012 34 mn 1,005 /100% Fare Class: United Economy (G)
Meal: $nacks for Purchase

Chicago, It. (ORD - O'Hare})  Oriando, FL (MCO)
No Speclal Meaf Offered.

Fri., Aug. 24, 2012 | Orlando, FL (MCO) to Chicago, IL {ORD - O'Hare)

Depart: Arrive: Travel Award Miles/ Flight: UAG55
11:19 a.m. 1:15 p.m. Time:2 hr  Premier Qualifying®:  Aircraft: Airbus A320
Fri., Aug. 24, 2012 Fri., Aug. 24, 2012 56 mn 1,005 /100% Fare Class: United Economy (T)
Orlando, FL (MCO} Chicago, It (ORD - O'Hare} Meal: Snacks for Purchase
No Special Meal Offered.
Traveler(s)

Ms. Erin P. Aquilino

Seat Assignments: -ORD - MCO: 25A Special Meals Request: Not appiicable for this itinerary i
MCO - ORD: 25A Frequent Flyer; UA-RW937835 L
E-mail Address: epaquilino@uiwater.com
Home Phone: (224) 399-9336 - United States

Orlando Hotels
. AVIS

From

httos:fwwawv anited. com/weh/en-1 IS/annsihnok e/ flichtmrintCon firmation asns?SIN=CR...  7/19/2012




United Airlines = Thank You for Choosing United Airlines Page2o0f2

untTED B} $25800k
Today

e ;“"\,
L}

Yy

[ T3 .
Search Hotels >
Relax in our exclusive
airport clubs by
nurchasing a day pass Oriando Car
or an annual Rentals ) .
membarship. Book with our preferred +-- ertz‘

car partners to save up to 35% and
earn 75 reward miles per day.

Important Travel Information:

The U.S. government raised the security alert level and implemented extra restrictions to assure the security of air
travel. Certain changes in airport procedures and restrictions on items allowed on board aircraft are detailed on the
Travel Alert; Elevated Security page.

Any changes to your flight reservations may incur additional charges.

Airlines require government issued photo identification upon check-in, such as a driver's license or passport.
Passporl, visa and health requirements may apply for this itinerary, Each passenger must ensure he or she has all
required travel documents as stated in Rule 19 of the Contract of Carriage. Information on this site is provided as a
courtesy and should be verified by the passenger before travel. Other resources include the consulate of the
destination country and the U.S. Department of State.

Please read important information governing airtin liability fimi

You will be contacted with any changes or additional information such as schedule changes, itinerary changes, etc.
Special services are on a request basis and cannot be guaranteed.

Special meal requests must be received at least 24 hours before the departure of your flight and cannot be

guaranteed.

*Miles shown are the actual miles flown for this segment. Fare class, Premier qualifying miles and other promotional
bonuses are not included in the total miles shown. The award miles accrued on codeshare flights are based on the operating
carrier and thelr equivalent fare class. This could result In differences between the purchased booking class and the booking
class flown, which determines the number of base and Premier qualifying miles and Premier qualifying segments earned.
MileagePlus award miles are not awarded for trave! on airlines that are not MileagePlus partners. Miles indicated for non-
partner flights or flight segments will not be awarded. MileagePlus award miles earned will vary depending on the Premier
status of the customer.

t Important Baggage Information

hitos://www.united.com/webien-UiS/anns/hook ine/Mivht/orintConfirmation asnx2SID=CR...  7/19/2012
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W - SpringHilt Svites by Marriott 205 W Hwy 436
*F Rmi};uLL"s HITES Ortando Altamonte Springs Altamonte Springs FI 32714
o 1(407) 865 6400

Folio Number: 56196

 iCharges - Crédits
20Aug12 Room Charge

104.00
...20Aug12 Occupancy Sales Tax 5.20
: State Occupancy Tax 6.24 .
Visa 115.44
Card #: VIXOOOOOOXXX3077/XXXX
Amount: 115.44 Auth: 09282C Signature on File
This card was electronically swiped on 20Aug12
Balance: 0.00

As'4 Rewards Member, you could b
stalus, plus enjoy exclusive-mempé

med points toward your free dream vacation today. Start earning points and elite
Enroll today at the frontdesk. )

i

Want your final hd

sk the Front Desk! See "Internet Privacy Statement" on Marriott.com.




SoringHill Suites by Marriott Altamonte Springs
205 West State Road 436

Altamonte Springs, FL 32714

T: 407.865.6400 F:407.865.6773
www.altamontespringsflhotel.com

Dear Valued Guest,

t Altamonte Springs and our entire team, { want to thank

On behalf of the SpringHill Suites by Marriot
e that

you for staying with us while visiting the Altamonte Springs / Orlando, Florida area. We recogniz
you have many hotel options to choose from and we are very appreciative that you chose to stay with

us.

It is our hope that you experienéed a comfortable, restful and productive stay with us. [If there is
anything you would like to share with us, we are available at any time. Our Guest Service Agents-are
ant, General Manager and it

available 24 hours per day in the lobby or feel free to contact me, Larry Gr
would be my pleasure to assist you. Every comment isimportant to usas it helps us to maintain our
strengths and to imptove where necessary. . i

As a Marriott Guest, you may receive a Guest Survey via e-mail in a few days. Itisour hope that we

have delivered on our Perfect 10 Service Goal and ask that you take a few.minutes to complete the
survey and tell us if we.succeeded. 1 personally review every survey on a daily-basis and look forward to
your comments. If something got in the way of our goal to provide you with an excellent stay, | hope
you will share it with me or our Guest Service Agent before you depart so we may correct it for you.

Wishing you safe travels,
Larry Grant
General Manager




2

b B SpringHill Suites by Marriott 205 W Hwy 436
SPRINGHILL SUITES Oriando Altamonte Springs Altamonte Springs F! 32714
arrioft. 1{407) 865 6400
E. Aguiting " Room: 208
‘Room Type: KSTE
Numbe} of Guestﬁ: 1
Rate: $104.00 Clerk:
Amive: 23Aug12 Time: 10:20PM - Depart: 24Augi2 © Time: . ‘Folio Number: 56197
“Date’ . Descdption - U " Charges . -Cradits
23Aug12 Room Charge 104.00
. 23Aug12 Occupancy Sales Tax 520
- 23Augi12 State Occupancy Tax 6.24
" 24Aug12 Visa 115.44

Card #: VDOOOOOOXXXX3077/XXXX
Amount: 115.44 Auth: 08018C Signature on File
This card was electronically swiped on 23Aug12

Balance: 0.00

As:éReWards Member, you could have eamed points toward your free dream vacation today. Start eaming points and elite
status, plus enjoy exciusive member-offers. Enroll today at the front desk. -

Want your final hotel-bill by email?"J ] i_t:_aiék the Front Desk! See “Internet Privacy Statement” on Marriott.com.




SuringHil Suites by Marriott Altamonie Spring
205 West State Rozd 436

S

Altamonte Springs, FL 32714
70 407.865.6400 F:407.865.6773
www.altamontespringsflhetel.com

Dear Vaiuad Guest,

On behalf of the SpringHill Suites by Marriott Altamonte Springs.and our entire tcam, | want to thank
taying with us while visiting the Altamonte Springs / Orlando, Florida area. We recognize that

you fors ) '
you have many hotel options to choose from and we are very appreciative that you chose to stay with

us.,

it is our hope that you experienced a comfortable, restful and productive stay with us. If there is
anything you would like to share with us, we are available at any time. Our Guest Service Agents are
available 24 hours per day in the lobby or feel free to contact me, Larry Grant, General Manager and it
would be my pléasure to assist you. Every comment is important to us as it helps.us to maintain our

strengths and to improve where necessary.

As a Marriott Guest, you may receive a Guest Survey via e-mail ina few days. it is our hope that we
have delivered on our Perfect 10 Service Goal and ask that you take a few minutes to complete the
survey and tell us if we succeeded. | personally review every survey on a daily basis and look forward to
your comments. If something got in the way of ourgoal to provide you with an excellent stay, | hope
you will share it with me or our Guest Service Agent before you depart so we may correct it for you.

Wishing you safe travels, .
Larry Grant
General Manager
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STAPLE
HERE
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Do not axpose 0

UNITED Bl Passencer RECEIPT 1o 1

24AUG12 uUs
CS/D87512  /ORLANDO
'AQUILINO/ERINPNS
*ANOT VALID FORXX
*XTRANSPORTATIONX  PSGR TICKET  01623344148786
HCO UA ORD PMHDQ8
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usbD  25.00 Y1X0O0KK00000KK3077/ 000K/ 08341
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uUsD 25.00
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THIS IS YOUR RECEIPT
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ZAPATISTA
CUISINES OF MEXICO
932 Hillow Road

60062
Date: Jul24'12 01:14PH
Card Type: Visa
Acct #: XXXXXXXXXXXX3077
Card Entry: SWIPED
Trans Type: PURCHASE
Trans Key: DID000742666472
Auth Code: 05145¢C
Check: 1945
Table: 19/1
Server: 60014 Jose S
Subtotal; 41 .39

B8

TP
TOTAL . ___ fifjgi __________

GUEST cCcapPy

Qamens Lunon

27

{

)
.‘ R‘l
(}gﬁf\) 7

EN & TA
(847) 699-9999

Glenvid

Tel:

Fxeb
Hdosl

/0

13@3
AugO7 ' 131 ftEEk,
Visa -
XXXX X
smfﬁ“ =
1 p HASE
Jthio1 voas
03061CI »
IRRR!
ERIN

f

1740

Card Type:

“Acct &
Card Entry:
Trans Type
Auth Code:

Trans Key:
Check:

Date:

25 CARRY QU

Check 1D:
Server:

23 .95

Subtotal:

ZAPA™ STA
+ CUISINE  F MEXICO
J2 W, .08 Road
- . thbrook, IL 60062
60014 Jose S
b1 18/1 Chk 1945 Gst 3
Jul24'12 12:36P4
Dinitng Rm
3 Pick (3) Combo 32,97
1 Diet Coke 2.50
1 Coke 2.50
Sub Total 37.97
- Tax _ 3.42
TOTAL DUE 41 .39

Space Sti11 Available
For Your Holiday

Party
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T-ard You Tor [

: st W !
o Ay (uesticrs - I :n::-.lf:m '
HAW ML 79 Eun’ fleind

Tart 1 eer:
0 Hers !ir;.‘;}--[:‘s
[:l“ p <X )

: £3 :: i
: i Hae (\I
L 1734"161 SRED Slum: e

HES ' .
AT ) 303

WEY RTOE N A

i
| vINGBESS v e
TN HMCE T
D COKE 3%

U3 CE N
. T <. BT
o 0.6z
leca-)4 Tota’ :
) 6.3
<&:7 33 ?
Nt ) B.31
: c.oc -
"E lJt 32¢02302
SSUER Mo
: |
.aJBE ruge r-uu‘i’: 7

UTRIGATION CC23 - (030 CECE 70807
! oot 4 -

Melicrs " 11z

* ROER # 0136

(]

R40O Jawogsn

ZALA
CUBANCOFFEE
cE

]
407-825-3430

acksk COPY *¥¥

i

160z AULAITE 2.85
Flavor _ 0.75 4
TAKE-OUT \
SUBTOTAL $ 3,60 |
X1 $ 0.24 '
TAX INCLUDED $ 0.24
TOTAL s 3 \

TWOUNT: 8 3.84
VIGACHARGE 4
LCOOONTE  D0XKOKKRK30TT

AUTHE :00255C

SIGN: ———=
ERIN AQUILINO
1 hereby aporove all charges, and by
signing this ocument. have agreed 1o the
charges. and full payment t of these
for which 1 am billed.

charges
CUSTOMER cOorPY

0370 A% 1 STATION 1 AUG. 24,2012
#0439 HIRIAM WI.SO 09:51

THANK YOU ¢
COME AGAIN.
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Specialized Administrofive Staffing

-

umuw
mq)

Personal & Confidential
Laura Blomquist

UTIUTIES NMCORPORATED
2335 SANDERS RD

Page: ; 1

Invoice Date: 05/09/2011
Invoica Number: 33136132
Customer Number. 01300-000951000
Fed Tax 1O - 94-1648752

Labor Invoice - DUE UPON RECEPT
i
1

Please Remit To: |

OfficeTeam

12400 cou.scnohs CENTER ORIVE

CHICAGO IL 60693

NORTHBROOK IL 60062-6108

EBatch // )77 :f/
oue_B2 7432

Bift Rele

Line _ Employee Name Wk End Dt __"Repon-To" Supervisor Qty UOM  Asmount _
1 Feathengifi Adem O5/06/2011  Yap,Lowsl M 4006 HR3 REG B -1658 §$ 66320
Sublofal for Week-Ended:  05/06/2011 $66 g9 4000 HRS ; $ 66320
2011006 2A0% ~ - - . .
S 2908  ~ 8682 . 2010319, 90k [~ $ 6-32
96 10867 - 290 — $6b6 82 201032\ » 236%] = $bbr 3
0o l0099 - 290% — $66-82  2olode- M - 6r 5%
dpoloZib - S90% ~ 35632 '
9 olo21% - 290%  — $11b-0b -
nvoice ; S PR $ S
e loa 7. 290% —~ & 66082 R e
[ ToTAL AMOUNT DUE:

MAY 18 200

BY: +
e de Iora Uimely and sccurata Information t the business commu: sharing our acooumis recelvable inrkemalion with Credit
Any questions regarding this invoice please calk For quatified adminiatraiive pmhsabnals pleass coll:
{BOO) 726-3720 \ (600) B04-8367
i)
Please datach and retum this remittance stub with your payment.
Thank you for choosing OfficeTeam!
MAY 16 201

OfficeTeam Cuslomer Invpice Totat

12400 COLLECTIONS CENTER DRIVE Number Number Amount

CHICAGO 1L 60693 01300-000961000 33186132 $ 663.20

01306000096100033148L1,32000b63203

||




W

RN T
ST on
OFFICETEAM" rese ;
invoica Date: 05/23/2014
Speciclized Administrative Staffing tnvoice Number: 33267397
: Customer Number: 01300-000961000
Fed Tax ID: 94-1848752

Labor Invoica ~ DUE UPON RECEIPT

Personal & Confidential Please Remit To:

Nate Mayers OfficeTesm

UTIITIES INCORPORATED 12400 COLLECTIONS CENTER DRIVE

2335 SANDERS RD CHICAGO IL 60593

NORTHBROOK It 80062-6108 Batch__ /0 (LA 2

poc___ 3504906

Une Employes Name Wx End Dt "Report-To" Supervisor Qy UoMm B Rate Amount
1 Feathergif Adam BS/20/2011  Yap,Lowell M 4000 HRS REG & 1650 8u3.20

Subtotal for Week-Ended: 067202011 4000 HRS LM
ECEIVEpN
8 OMAY25 o0m ) —
lnvoloe Subtotal: } B B C »'S .633-20
EALAWUNTDUE: "v".'r“"""‘““*.-*— ; ' S _eeam ]
| Vod
MAY 2 5 2011 5 jay Jaon

Wa provids more Brisdy and 3ccurate Information to e businesa commund Sharing o aceounts mcohvable Informution with Matona Cradu *cien
Any questions ogarding this invoice please cay: For qustified adminlstrative profegsionals pleass coll:
(8003 778-3770 {800) 804-8367

_—...__—&__q___ B O - — ﬁﬁ_-_'__ - _-‘_‘_.—________
Fiease detach and retum s remittance stub with your payment.

Thank you for choosing OfficeTeam|

OfficeTeam Customer Irwolce ' Total
12400 COLLECTIONS CENTER DRIVE Number Number Amount
CHICAGO IL 60693 01300-000961000 23267397 5 66320 |

DIHODDDDQBLDDDEBEE?3'370001:533[]9

/|




Batch -
Adam Feathergill
{10 hours distributed to all filings) Doc
RCID #of hours | misc filing % of total
2010321 3 0.8 4%
2010320 5 4%
2010319 4 3%
2010317 3 2%
2010318 6 5%
2010316 8 6%
2010283 2 2%
2011010 4 3%
2011005 3 2%
2010309 6 5%
2009516 70 58%
2010229 3 2%
2010228 2 1%
120 200%
RCID $
2010321.2908 |$ 26.35
20103202908 |$ 29,12 | .
2010319.2908 |$  20.83 B
2010317.2908 |$  1530] - U e
20103182908 [$  34.65 - B T
2010316.2908 | § 42,94
2010283.2908 |$  12.54
20110102908 |35  20.83
2011005.2908 | $ 1530
2010309.2908 {S$  34.65
20095162908 | S 385.59
2010229.2908 | $ 1530+ B
200951, 2010228:2968-~ | $ —9-74
Q902 $ 66320
/D
5lay jaon
~ECEIVE

RS

A MAY 25 201
4

v ..—.-.--.—-—_——-—.—--—-




VAV 3001 | /Tvﬁfl‘ I
TIMESHEET FOR: Adem Feathergil 1 AONTH: MA )'JOH_T
GlACCT. NO. 1) 3| 3] 4] 3| 6 71 8] 9 10| Vi 13| T3] 4] 1] 16| 13} 18 19| 20] 21 23] 24| W 26) 27| 28] 29| 30] 3 TOT;
DESCRIPTION SUE| CODE SIM] 1] W Fl S S| M| %] © Rl F| S| S| M| 1l W] R ¥ WM T W R|FL 8] S| _MI T /
Cedar Blull 2610021 3 [ [ 1 o
Valentne 2010330 i [ 1 {22 s 1A
[Del Mar 301031 8 o T i 3/
Walk Up The Woods 2010317 5 5 T2 3 i
Medme 2010313 [ 20 1 23 [ bS \/
West Lake 2010318 0 1 1 4 (3] 7 \/
Clarendon 2010307 0| R [
Ferson Creek 2010305 [ [i [} 0
Camelot 2010286 [ o A )
Kilkmey 2016306 ) 0 T )
Nowth Carolau 2010296 [ [} /
Misc. Filig [i [ 3 [} D
Lake Hohduy 2010229 0 0 y A 70
Great Norbera 2010230 [} 0 " v 0
Harbor Redge 2010308 0 [ 0 i 0 J
Invoice Request Foc Dan 2010283 Q [ 1.5| i 1.5
Tnvoice veques! (or Spencer 2011010 0 [} [ : i/
OC&B For Spencer 201 1010 [} 7 i (o G
CC&B l'ar Eriu [} [9 J (2] 9
Invoice Request For Dac 2031010 0 ! 2
Tovolce Request for Spencer 2011605 [} 1 ] 2 \,/
Cheny Hill 2010309 0 il 1 TS) 1 1 5.3 \/
South Cargling USSC 2009516 2 7§ [ i S I T T s
Whispering Palls 2010528 0| 0 T le i/
G 0
[ [} A [
[ [/ Y 0
[} [} [
o] ¢ [ 0]
o 0 i 0|
o0 0 [}
o[ o 0 [}
0] 0 0 3
o 0 [} 0
o 0 0 )
of 0 0 [
ol © [ [}
[ [ 0
o0 [} [
[ [ 0
o0 [} [}
[ 0 0 { 0}
[) [2) | a
[ I [ HE %l
[ 0 i [
[ [ e 0
[ [ 3
[ 0 0
o 0 1] 0
a0 0 [}
[ G 0
6 0 [} 0
0! 0 0, [}
6 © [} [}
o © 0 0
o0 0 @
90 []
D) [
ol o i
[ ) [ 0
4] [} [ Q.
1 o[ 8 8 € & 3 o of § 8 s 3 o 3| 8 3| 8 8 4 o o o o o o o o o 120
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S OFFICETEAN

Speciclized Adminisirative Siaffing

Personal & Confidential

Nate Meyers

UTILITIES INCORPORATED
2335 SANDERS RD
NORTHBROOK 1L 60082-6108

Page: 1

Invaice Date: 06/06/2011
Isweice Number: 33350236
Customer Number: 01300-000961000
Fed Tax 1D: 94-1648752

Labor invoice — DUE UPON RECEIPT
Ple2so Remit To!

OlficeTeam
12400 COLLECTIONS CENTER DRIVE

Ny

Doac 35/5 5 ?5

Line 26 Name WkEnd Dt "Report-To” Superviser Qly UOM Bill Rate Amount
1 Festherpl.Adam 0602011 Yap Lowsll M 3200 HRS REG §$ 1658 § 530,58
Sublotal for Week-Ended:  06/03/201% 3200 MRS $ 530.58
ECE I\IF“.
s . Invpice Subtntat: JU_N 0 8 »2913 N3 o8 83056
[_roraL amoun puE: g -8 53088 |
WY gigaol
JUN 0 9 201
L_ - w. oTe. and securste infermation to the dusiness comm! OUr BECoLns Tecelvabls faformeion with Nalions) Credk
Any questions. msafdmg this invoioe piesse call ‘For qualifind administrative professionals please cal:
(800) 776-3770 (800) 804-8387
Pioase dmcr.;a-nd rafumn this remiflance atub 'with your payment.
Thank you for choosing OfficeTeam!
OfficeTeam Customer Invoice Total
12400 COLLECTIONS CENTER DRIVE Number Number Amount
CRHICAGO IL 60693 061300-000961000 33350238 $ 53056

D13000009610003335023L000530567




Adam Feathergill  6.3.2011

RCID ttof hours | misc filing % of total
2010321 4 11.0 2%
2010320 5 3%
2010319 4 2%
2010317 4 2%
2010318 6 4% ,
2010316 3 5% ;
2010283 2 1%
2011010 4 2%
2011005 3 2%
2010309 6 4%
2009516 106 63%
2010229 3 2%
2010223 3 2%
2010308 3 2%
2010298 8 5%
168 106%
RCID S
20103212908 |S$ 1179 »
2010320.2908 {S- 1653 ~— - : 1 - -
2010319.2908 |$ 1178 A L
2010317.2908 |$ 1179
20103182908 |$  19.69
2010316.2908 S 24.42
2010283.2908 L3 7.05
2011010.2908 5 11.79
2011005.2908 | $ 8.63
2010305.2908 S 19,69
20059516.2908 $ 335.49
2030229.2908 S 8.63
2010223.2908 S 10.21
2010308.2908 {3 8.63
2010298.2908 S 24.42
$ 530.56
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Invoice Date: 07/25/2011
Specialized Administrative Stoffing Invelce Number: 32638517
' Customer Number: 01300-000961000
Fed Tax i0: 941848752

Labor tnvoice ~ DUE UPON RECEIPT

Personal & Confidential Pleass Remit To:
Nale Meyers OfficeTeam
UTILITIES INCORPORATED 42400 COLLECTIONS CENTER DRIVE
2335 SANDERS RD CHICAGO L 60693 -
NORTHBROOK IL 60062-6108 Batch / / / l ) /
364973
Line _Employea Name Wk End Dt "Report-To® Supervisor oy uoM Bil Rata Armownt
1 AcostaZelman 0712212011  Povich,Erin 40.08 HRS REG $ 1700 $ ' 680.00
Subtotal for Week-Ended:  07/22/2011 ) 40,00 HRS f 3 €80.00
704 0o, 220800901 T 51,00 208007, 2408-00:0' | :3; fg
. . 0090l .
2500l 0. 2908.0090¢ 51 60 Zotpro- 2108.00%1 I

20116106- 2908, 00701 102, 00

f
W10 "ilo.50
1@!!005 296%. 60901 59.50 50210_7—»

Inveice. Subbotal —
[ YOTAL AMOUNT DUE: -
15 o aj 56 03201
We more and socurats information to the business som MMWWWWCM sncles.
Any questions regerd ing this involce please calt For qualifiad adminisiralive professionals pleass call:
(800) 7763770 (800) 804-8387
Please delach and retum this remitiance stub wih your payment.
Thank you for choosing OfficeTeam!
OfficeTeam Customer Invoice Total
12400 COLLECTIONS CENTER DRIVE Numbes Number Amount,
CHICAGO IL 60683 01300.000961000 33638517 $ 788000

{23000009610800336385172000680005




l'foﬁal% TEAM' 1
== tnvoice Dale: 08/08/2011

Speciolized Adminisirotive Stbffing Invoice Number: 33722780
Customer Number. 01300-000951000
Fed Tax ID: 54-1648752

Labor Invoice - DUE UPON RECEIPT

Personal & Confidential Piease Remit To:
Nate Meysrs OfficeTeam
UTITIES INCORPORATED 12400 COLLECTIONS CENTER DRIVE
2335 SAMDERS RD CHICAGO IL 60693
NORTHBROOK | 2
L 600626108 Batch “ { 8q (0
Doe (ﬁ é q 1 0 /7
tine Employse Name Wk End Dt "Report-To® Supervisor Gty UOM Bit Rate Amount
1 Acosta,Zeiman 080522011  PovichEin 2400 HRS REG § 1700 % 400.00
Subtotal for Week-Ended:  08/05/20114 ' 2400 HRS $ . 408.00
Q200. G070 —~ /2270
2ollo09, 2908 —  39.L°
Zolloof 20— /2o |
2010082908 — /3. 20 ECEIVE
~=- " nvolos Subtotal: . . ; Am12 201 - S 5 408,00 oo
1 ' >
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: r o .3 408.00-
20[1095'7!70{ -  2o.40 ‘ - WE‘Z §
20i02¥3.290¢€ — /2.2 . -
mMmodm&wammmm»mmmmgbvmvwmmmw.rmm with Mationa Credit Repusting Agencles.
Any questions regarding this invoice please call: For g professionals please caft;
{800) 776-3770 : (600) 804-8367
T Plaase detach and mluc‘n this remittance stub with your payment.
Thank you for chdosing OfficeTeam!
|
OfficeTeam i Customer thvoica Totat
12400 COLLECTIONS CENTER DRIVE  ° Number Number Amount
CHICAGO IL 60693 ; 01300-000961000 33722780 $ 408.00

013000009:100033722780000408002




AUGUST 2011 - T

TIMESTIEET FOR: FELA1nd MONTH: _|AUGUST 2811
AlcsT A O[ACCE VO, £ O I 5 B g TOT
DESCRIPTION SUB] CODE W[ R| F| S T M ALS
Se oAl N c& 0 K4 g
R ILANS O e = 1
| [0, gt 428 702 y A q
[ SqnoA LiRgEs] ] 0
Zoedid A (LS RT) 00 02 OR3 g
[ 3
0] [{] 0| Q
a0 3_! {
O 0 [1] Q
[}] 1] ]
) 0 0
[} 0
0 []
0 ]
- of 5
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ol © [ o
[ 0 [
B I '~ [
[
— PYE £ :
I Pr100 -2 122,40 Y 0
———— 200009 =2 40,0 0
T i
 — 20i09% G bt2oy 5
0
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Billing Address: Shipping Address:
UTILITIES INC UTILITIES, INC.-REGULATORY

Invoice Number ™\ [ invoice Date \| AccountNumber Page
7-520-58025 || Jun 08, 2011 4072-8604-9 tol4

FedEx Tax 1D: 71-0427007 :

Batchlﬂ 7Y0 ?

ATTN: ACCTS PAYABLE 2335 SANDERS RO ey S5 D 7

2335 SANDERS RD NORTHBROOKX IL 50062-5136 Contact FedEx Rev ; -

NORTHBROOK IL 60062-6196 Phons:  {800)622-1147 M-Sa7-6 {CST)
_ Fax: (800) 548-3020

Invoice sumaw Jun 08, 2011 Internet  www.fedex.com

FodEx Expross Services FodEx News!

Transportation Charges - - 14615  Goto fedex.com/ecommarce for the latest business

Eamned/Graca Discount -39.02  insights and expert advice to help you navigate the

Special Handling Charges 1987  e-commerce landscape and grow your business,

Total Charges Usp $12760  Designed specifically for online retsilers, you'll want to

TOTAL THIS INVOICE usD $127.60 bookmark fedex.comfecommerce and come back often

You saved $39.02 in discounts this period}

Shipments included in this invoice received an aarned discount. [f you
would like to know how it was calculated, please go to the following URL:
https/www.fedex.com/EarnedDiscounts/.

Qther discounts may apply.

for the latest white papers, reports and case studies
from leading industry experts like this month's report:
Forrester Basaarch's “Five Retail Trends to Watch in
2011". Your onlins business and FedEx. Together, we
simply click.

ECEIVE
JUN 13201 JUr 12 oo
BY: e u____
e Yot poyrem IofefEx Invoice Number | AccountNumher [ _AmountDue
T3 For change of akiress, check hero and corplete formon revease sido. 7-520-58025 | 4072-8604-9 I USD $127.60

Remittance Advice
Your payment is due by Jun 23, 2011

40728b04752058025400000227L057

shlbnsigtutingll |u!n||||||u|nlh!llllshuu"“'ull

UTILTIES INC FedEx
AT ACCTS PAYABLE PO.B y
2335 SANDERS RD .0. Box 84515

NORTHBROOK it 60062-6190

OO

60005580075138

PALATINE IL. 60094-4515

1158-02-00-00048740004-003993 34




Invoice Number \

Invoice Date \ [ Accomnt Number \ Page

FedEx ExpressShipgueﬁt Detail By Payor Type

7-520-58025 |

Jun 08, 2011 4072-8504-9 | 3014

2 LIRS £
« fuel Surcherge - FodEx has spplled s fuel surchacge of 15.50% La this shipmenat

{Originai)
n? -

~ The Earnad Discount far thiz ship dste has haan calculatad based on o revenua threshold of $4313.01

= Oistance Bosed Pricing, Zons 5

Automation USAB

Tracking {0 875371208935

Servics Type FodEx Priority Ovemight
Package Type FedEx Envelope

Zone [1:

Packages 1

Ratsd Weight N/A

Delivered Jun 01,2011 1018
Syc Arpa Al

Signed by G.CURRIN

FodEx U:

Bicks .

015114928/0000219/_
543 o 4

3

5
SN SR

Sendog

BRIAN SHRAKE

UTILITIES, INC.-REGULATORY
2335 SANDERSRD -
NORTHBRODK it. 60062-6136 US

Becipiant

CHRIS AYERS

POYNER SAERILLLLP

301 FAYETTEVILLE ST 190
RALEIGH NC 2760) US

Transponation Charge 26.35
Fuel Surcharge 241
Eamed Discount -10.80

% =5 /im% 20 \r-i/::-. ERNS 3 o~ E2
» Fuel Surchargs - FedEx has appliad # fusl surcharge of 15.50% to this shipment.

» Distsnca Dasad Priclg, Zong 6

+ Package Defiverad to Reciplant Address - Relaass Authorized

Automation USAB
Fracking 10 §75330048893
Service Type FedEx First Ovamight
Package Typs FedEx Envalopa
Zone 08
Packages 1
Rated Weight N/A
Delivered- - -Jun 01, 20110812

" SvcArea M

,-Signed by 360 above

" -FedExUse 815114928/0000007/02

» Fuel Surchsry

» Distance Basad Prlcing, Zons 3
Automation UsaB

Tracking ID 875374208902
Sarvice Type FedEx Priority Qvarnight
Package Type FadEx Envelops
Zone a3

Packages 1

Rated Welgit N/A

Delivered Jun 03, 201¢ 30:30
Sve Arga A2

Signed by J.HUGHES

FadEx Use 015315433/0000197/ _

. TotalCharge ~

Sander

DAN CECLERSK)

UTILMIES, INC.-REGULATORY
2335 SANDERS RD :
NORTHBROOK iL 50062-6198 US

Bagiplam

FRANK SEDMAN

MCNT! & REGULAROY CONSULTANTS
18344 COST LAKE WAY

JUPITERFL 33458 US

" Transportaton Chatge - ; C R
Residental Dalivery - . 275
Fuel Surcharga s 842

‘R

ge of 15.50% to this shipmant.

Sandar

BRIAN SHRAKE

UTILITIES, INC-REGULATORY
7335 SANDERS AD
NORTHBROCK 1L 60062-6138 US

Hechient
JOHN N HUGHES
ATTORNEY AT LAW
124WT0DD ST

" FRANKFORT KY 4060% US

Transportation Charge 0.5
Eamed Discount -8.7%
Fuel Surcharge 1.34
Tatsl Charge usp $1448

11 58-02-D0-DO0S 87 4-0003-00399 33




Mx@ Invoice Number '\ [ Invoice Date \ | Account Number \ Page
7-520-58025 || Jun 08 201 4072-8504-9 | 4o

%6 R
HEh
2y 8 4

R 3&' PR AR M

= The £asned Discount for this ship dsle has baen caleutated basad on & rovenue thrashold of $4317.01
» Fuel Surcharga - FedEx has applied a fuel surchargs of 15.50% to this shipment.

¢ Distanca Based Pricing, Zona 3

AN

Autoipation USAB Sesder Bacipiest om—
Tracking 10 875371208913 BRIAN SHRAKE JOHN N HUGHES ===
Sasvice Type FedEx Priority Ovamight UTILTIES, INC.-REGULATORY . ATTORNEY AT LAW- ==
Package Typa FadEx Envalopa 2335 SANDERS D 124 WTODD ST —
Zone 03 NORTHBROOK IL 60062-6198 US FRANKFORT KY 40803 US —_—
Packages 1 =
Rated Woeight N/A . . P
Dalvered Jun 03, 2011 10:30 Transportation Charge 2125 S
Sve Area A2 Earned Discount |4 ==
Signsed by J.HRUGHES Fuel Surcharge 19 ==
FedEx Use 015315433/0008197/., Total Charge usd $1448 e
Shipper Subtotal usp $109.64 ===

m—

——

scount for tﬁis ship dvatnvhn bd :;lﬁ!aud batnﬁ on o-mén\;a threshotd of $4353. 4

. ame

= Distanice Based Pricing, Zone 5

Autsmation UsAB Sendec Bagiplont

Tracking 10 874810007961 SPENCER NEDUED TIMDEVLIN

Servica Type FadEx Priority Overaight - UTILITIESINC FLORIDA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISS

Package Type FadEx Envelope 2335 SANDERS RD : 2450 SHUMARD QAK BLVD

Zone 05 NORTRBROOK 1L 800526198 US . TALLAHASSEE FL. 32339 US

Packages 1 < .

Rated Waight NA ’ . . .

Dofvared May 31,20130045 . Transportation Charge L. _ O .= - N

Svc'Area A2 Fuel Surcharge (R o S 241

Signed by - C.POTTS _ Earned Discount -1080

FodEx Usa C14715282/0000219/ Total Charge I . U S $17.98
Third Party Subtotal _~__ USD $17.5
Total FedEx Express usb . 1260

1158-02-00-0004874-0003-0039923




FedEx Office 1s your destination
for printing and shipping.

- 350 S STATE ROAD 434
Altamonte Springs, FL 32714
Tel: (407) 682-4440

8/22/2011 2:25;18 PM EST
Team Member: Elizabeth P.

Account #: XXXXXX8424-0032

Accouynt: UTILITIES INC OF FLORIDA

INDICE
0fficial bil) of Sale
Terms Net 30 Days -
~ :ase Reference Involce # 239500010479

olnt #: - XXXXXXB424~0032
:ithorfzed User: SUSAN D1PASQUALE
—o——=ount-UTILITIES INC OF FLORIDA
erence: 2011005 - S gsnidelbraven
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£5 05 24x36 19 450007
002172 Rep. Price 4.50
ES (S 24x38 18  4.5000T
002172 Reg. Price 4.50
Regular Total 8.00
Discounts .00
Total 9.00
Sub-Total , 9.00
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1 am an authorized agent of the compa,
and my signature authorizes the
~pmpany to pay for all items reflect
on this invoice.

/'W

Please remit payment to:

FedEx Office
Customer Administrative Services
P.D. Box 672085
pallas, TX ?5267 ~2085

Ouestions? P]ease ca]l
1-800-488-3705 :

Save Up to 40X on Select Products now
through Octobsr 14th,
Go to fedex.com/printdeals or
ask a team member for details.

Thank you for visiting

FedEx Office
sake It, Print It. Pack It. Ship It.
fedex.com/office

By submitting your project to FedEx
pffice or by making a purchase in the
FedEx Office store, you agree to all
the FedEx Office terms and conditions
Jocated at fedex.com/office or
you may request a copy of our terms
and conditions, which will be made
available to you upon request.

Customer Copy




Fed=x<Office. %

FedEx Office is your destination
for printing and shigping.

150 S STATE RDAD 434
Altamonte Springs, FL 32714
Tel: (407) 682-4440
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I am an authorized agent of the company
and my signature authorizes the
company to pay for 411 items reflected
on this fnvoice.
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“ustomer Administrative Services
P.0, Box 672085
0allas, TX . 75267-2085
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Thank you for visiting
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fedex.com/office

By submitting your project to Fedx
Iffice or by making a purchase in the
FedEx Office store, you agree to all
the Fedtx Office terms and conditions
Iocated at fedex com/off1ce or




STATE OF FLORIDA

COUNTY OF SEMINOLE

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Rick J. Durham, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that he is the Regional Vice President for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, he did accumulate $470.36 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Regional Vice
President (1)

-Oversees all operations of the regional offices.

-Serves as the regional ambassador and local company contact for customers, community
organizations, state commissions, and representatives.

-Performs other related duties as assigned.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

7

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27% day of September, 2012, by Rick J.

Durham, who is personally known to me.

&UL M o

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF FLORIDA
Printed Name: _Ann Raponi
My Commission Expires: —1/12] 20)>

ANN M. RAPON]
NOTARY PUBLIC . STATE
COMMISSION # DoFsszog"s?
EXPIRES 7/12/2013
BONDEOTHRUY 1-888 NOT ARYY




STATE OF FLORIDA

COUNTY OF SEMINOLE

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Patrick C. Flynn, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that he is the Regional Director for Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven,
and that as of September 15, 2012, he did accumulate $9,702.75 of rate case expense
associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate case;
Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Regional -Manages the preparation of all rate cases, pass-through and indexing activity, changes to service
Director (1) territory, and any other PSC related activities in coordination with the company’s regulatory
department.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

=

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 25% day of September, 2012, by Patrick C.

Flynn, who is personally known to me. &L/\
/{@ .

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF FLORIDA
Printed Name: _ANN RAPONI
My Commission Expires:"" 217003

ANN M. RAPON:
NCTARY PUBLIC . STATE OF &
COMMISSION # Dggzggé?

EXPIRES 71212013

DED FHRY 1-888-NOT ARy




STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF SEMINOLE

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Michael A. Wilson, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that he is the Regional Manager for Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven,
and that as of September 15, 2012, he did accumulate $304.40 of rate case expense
associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate case;

Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Regional -Oversees plant operations and maintenance, customer contact and capital planning.
Manager (1) -Assists Regional Director in the development and implementation of operational and regional
strategies.

-Serves as contact for inquiries regarding operational issues; answers routine and ad hoc
information requests that are regional or unit-specific in nature.

-Acts as point of contact with developers, engineers, consultants, regulators, and customers.
-Performs other related duties as assigned.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

Mo

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27t day of September, 2012, by Michael A.

Wilson, who is personally known to me.

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE LORIDA
Printed Name: A(\ﬂ M . <aponi

My Commission Expires: _ lng:j 2013

ANN M. RAPONI
NOYARY PUBLIC - STATE OF FLORIDA

COMMIS SION # DD88205¢9
EXPIRES 7/12/2013
BONDED THRU 1-888-NOTARY




STATE OF FLORIDA

COUNTY OF SEMINOLE

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Jacqueline M. Sillitoe who, after being duly sworn
on oath, did depose and say that she is the Customer Care Specialist for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, she did accumulate $79.64 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Customer Care Specialist

-Maintains accounts receivable records

-Processes customer payments in accordance with company business rules and processes
-Batching, balancing, and scanning customer payments to meet posting deadlines.
-Maintains payment logs and prepares daily deposits.

-Enters and validates rate changes into CC&B.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

e
%

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 25t day of September, 2012, by Jacqueline
M. Sillitoe, who is personally known to me.

C(
! &\Z@@W
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF FLORIDA

Printed Name: _Ann Raponi
My Commission Expires: _"_] l l'Z‘ 2003

ANN M, RAPONI
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF FLORIDA
COMMISSION # DD882059
EXPIRES 7/12/2013
BONBRD THRU 1-688-NOTARY 1




STATE OF FLORIDA

COUNTY OF SEMINOLE

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Anp, M. Ra Sni, who, a‘t} being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that she is the Ga@gé@anagei or Ut ities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, she did accumulate $19.03 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Assistant Manager | -Responsible for overseeing the Billing Specialist and Collections Specialist. Works with

to Billing (1) Regulatory Department and Billing Manager as needed to assure continuity of processes,
goals and vision of UL

-Performs other related duties as assigned.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGH

o I Fag

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 25% day of September, 2012, by Ann M.
Raponi, who is personally known to me.

. LAUREN FERNANDEZ v Ji
& ‘x Notary Public, State of Florida
3& Commission e 138344 NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF FL.ORIDA
My comm. expires Jan. 14, 2013 Printed Name: N QXY\.&U« ez

My Commission Expires: . Mn N0y




STATE OF FLORIDA

COUNTY OF SEMINOLE

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Susan M. DiPasquale, who, after being duly sworn
on oath, did depose and say that she is the Administrative Assistant for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, she did accurulate $2,199.17 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Administrative
Assistant (2)

-Under direct supervision of the Regional Director.

-Performs complex and confidential administrative functions, including written
correspondence, reports, spreadsheets and other documents.

-Prepares or assists with the preparation of scheduled and/or ad hoc statistical and narrative
reports; performs basic information gathering and analysis and/or forecasting, as specifically
directed.

-May assist other operational staff depending on work load.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27™ day of September, 2012, by Susan M.
DiPasquale, who is personally known to me.

&LL!YL?QQJM

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF FLORIDA
Printed Name: _ANN RAPONI
My Commission Expires: 1] QIZO'__E

ANN M. RAPON|
NOTARY PUBLIC - 5T,
COMMISSION 3’5832”23‘5“;

EXPIRES 711212013
THRU 1-886-NOT ARY 1




FA0RI DA
STATE OF HEINOIS

SLEMIVOLE
COUNTY OF €66K

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Peggy ]. Hanks, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that she is the Administrative Assistant for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, she did accumulate $659.25 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Administrative
Assistant (2)

-Under direct supervision of the Regional Director.

-Performs complex and confidential administrative functions, including written
correspondence, reports, spreadsheets and other documents.

-Prepares or assists with the preparation of scheduled and/or ad hoc statistical and narrative
reports; performs basic information gathering and analysis and/or forecasting, as specifically
directed.

-May assist other operational staff depending on work load.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

Cargp of blondi>

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27% day of September, 2012, by Peggy ].

Hanks, who is personally known to me.

&L/L M?apm

Flor/PF
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF HEHNOIS

Printed Name: ie AN A p T
My Commission Expires: 71{ (2] 2015

ANN M. RAPON!
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE |
COMMISSION # DD88055

EXPIRES 711212013
BONDED THRU 1-888-NOTARY?Y



STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Steven M. Lubertozzi, who, after being duly sworn
on oath, did depose and say that he is the Executive Director of Regulatory Accounting &

_ Affairs for Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven, and that as of September15, 2012, he did
accumulate $450.00 of rate case expense associated with the following tasks related to the
Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Executive Director of :
Regulatory Accounting (1) -Oversees all matters related to the economic regulation of all Ul subsidiaries.

-Plans, prepares, files and resolves rate applications, transfer proceedings, territory
extensions, tariff and rule changes, Commission audits and other regulatory
activities.

-Testifies on complex regulatory, accounting, finance, and operational issues.

-Explains complex regulatory issues to the Executive Team.

-Forecasts revenues and expenses from regulatory proceedings.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

éﬁlﬁﬁ;

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27t day of September, 2012, by Steven M.

Lubertozzi, who is personally known to me.
w |

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
Printed Name: _Lawanda Valrie, ,
My Commission Expires: 0%4221 20/ 6

OFFICIA_ S
LAWANC = “~LOLE VALRIE

NOTARY ©_BLIC - STATE OF RLINOIS
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES:04112/16

A AL AAAAAAAD




STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Kirsten E. Markwell, who, after being duly sworn
on oath, did depose and say that she is the Regulatory Accounting Manager for Utilities, Inc.
of Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, she did accumulate $8,596.00 of rate
case expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven
rate case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Regulatory Accounting -Manages regulatory team responsibilities such as, rate cases, limited proceedings,
Manager (1) indicies/pass-throughs, etc.

-Files large-dollar rate cases or upon request, supplies required regulatory
information to consultants.

-Supplies audit trail and documentation to easily support work product.

-Performs all follow-up compliance issues in accordance with Commission order.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27t day of September, 2012, by Kirsten E.

Markwell, who is personally known to me. 7
M M / JZ@
L /

//NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
Printed Name: _Lawanda Valriez
My Commission Expires: M&/é




STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Erin P. Aquilino, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that she is the Senior Regulatory Accountant for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, she did accumulate $9,800.50 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Senior Regulatory -Directly assists manager with regulatory responsibilities such as rate cases, limited
Accountant (1) proceedings, indicies/pass-throughs, etc.

-Prepares commission-ordered adjustments.

-Files large-dollar rate cases or upon request, supplies required regulatory information
to consultants.

-Performs all follow-up compliance issues in accordance with Commission order.
-Provides audit trail and documentation to easily support work product.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

R/ Kb

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27t day of September, 2012, by Erin P.
Aquilino, who is personally known to me.

e

“ NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
Printed Name: _Lawanda Valrig
My Commission Expires: %@/Q

MARANS RPVRARAARI AP PN
4

OFFICIAL SEAL 4
§ LAWANDA NACOLE VALRIE

¢  NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS ¢
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES:04/12/16

AL I ARIARALIAAAAAAAAAAAAA,

.




STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Adam K. Feathergill, who, after being duly sworn
on oath, did depose and say that he is the Regulatory Assistant for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, he did accumulate $388.50 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Regulatory Assistant | -Performs general administrative duties

¢)) -Maintains various regulatory spreadsheets and reports.

-Assists in organizing documentation requirements.

-Compiles and creates library of resource materials for regulatory staff.

-Assists regulatory staff with the timely completion of assignments and projects in .
accordance with established deadlines.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27t day of September, 2012, by Adam K.
Feathergill, who is personally known to me.

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
Printed Name: Lawanda Valrig /
My Commission Expires: £v/ é [29/ &

OFFICIAL SEAL
LAWANDA NACOLE VALRIE
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES:04/12/16

------




STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Daniel Ciecierski, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that he was the Regulatory Staff Accountant I for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of August 15, 2012, he did accumulate $2,743.50 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Regulatory Staff -Assists and supports Regulatory Accountant II, Senior Regulatory Accountant and
Accountant I (3) Manager on rate case filings and other proceedings.
-Provides audit trail and documentation to easily support work product.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETBNAUGHT.

Sworn t6 and subscribed before me this 27t day of August, 2012, by Daniel
Ciecierski, who is personally known to me.

[

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
Printed Name: _Lawanda Valrie
My Commission Expires: 2% //&// é

OFFICIAL SEAL
LAWANDA NACOLE VALRIE

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES:04/12/16




STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared LaWanda N. Valrie, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that she is the Regulatory Assistant for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, she did accumulate $979.00 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Regulatory Assistant
M

-Performs general administrative duties

-Maintains various regulatory spreadsheets and reports.

-Assists in organizing documentation requirements.

-Compiles and creates library of resource materials for regulatory staff.

-Assists regulatory staff with the timely completion of assignments and projects in
accordance with established deadlines.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27t day of September, 2012, by LaWanda N.
Valrie, who is personally known to me.

OFFIGIAL SEAL f
nancvpaule  ALAA ey (o Lo
NOTARY PUBLI, STATE OF RLINRS 1

MY COMMISSION EXPIRES 3-2-2015
NUOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS

Printed Name: _Nancy Paule
My Commission Expires:3 = 2 - A0/5"




STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Spencer L. Nedved, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that he was the Regulatory Staff Accountant Il for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of August 15, 2012, he did accumulate $1,886.00 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Regulatory Staff Accountant II -Prepares commission-ordered adjustments.
€3 -Files rate cases or, upon request, supplies regulatory information to
consultants.

-Follows all required steps to close rate cases.

-Provides financial support documentation.

-Assists with commission staff performed audits and discovery.
-Provides audit trail and documentation to easily support work product.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27t day of August, 2012, by Spencer L.
Nedved, who is personally known to me. .

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINO1S
Printed Name: Lawanda Valries
My Commission Expires: 0% /&.//¢

OFFICIAL SEAL
LAWANDA NACOLE VALRIE

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF LLINOIS
MY COMMISSION EXP!RES‘OIHZHO




STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared John D. Williams II1, who, after being duly sworn
on oath, did depose and say that he is the Director of Governmental Affairs for Utilities, Inc.
of Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, he did accumulate $1,466.00 of rate
case expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven
rate case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Director of Governmental -Provides leadership and guidance to newer regulatory staff not familiar with the
Affairs (1) rate case process.
-Performs other related duties as assigned.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27t day of September, 2012, by John D.
Williams 111, who is personally known to me.

S

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS

Printed Name:
My Commission Expires: _£¥ e/ &

OFFICIAL SEAL
LAWANDA NACOLE VALRIE

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINCIS
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES:04/12/16




STATE OF NEVADA

COUNTY OF NYE

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Karen L. Sasic, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that she is the Director of Customer Care for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September 15, 2012, she did accumulate $262.00 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Director of -Directs and oversees all aspects of customer service policies, objectives, and

Customer Care(1) initiatives.

-Develops and establishes procedures and policies goveming customer
cormrespondence and the bandling of customer complaints which directly

-Supervises Customer Care Manager and oversees customer care department

-Oversees the implementation of all billing and rate related issues

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

S

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27% day of September, 2012, by Karen L.
Sasic, who is personally known to me.

NOTARY PUBLIC b .
STATE OF NEVADA L [M f Wm/
é,

7 County Of Nye
- YJUDITH E. GILLMORE
L No: 09-11536-14

5oy st e seraor th 203 NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF NEVADA

— Printed Name: _Judith E. Gillmore
My Commission Expires: SEFT. /¢, 20V 3




STATE OF ILLINOIS
COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared Nicole D. Winans, who, after being duly sworn on
oath, did depose and say that she is the Regulatory Staff Accountant II for Utilities, Inc. of
Sandalhaven, and that as of September, 2012, she did accumulate $7,460.00 of rate case
expense associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate
case; Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Regulatory Staff Accountant 11 -Prepares commission-ordered adjustments.
1) -Files rate cases or, upon request, supplies regulatory information to
consultants.

-Follows all required steps to close rate cases.

-Provides financial support documentation.

-Assists with commission staff performed audits and discovery.
-Provides audit trail and documentation to easily support work product.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

i UL

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27% day of September, 2012, by Nicole D.

Winans, who is personally known to me.
;

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS

Printed Name: _Lawanda Valri¢ s -
My Commission Expires: £ % //2/2¢




STATE OF ILLINOIS

COUNTY OF COOK

Before me, the undersigned authority, authorized to administer oaths and take
acknowledgments, personally appeared John P. Hoy, who, after being duly sworn on oath,
did depose and say that he is the Chief Operating Officer for Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven,
and that as of September15, 2012, he did accumulate $406.00 of rate case expense
associated with the following tasks related to the Utilities, Inc. of Sandalhaven rate case;

Docket No. Docket No. 2011-011-S.

Chief Operating

Officer (1) —Advise on key planning issues and make recommendations on important business
decisions regarding rate case filings

— Strategic planning and resource allocation concerning capital projects which impact
rate case filings

—Establish a rate case filing schedule based on the capital expenditures

— Ensure quality control of all company outputs

— Ensure activities comply with organizational requirements for quality management,

legal stipulations, and general duty of care.

- FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

N [
Sworn to and subscribed before me this 27 day of September, 2012, by John P. Hoy,
who is personally known to me.

NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
Printed Name: _Lawanda Valri¢ /
My Commission Expires: Q‘/[/&@/(a

OFFICIAL SEAL
LAWANDA NACOLE VALRIE
NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF ILLINOIS
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES:04/12/16






